AGENDA Steven R. Jones

Mayor

Garden Grove City Stephanie Klopfenstein

Council Mayor Pro Tem - District 5

George S. Brietigam

Tuesday, October 22, Council Member - District 1

2019 John R. O'Neill

. Council Member - District 2
6:30 PM Thu-Ha Nguyen

GARDEN GROVE Council Member - District 3
Community Meeting Patrick Phat Bui

Center 11300 Stanford Council Member - District 4

Avenue Garden Grove Kim B. Nguyen

California 92840 Council Member - District 6

Meeting Assistance: Any person requiring auxiliary aids and services, due to a disability, to address
the City Council, should contact the City Clerk's Office 72 hours prior to the meeting to arrange for
accommodations. Phone: (714) 741-5040.

Agenda Item Descriptions: Are intended to give a brief, general description of the item. The City
Council may take legislative action deemed appropriate with respect to the item and is not limited to
the recommended action indicated in staff reports or the agenda.

Documents/Writings: Any revised or additional documents/writings related to an item on the agenda
distributed to all or a majority of the Council Members within 72 hours of a meeting, are made
available for public inspection at the same time (1) in the City Clerk's Office at 11222 Acacia
Parkway, Garden Grove, CA 92840, during normal business hours; (2) on the City's website as an
attachment to the City Council meeting agenda; and (3) at the Council Chamber at the time of the
meeting.

Public Comments: Members of the public desiring to address the City Council are requested to
complete a pink speaker card indicating their name and address, and identifying the subject matter
they wish to address. This card should be given to the City Clerk prior to the start of the meeting.
General comments are made during "Oral Communications" and should be limited to matters under
consideration and/or what the City Council has jurisdiction over. Persons wishing to address the City
Council regarding a Public Hearing matter will be called to the podium at the time the matter is being
considered.

Manner of Addressing the City Council: After being called by the Mayor, you may approach the
podium, it is requested that you state your name for the record, and proceed to address the City
Council. All remarks and questions should be addressed to the City Council as a whole and not to
individual Council Members or staff members. Any person making impertinent, slanderous, or profane
remarks or who becomes boisterous while addressing the City Council shall be called to order by the
Mayor.If such conduct continues, the Mayor may order the person barred from addressing the City
Council any further during that meeting.

Time Limitation: Speakers must limit remarks for a total of (5) five minutes. When any group of
persons wishes to address the City Council on the same subject matter, the Mayor may request a

Page 1 of 117



spokesperson be chosen to represent the group, so as to avoid unnecessary repetition.At the City
Council's discretion, a limit on the total amount of time for public comments during Oral
Communications and/or a further limit on the time allotted to each speaker during Oral
Communications may be set.

PLEASE SILENCE YOUR CELL PHONES DURING THE MEETING.

AGENDA

ROLL CALL: COUNCIL MEMBER BRIETIGAM, COUNCIL MEMBER
O'NEILL, COUNCIL MEMBER T. NGUYEN, COUNCIL MEMBER BUI,
COUNCIL MEMBER K. NGUYEN, MAYOR PRO TEM KLOPFENSTEIN,
MAYOR JONES

INVOCATION

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE FLAG OF THE UNITED STATES OF
AMERICA

1. ORAL COMMUNICATIONS (to be held simultaneously with other
legislative bodies)

RECESS

CONDUCT OTHER LEGISLATIVE BODIES' BUSINESS
RECONVENE

2. CONSENT ITEMS

(Consent Items will be acted on simultaneously with one motion unless separate discussion
and/or action is requested by a Council Member.)

2.a. Adoption of a Proclamation declaring October 2019 as Energy
Awareness Month and October 30, 2019, as Weatherization Day
in Garden Grove. (Action Item)

2.b. Authorize the issuance of a purchase order to John Deere and Co.
for the purchase of one (1) new riding mower for the Public
Works Department. ($28,780.79) (Action Item)

2.c. Authorize the issuance of a purchase order to Logicalis, Inc. to
provide two (2) F5 load balancers including technical support.
(Cost $67,946.93) (Action Item)

2.d. Receive and file minutes from the meeting held on October 8,
2019. (Action Item)

2.e. Receive and file warrants. (Action Item)

2.f.  Approval to waive full reading of ordinances listed. (Action Item)

3. COMMISSION/COMMITTEE MATTERS

3.a. Appointment to fill a vacancy on the Administrative Board of

Page 2 of 117



Appeals. (Continued from September 10, September 24, and
October 8, 2019.) (Action Item)

4. ITEMS FOR CONSIDERATION

4.a. Consideration and approval of the Parks, Recreation and Facilities
Master Plan. (Action Item)

4.b. First reading and introduction of an Ordinance adopting the 2019
California Building Standards Code with modifications

Entitled:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
GARDEN GROVE AMENDING TITLE 18 OF THE GARDEN
GROVE MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE
THE FOLLOWING PRIMARY CODES WITH CERTAIN
AMENDMENTS, DELETIONS, AND ADDITIONS THERETO:
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA PLUMBING
CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, 2019
EDITION; CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, 2019
EDITION; CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2019 EDITION;
CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 2019 EDITION;
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2019
EDITION; CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE,
2019 EDITION; AND CERTAIN SECONDARY CODES
INCLUDING THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE, 2018 EDITION, AS PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; AND THE INTERNATIONAL
SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE, 2018 EDITION, AS
PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL. (Action
Item)

5. ORDINANCES PRESENTED FOR SECOND READING AND ADOPTION

5.a. Second reading of Ordinance No. 2909

Entitled:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
GARDEN GROVE APPROVING AMENDMENT NO. A-025-2019, A
ZONING TEXT AMENDMENT TO SECTION 9.04.060 OF THE
GARDEN GROVE MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADD DEFINITIONS
FOR TERMS USED IN EXISTING PORTIONS OF TITLE 9
PERTAINING TO THE FLOOD HAZARD OVERLAY ZONE TO
MEET THE MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS OF THE NATIONAL
FLOOD INSURANCE PROGRAM. (Action Item)

6. MATTERS FROM THE MAYOR, CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS, AND CITY
MANAGER

6.a. Update on Code Enforcement activity pertaining to Short-Term

Page 3 of 117



Rentals in the city as requested by Mayor Pro Tem Klopfenstein.

7. ADJOURNMENT

The next Regular City Council Meeting will be held Tuesday, November 12,
2019, at 5:30 p.m. in the Community Meeting Center, 11300 Stanford
Avenue, Garden Grove, California.

Page 4 of 117



To:
Dept.:

Subject:

Agenda Item - 2.a.

City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

Scott C. Stiles From: Ana Pulido
City Manager Dept.: City Manager
Adoption of a Proclamation Date: 10/22/2019

declaring October 2019 as
Energy Awareness Month
and October 30, 2019, as
Weatherization Day in
Garden Grove. (Action Item)

Attached is a Proclamation declaring October 2019 as Energy Awareness Month and
October 30, 2019, as Weatherization Day in Garden Grove recommended for

adoption.

ATTACHMENTS:

Description

Proclamation

Upload Date Type File Name

10/15/2019 Proclamation 10-22-

19_ENERGY_AWARENESS_MONTH_PROC_2019.pdf

Page 5 of 117



Proclamation

OCTOBER 2019 ENERGY AWARENESS MONTH
OCTOBER 30, 2019 WEATHERIZATION DAY

WHEREAS, The Community Action Partnership of Orange County (CAP OC) has been
weatherizing homes and providing utility assistance for residents in the
city of Garden Grove for more than 40 years. Of the energy funds
allocated to the 34 cities in Orange County, CAP OC has invested 12%
into Garden Grove from 2014-2018, providing an economic boost for low-
income individuals through lower energy costs and reduced or eliminated
late fees, thus assuring less dependency on public assistance; and

WHEREAS, The U.S. Department of Energy (DOE) Weatherization Assistance
Program (WAP) reduces energy costs by 30 percent on average, saving
families at least $238 per year. Therefore, more household money is
made available for other necessities such as groceries, doctor bills, and
other needs, thereby making them more self-sufficient; and

WHEREAS, From 2014-2018, CAP OC has issued $1,589,602 in utility assistance for
4,635 homes in Garden Grove, as well as underwritten $419,231 in
weatherization services, making improvements to 244 dwellings. The
average job total per dwelling was $1,718; and

WHEREAS, In this time period, CAP OC has assisted residents in Garden Grove that
included 34 disabled persons, 151 seniors, and 67 children under age 5;
and

WHEREAS, 1In 2019, CAP OC is projected to weatherize a total of 330 homes in
Orange County and invest a total of $1.8 million into those services; and

WHEREAS, Using federal, state, local, and private dollars, the WAP contributes to the
improvements and progress of communities by eliminating carbon
emissions, stimulating local economies, creating jobs, improving health,
and stabilizing neighborhoods.

NOW, THEREFORE, WE, the Garden Grove City Council, do hereby proclaim October
2019 as Energy Awareness Month and October 30, 2019 as Weatherization Day in the
City of Garden Grove.

October 22, 2019

Steven R. Jones, Mayor

Stephanie Klopfenstein George S. Brietigam John O'Neill
Mayor Pro Tem-District 5 Council Member-District 1 Council Member-District 2
Thu-Ha Nguyen Patrick Phat Bui Kim B. Nguyen
Council Member-District 3 Council Member-District 4 Council Member-District 6

Page 6 of 117



Agenda Item - 2.b.
City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: William E. Murray
Dept.: City Manager Dept.: Public Works
Subject: Authorize the issuance of a Date: 10/22/2019

purchase order to John
Deere and Co. for the
purchase of one (1) new
riding mower for the Public
Works Department.
($28,780.79) (Action Item)

OBJECTIVE

To secure City Council authorization to purchase one (1) new riding mower from
John Deere and Co. through the Sourcewell competitive bid program, Contract
#062117-DAC.

BACKGROUND

The Public Works Department has one (1) riding mower that currently meets the
City’s guidelines for replacement and was approved through the Fiscal Year 19/20
budget process. Experience has shown that the City’s buying power is enhanced
through joining with other public agencies to purchase fleet vehicles and equipment.

DISCUSSION

Sourcewell nationally solicits, evaluates and awards contracts through a competitive
bid process. As a member of Sourcewell, the City is able to utilize bid awards for
equipment purchases. Staff recommends piggybacking on the results of a recent

Sourcewell competitive bid program, Contract #062117-DAC. The results deemed
John Deere and Co. as the lowest responsive bid.

John Deere and Co. $28,780.79 *

* This price includes all applicable tax and destination charges.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

There is no impact to the General Fund. The financial impact is $28,780.79 to the
Fleet Management Fund. The surplus equipment will be sold at public auction.

Page 7 of 117



RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council:

e Authorize the Finance Director to issue a purchase order in the amount of
$28,780.79 to John Deere and Co. for the purchase of one (1) new riding
mower.

By: Steve Sudduth, Equipment Maintenance Supervisor

Page 8 of 117



Agenda Item - 2.c.
City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: Anand Rao
Dept.: City Manager Dept.: Information Technology
Subject: Authorize the issuance of a Date: 10/22/2019

purchase order to Logicalis,
Inc. to provide two (2) F5
load balancers including
technical support. (Cost
$67,946.93) (Action Item)

OBJECTIVE

To secure City Council authorization to purchase two (2) F5 load balancers including
one year support in the amount of $67,946.93 from Logicalis, Inc., pursuant to IFB
No. S-1245-A.

BACKGROUND

Enterprise Resource Planning “ERP” implementation will significantly increase the
workload on the City’s data center. One of the most important tools within the
computing environment is load balancing. A load balancer is a device that spreads
network or application traffic efficiently across multiple servers therefore improving
responsiveness. On September 11, 2018, City Council approved an estimated
$574,000.00 budget for the acquisition of ERP hardware, software and related
licenses.

DISCUSSION

Bid S-1245 for two (2) F5 Load Balancers was released October 31, 2018; after
which the specifications required for ERP were updated. On March 26, 2019 City
Council gave approval to reject all bids received for IFB No. S-2145 and to re-
advertise updated specifications. Three (3) bids for IFB No. S-1245-A were
received on July 26, 2019. All bids were found to be responsive. Bid results were
as follows:

Bidders for IFB No. S-1245-A

COMPANY TOTAL COST

Logicalis, Inc. - Corona, CA $67,946.93

Page 9 of 117



Tobias International — Leander, TX

$76,640.04

Worldwide Supply, LLC - Franklin,
NJ

$80,807.78

FINANCIAL IMPACT

The ERP Capital Fund will absorb the financial impact of the purchase not to exceed

$67,946.93.
RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council:

e Authorize the Finance Director to issue a purchase order to Logicalis, Inc. in the
firm fixed amount of $67,946.93 for two (2) F5 load balancers, including one

year support.

By: Verna Espinoza, Department Secretary

Page 10 of 117



Agenda Item - 2.d.

City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: Teresa Pomeroy
Dept.: City Manager Dept.: City Clerk
Subject: Receive and file minutes Date: 10/22/2019

from the meeting held on
October 8, 2019. (Action
Item)

Attached are the minutes from the meeting held on October 8, 2019, recommended
to be received and filed as submitted or amended.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Upload Date Type File Name
Minutes 10/18/2019 Minutes cc-min_10_08_2019.pdf

Page 11 of 117



MINUTES
GARDEN GROVE CITY COUNCIL
Regular Meeting
Tuesday, October 8, 2019
Community Meeting Center

11300 Stanford Avenue, Garden Grove, CA 92840

CONVENE CLOSED SESSION

At 5:37 p.m., Mayor Jones convened Closed Session in the Founders Room.

ROLL CALL PRESENT: (5) Council Members Brietigam, T. Nguyen, K.
Nguyen, Mayor Pro Tem Klopfenstein, Mayor
Jones
ABSENT: (2) Council Member O’Neill was absent at Roll

Call, but joined the meeting at 5:40 p.m.
Council Member Bui was absent at Roll Call,
but joined the meeting at 6:05 p.m.

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS FOR CLOSED SESSION

Speakers: None.

CLOSED SESSION MATTERS

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL - ANTICIPATED LITIGATION
Significant exposure to litigation per Government Code 54956.9(d)(2): One potential
case.

City Attorney Sandoval announced that the Council will consider the litigation
threatened by OCCORD, which they have now filed.

ADJOURNED CLOSED SESSION

At 6:25 p.m., Mayor Jones adjourned Closed Session.

CONVENE REGULAR MEETING

At 6:35 p.m., Mayor Jones convened the regular meeting in the Council Chamber

-1- 10/08/19

Page 12 of 117



with all Council Members present.

INVOCATION

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE FLAG OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA
Mayor Jones provided Orange County Fire Authority Chief Ron Roberts with a
framed proclamation for Fire Prevention Week starting October 6 through October

12, 2019.

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS

Speakers: Ray Rains, Van Vo, David Kenney, Dale Soeffner, Jess Hernandez,
Ashland Le, Trang Vu, Joseph Ngo, Beatrice Rodriguez, Tom Raber, Bob
Donelson, Pam Donelson, Carlos Mendoza, Maureen Blackmun

RECESS
At 7:29 p.m., Mayor Jones recessed the meeting.
RECONVENE

At 7:31 p.m., Mayor Jones reconvened the meeting in the Council Chamber with all
Council Members present.

ADOPTION OF A PROCLAMATION DECLARING SEPTEMBER 15, 2019 THROUGH
OCTOBER 15, 2019, AS "NATIONAL HISPANIC HERITAGE MONTH” IN GARDEN
GROVE (F: 83.1)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

A Proclamation declaring September 15, 2019, through October 15, 2019, as
“National Hispanic Heritage Month” in Garden Grove, be adopted.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O’Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones

Noes: (0) None

ADOPTION OF A PROCLAMATION DECLARING OCTOBER 6 THROUGH OCTOBER 12,
2019, AS “FIRE PREVENTION WEEK” IN GARDEN GROVE (F: 83.1)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

-2- 10/08/19

Page 13 of 117



A Proclamation declaring October 6 through October 12, 2019, as “Fire Prevention
Week,” in Garden Grove, be adopted.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

ADOPTION OF A PROCLAMATION DECLARING OCTOBER 20 TO OCTOBER 26, 2019,
AS “CHILDHOOD LEAD POISONING PREVENTION WEEK” IN GARDEN GROVE
(F: 83.1)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

A Proclamation declaring October 20 through October 26, 2019, as “Childhood Lead
Poisoning Prevention Week,” in Garden Grove, be adopted.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO SITE LICENSE AND USE AGREEMENTS EXTENDING
THE TERMS WITH ARENA SOCCER PARKS, INC., AND SOCAL STREET HOCKEY
(F: 55-ARENA SOCCER PARKS, INC.) (F: 55-SOCAL HOCKEY)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

An amendment to site license and use agreement with Arena Soccer Parks, Inc., to
extend the term to March 31, 2020, for the outdoor arena soccer facilities at
Garden Grove Park, be approved;

An amendment to the site license and use agreement with SoCal Street Hockey to
extend the term to March 31, 2020, for the outdoor hockey rink facility at Chapman
Sports Complex; and

The City Manager be authorized to execute the amendments, and make minor
modifications as appropriate thereto, on behalf of the City.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

-3- 10/08/19

Page 14 of 117



Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

APPROVAL OF ADDITIONAL FUNDS TO COMPLETE EMERGENCY REPAIRS TO WELL 31
(F: 112.11) (XR: CC RES 9578-19)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

Additional funds in the amount of $34,700 be ratified and approved to complete
necessary repair work to Well 31.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones

Noes: (0) None

AUTHORIZE THE ISSUANCE OF A PURCHASE ORDER TO NATIONAL AUTO FLEET
GROUP FOR TWO (2) NEW PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT VANS

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

The Finance Director be authorized to issue a purchase order in the amount of
$54,281.58 to National Auto Fleet Group for the purchase of two (2) new Public
Works Department vans.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

APPROVAL OF AMENDMENT NO. 1 TO THE AGREEMENT WITH SIEMENS MOBILITY
INC., FOR ON-CALL TRAFFIC SIGNAL AND STREET LIGHTING MAINTENANCE AND
REPAIR SERVICES (F: 55-SIEMENS MOBILITY, INC.)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

Amendment No. 1 to the agreement with Siemens Mobility, Inc., increasing the
total compensation amount from $300,000 to $400,000, be approved; and

_4- 10/08/19

Page 15 of 117



The City Manager be authorized to execute Amendment No. 1, and to make minor
modifications on behalf of the City.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

APPROVAL OF A COST SHARING AGREEMENT WITH THE MUNICIPAL WATER
DISTRICT OF ORANGE COUNTY FOR IMPLEMENTING COMPLIANCE WITH THE 2019
AMERICA’'S WATER INFRASTRUCTURE ACT (F: 122.5)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

The cost sharing agreement with the Municipal Water District of Orange County for
sharing consultant costs, in the amount of $145,405, for the preparation of a Risk
and Resilience Assessment and update of an Emergency Response Plan to
implement the 2019 America’s Water Infrastructure Act Compliance, be approved;
and

The Mayor be authorized to execute the agreement on behalf of the City.
The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones

Noes: (0) None

RECEIVE AND FILE MINUTES FROM THE MEETING HELD ON SEPTEMBER 24, 2019
(F: VAULT)

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

Minutes from the meeting held on September 24, 2019, be received and filed.
The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.

Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

-5- 10/08/19

Page 16 of 117



WARRANTS

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

Regular Warrants 654588 through 654822; 654823 through 654971; 654972
through 655188; 655189 through 655391; Wires W2617 through W2619; W2620
through W2628; W2629 through W2630; W655189 through W655391; and
Payroll Warrants 183679 through 183707; Direct Deposits D354602 through
D355211; and Wires W2630 through W2633, be received and filed as presented in
the warrant register submitted that have been audited for accuracy and funds are
available for payment thereof by the Finance Director.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

WAIVER

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Brietigam that:

Full reading of ordinances listed be waived.
The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

PUBLIC HEARING - ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION TO APPROVE A
RECOMMENDATION FROM THE TRAFFIC COMMISSION TO MODIFY EXISTING
STREET DIVERTERS ON FLOWER STREET AND BOWEN STREET, AT TRASK AVENUE,
GARDEN GROVE (CONTINUED FROM SEPTEMBER 24, 2019)

(F: 122.11) (XR: 100.1)

COUNCIL MEMBER BUI RECUSED HIMSELF CITING HIS PROPERTY IS IN PROXIMITY
TO FLOWER STREET AND LEFT THE MEETING AT 7:33 P.M.

Following staff presentation, Mayor Jones declared the public hearing open and
asked if anyone wished to address the City Council on the matter.

Speakers: Kadi Mohr

-6- 10/08/19

Page 17 of 117



With no further response from the audience, Mayor Jones closed the public hearing.
It was moved by Mayor Jones, seconded by Council Member Brietigam that:

Resolution No. 9591-19 entitled: A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Garden Grove, California, amending Resolution No. 7852-96 approving a
recommendation from the Traffic Commission to modify access to/from Flower
Street and Bowen Street at Trask Avenue, be adopted.

The motion carried by a 6-0-1 vote as follows:
Ayes: (6) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None
Absent: (1) Bui
RECESS
At 7:38 p.m., Mayor Jones recessed the meeting.

RECONVENE

At 7:45 p.m., Mayor Jones reconvened the meeting in the Council Chamber with all
Council Members present.

PUBLIC HEARING - APPROVAL OF SUBSTANTIAL AMENDMENT NO. 2 TO THE 2019-
20 ANNUAL ACTION PLAN FOR THE USE OF FUNDING FROM THE DEPARTMENT OF
HOUSING AND URBAN DEVELOPMENT (F: 117.10D)

Following staff presentation, Mayor Jones declared the public hearing open and
asked if anyone wished to address the City Council on the matter.

Speakers: None.
With no response from the audience, Mayor Jones closed the public hearing.

It was moved by Council Member Brietigam, seconded by Council Member T.
Nguyen that:

Substantial Amendment No. 2 be transmitted to the Department of Housing and
Urban Development.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

-7- 10/08/19

Page 18 of 117



Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

PUBLIC HEARING - INTRODUCTION AND FIRST READING OF AN ORDINANCE
APPROVING AMENDMENT NO. A-025-2019 TO AMEND SECTION 9.04.060 OF TITLE
9 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE (F: 115.A-025-2019) (XR: 50.3)

(As approved earlier in the meeting, it was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen,
seconded by Council Member Brietigam, and approved by a 7-0 vote, that full
reading of ordinances listed be waived.)

Following staff presentation, Mayor Jones declared the public hearing open and
asked if anyone wished to address the City Council on the matter.

Speakers: None.
There being no response from the audience, Mayor Jones closed the public hearing.

It was moved by Council Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member
Klopfenstein that:

The Ordinance be categorically exempt from the California Environmental Quality
Act pursuant to Title 14, California Code of Regulations, Section 15061(b)(3); and

Ordinance No. 2909 entitled: An Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Garden
Grove approving Amendment No. A-025-2019, a zoning text amendment to Section
9.04.060 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code to add definitions for terms used in
existing portions of Title 9 pertaining to the flood hazard overlay zone to meet the
minimum requirements of the National Flood Insurance Program, be passed to
second reading.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O’Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones

Noes: (0) None

APPOINTMENT TO FILL A VACANCY ON THE ADMINISTRATIVE BOARD OF APPEALS
(CONTINUED FROM SEPTEMBER 10, 2019, AND SEPTEMBER 24, 2019) (F: 122.2)

This matter was continued to the next meeting.

-8- 10/08/19

Page 19 of 117



APPOINTMENT TO FILL A VACANCY ON THE PLANNING COMMISSION (CONTINUED
FROM SEPTEMBER 10, 2019 AND SEPTEMBER 24, 2019) (F: 122.10A)

It was moved by Mayor Jones, seconded by Council Member Brietigam that:

Josh Lindsay be transferred from the Traffic Commission to fill the vacancy on the
Planning Commission.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN APPLICATION FOR, AND RECEIPT
OF, SB 2 PLANNING GRANT PROGRAM FUNDS (F: 177.10D)

Following staff introduction and City Council discussion, it was moved by Council
Member K. Nguyen, seconded by Council Member Bui that:

Resolution No. 9592-19 entitled: A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Garden Grove, California, authorizing application for, and receipt of, SB 2 Planning
Grants program funds, be adopted; and

Funds received from the Planning Grants Program application be appropriated for
the purpose designated for the Fiscal Year 2019-20.

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:
Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones

Noes: (0) None

MATTERS FROM THE MAYOR, CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS, AND CITY MANAGER

DISCUSSION REGARDING PROPOSED TET PARADE AND FESTIVAL IN GARDEN
GROVE AS REQUESTED BY COUNCIL MEMBER BUI (F: 46.1) (XR: 42.8A)

Council Member Bui, speaking on behalf of the Viethamese American Federation of
Southern California, provided a preliminary draft and briefed the City Council on the
intent to bring forward a proposal to conduct a Tet Parade and Festival in Garden
Grove on the Lunar New Year, January 25, 2020. He noted that it is the
Federation’s desire to close Westminster Avenue from Atlantis to Bushard Street,
and all lanes from Bushard Street to 150 feet West of Brookhurst Street. He stated
that the Federation would pay all costs and he commented that past accusations
were untrue regarding nonpayment to the City of Westminster. He further

-9- 10/08/19

Page 20 of 117



described details in the proposed preliminary draft, as well as plans to market the
event.

Council Member Brietigam noted his discomfort with having a Tet Parade on the
same day as the City of Westminster, and that he would consider a Tet Parade and
Festival in Garden Grove, on a different day.

Council Member O’Neill agreed that having a Tet Parade on the same day as
Westminster would cause political drama, and he commented on the many logistical
concerns including street closures and public safety.

Council Member T. Nguyen expressed concern that as Tet is a sacred holiday, two
separate events would foster ill will, and commented on the importance of having
good relationships with neighboring cities.

Council Member Klopfenstein expressed the need for a breakdown on costs and
concern about political issues.

Following further discussion, Mayor Jones reminded Council Member Bui to be clear
that on this topic he is not speaking on behalf of the City Council, but on behalf of
the Viethamese American Federation.

MATTERS FROM THE MAYOR, CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS, AND CITY MANAGER
(continued)

Council Member Brietigam commented on numerous complaints he has received
about mosquitoes in District 1 due to the proximity of the Los Alamitos Joint Forces
Training Base, and he asked that staff send a letter to the Los Alamitos Joint Forces
Training Base requesting mosquito abatement on Base property. He commented on
the need to become more aggressive with property owners using single family
homes as Airbnb’s, and suggested forming a term task force.

In response to public comments, Mayor Pro Tem Klopfenstein noted time she has
spent and the need for the City to do more on addressing Short-Term Rentals
(STRs). She asked that staff provide an update on what has been done to date,
along with analysis on outsourcing enforcement activities. She expressed that
residents deserve safe neighborhoods free from crimes associated with STRs, and
that the City needs to do more effective enforcement.

Council Member O’Neill noted the density and increased traffic, and expressed the
need to enforce regulations on permitted accessory dwelling units. He commented
that after seeing the volume of traffic for the car show at the Anaheim Convention
Center, parking permits should be considered for neighborhoods near the Anaheim
border.

-10- 10/08/19

Page 21 of 117



Council Member Bui requested that the City Attorney clarify for the benefit of the
residents who are faced with STRs in their neighborhood, what actions have been
taken and what enforcement activities have been conducted.

City Attorney Sandoval stated that STRs are prohibited in residential zones;
however, they are allowed in commercial zones with a conditional use permit. He
noted that the City has been enforcing the code; however, both the Fourth
Amendment of the Constitution, and the State of California Constitution protects
people and their private property from undue searches and seizures. The City has
to establish probable cause to issue a citation, and is required to follow due process
with the burden of proof on the government. He also reminded the City Council on
the Brown Act requirements limiting discussion on items not listed on the agenda.

Council Member O’Neill requested and moved a Community Workforce agreement
with the Los Angeles Orange County construction trade be listed on the agenda for
discussion and possible action in two weeks. He suggested staff look to other
surrounding cities who have these agreements, and for a presentation by the
construction trade be considered, seconded by Council Member Brietigam.

Council Member K. Nguyen requested to amend the motion to include a report with
analysis on a Community Workforce agreement to be listed on the November 12,
2019, City Council agenda. Council Member O’Neill agreed with amending his
motion. (F: 46.1)

The motion carried by a 7-0 vote as follows:

Ayes: (7) Brietigam, O'Neill, T. Nguyen, Bui, Klopfenstein, K.
Nguyen, Jones
Noes: (0) None

Council Member O’Neill concluded with announcements that the Orange County Fire
Authority Open House is Saturday, October 12, 2019, at Station 81 on Acacia
Parkway; and the Garden Grove Woman’s Civic Club will be holding their annual
holiday craft boutique on October 26, 2019, from 9:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m., at their
facility on Chapman Avenue.

Council Member T. Nguyen wished her son, her mother, and Mayor Jones a happy
birthday.

In response to public comments, Council Member K. Nguyen noted that she has
been working with Public Works and the Police Department on traffic safety issues
on Roxey Street and Trask Avenue, and Haster Street and Lampson Avenue. A
street light will be installed before the end of next year at Roxey Street and Trask
Avenue. She requested staff look into installing stop signs at Woodbury Road and
Roxey Street, as well as light synchronization at Westminster Avenue and Roxey
Street. She noted that she is coordinating a potential small-scale event on Veterans

-11- 10/08/19

Page 22 of 117



Day with staff, Congressman Lou Correa’s office and Congressman Allen Lowenthal’s
office.

Council Member Bui wished City Manager Stiles and Council Member T. Nguyen safe
travels while on their trip to Garden Grove Sister City Anyang, Korea.

Mayor Jones expressed his appreciation for the shared vision that has resulted in
successful projects, and he asked that the City Council continue to openly
communicate and stay focused on the business of the City. He noted the grand
opening of Steelcraft next to City Hall, and praised the project commending staff for
their hard work and dedication to making the City better. He asked that City
Council refrain from distracting staff from the work at hand, and continue to be
forward-looking as the city is reimagined into the future. He urged City Council to
continue to do what is in the best interest of the people they serve.

City Attorney Sandoval stated that during closed session, the lawsuit that was
threatened and now filed against the City by OCCORD was discussed, and there is
no reportable action.

ADJOURNMENT

At 9:10 p.m., Mayor Jones adjourned the meeting. The next Regular City Council
Meeting will be held on Tuesday, October 22, 2019, at 5:30 p.m. at the Community
Meeting Center, 11300 Stanford Avenue, Garden Grove, California.

Teresa Pomeroy, CMC
City Clerk

-12- 10/08/19

Page 23 of 117



To: Scott C. Stiles
Dept.: City Manager
Subject: Receive and file warrants.

City of Garden Grove

Agenda Item - 2.e.

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

(Action Item)

From:

Dept.:

Date:

Teresa Pomeroy
City Clerk

10/22/2019

Attached are the warrants recommended to be received and filed.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description

Warrants 10-02-19

Warrants 10-09-19

Warrants 10-16-19

Warrants (Payroll 10-10-
19)

Upload Date

10/17/2019

10/17/2019

10/17/2019

10/17/2019

Type

Warrants

Warrants

Warrants

Warrants

File Name

10-22-19_CC_Warrants_(10-
02-19).pdf

10-22-19_CC_Warrants_(10-
09-19).pdf

10-22-19_CC_Warrants_(10-
16-19).pdf

10-22-
19_CC_Warrants_(Payroll).pdf

Page 24 of 117



T€°20Z'T0T'T =

d0od TYLIOL HED¥d

~

-
€egee GWIFAY J¥YD JHd OMANYLETY ‘SOTANNYL » momwmm

N
00°01S‘¢€ AGIS J0¥d YAHILO *ONI ‘ISIYA¥EING NOXY mOMMmm
T1°609 SWALI INIYW ¥IHIO *0D ‘SATYS OIMIIAN-YNOY >OWWmm
00706862 SADIAYIS TYOIAAW YALNED TYDIAEW TYNOTIOHY WIHHYNY 907GG9
82 ¥8L SLOVEINOD A¥HS-INIYW SADIAYAS MOIVATTE HOEIWY G0¥SG9
L6°€EPS’890'T INOD ¥ISNOD IZFIILS LTYHASY NYDINAWY TIY 70¥GG9
99°6G¢2'7T XMOLNIANI FSHM ONI ‘HIQOTD ONIdIM V3Y €07SG9
z9°2vS ATEYD AIEYD HANYYM FWIL Z0vGG9
19°%62 0T SYD TYINIUYN 0D S¥D JITYD OS TOPSS9
86°6T16'T ALIDINLIOATH 00 NOSIQX AITYD OS 007569
ZS°SLE SYAAAHAL / ANOHd ATHAL SNOILYOINAWWOD HAILINOYA 66£559
S GLE'L ANOHAATAL dd0d I31¥ 86€£5G9
69°000'S $4IT4dNS/0d ALAIVS LSITYIOHEAS JIJdVEL Od L6€GS9
0S6° 1S INAWHOVLIY FOYM AOTAYES ANANIATY TYNIHILNI 96£G559
00°0S2 INEWHOVLIY HOUYM ATd TYYINID ¥HDIAIO ONIXAFT /JJTYHHS AINNOD HONWIO G6E£GG9
00" LZE INIWHOYLIY HOUM TOIAYES HANIATY TYNIIINI P6€GS9
217651 INIWHOYLIY dOUM INZWHSINYYO FOVYM :NLIY IdEd ININJOTIATA LNAWAOTIWH €6£G5G9
[AAR A4V RNN INIWHOYLIY dAOUM a9Y0d XYL ASIHONYYA-IITYD JI0 HLYLS Z6EGGY
00°6V6- gIoA ® AXM ONNYL NIL ‘OA TBESGY
00°€LE T~ dIOA ® AXY ALSATAD ‘NYWMAMHOS 9F€GG9
€L VS6- dIOA ® AFY YIMALIOHS 60TESY
00°GTTI- aIoA ¥ AE¥ MOAYATYS ‘YA0T L6G0S9
INNOWY NOILdI¥OSHEA YOANIA INTIEUM

-

6T/20/0T TYAOYdAY 904 TIDNANOD ALID OL QILLINAAS SINTIUYM



16°G€

79 8¢EV
00°0%T
807009
ASNAVA:
SC'LES
00°GLD‘T
06°LVT
SL BV
007066
00°08¢E
00°50S
087089
00°966°C
69°29€'S
L8 VTE
9L LEY
09°¥%9
§9°LS9
00°0%9

EETECY
00°06

LNNOWY

SHOIAYUS AYHAITHA
SEONUYNIAINNAAY/SEdId
aqood

GWIHY LSNYL ddW
NOILINAQWAY/SNND
SIOWALNOD AYIS-LNIVW
AYHAS J40dd ¥IHLO
03/HOVW/NINA-SYIVdHd
dXd UNINYD HDOITOd
SIDOYILNOD AYIS-INIVA
SLOYVYLNOD A¥IS-LNIVA
gWI¥Y d9¥0 d4d
INIWHOYLLY dIDYM
SHDTIAYES TYOIAUN
LHOLNIANT HSEM
TIYMILIOS

SHITddNS ANOD ¥IV¥
0d/STO0L YONIW ¥HHILO
XYOLNIANI HSHM

AYES J40dd ¥IHLO

SdTHSYHIWAN/ SENd

NOILdIYOSHd

L9°LE9'GZ = SEANIT .x. ¥Od TYIOL IOUYd

d¥0D SSUUdXd TYddddd

*ONI ‘S10Nd0¥d NOILVHIVMI ONIME

YAANVY.LSYD HODNd HLULYZITH

OYD NNV ‘I¥IIIE«

*ONI ‘SESIYdYIINT AHTO0d

SHOIAYHS TYINIWNOYIANT JINOWYIAd

OT1 ‘SEIVIDOSSY ¥ ddN¥D SINNIA

ALTENDES 3 ¥MDO0T TYIDYIWWOD dNOY¥D ALI¥ANDUS MDOTWOD
TYLIASOH AYUYNIYHLIA ALINNWWOD

*ONI ‘®AYOSANYTI "9°D

ONI ‘X¥0IVY0gYT 0dd WHHD

NYQL  ‘ONILNHD «

auyvyod XY.I HSIHONYHI-AITYD 40 HIVLS

ONI AWOLOHHTHd JISNHIOd AITYD

"ONI STIVIYHELYW UNITAdId STTUIM'D

ONI LNIANYIAOD-MAD

SYOLNITYLSIA JTIYSHTOHM YETIOIS "ONI ¥HTOIS TTIASSNA
"ONI ‘STTIANMOY¥E

00 dOHSId

‘ONI ‘M¥VTIO ANV ¥M¥vd

JOUNHEA

6T/20/0T 'I¥YA0¥ddY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OL JHLLIWENS SINTIUTYM

(=)}
N
€26 of 117

S9
mmmwmw
LZVSG9
92¥SS9
GZ¥SS9
¥ZvSG9
AR
AARNL
TZvSS9
027559
6T¥SS9
8T¥SS9
LTYSS9
9T¥SS9
STPSG9
[ANATF)
€ETVGG9
¢17569
TT1%5S9

0Tvas9

LNYYIYM



LT TC6
00°00S'¥
9G"LTO'T
9G°L86
00°0¢t

L2 9LT
00°0¢
86°LC
00°o00€
2T 0€0°S
0G°€T6
00°060‘¥
GZ'6€9'C
69°006
6G°€87 '€
96° ¢V
91°8
08°vE
10°0G¢
00°0S€'T
0E"TLV'E
EL°GE9
00°06G
76 °LT9

LNAOWY

SWELI INIYW ¥dHLO
SHOIAYES ONTIIINIDNA
DNIDAOT

HONHELSISHNS
SHJOTHANE/9HdYd
HWIHY ALITILA LNYNIL
SHUITddNS dNOD ¥IV¥
gWIdY LSNAL dENW
XYJOLNIANT HSHM
dX3/SHdITddNS dDIAJO0
AYES J0dd ¥UHIO
AJOLNHIANI HSHM
SLOYALNOD AY¥ES-LNIVR
SLOVALNOD A¥HES-LNIVW
AIYMAIYH

SWELI ILNIVW Y9dHLO
STYOIWIHO Xd0LvVd0dy]
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
LIOLNIANI ISHM
SOLNIWIN/SNId

ANNAHY YHLYM
SLNYDI¥ENT/HAA/LNIVd

NOILdI¥DSHEd

L0°886°0E =

SYULNID

6T/20/0T TYA

SUNIT wxw 404 TYLOL HOVL

HTEYAIIOHY SINNODDY "ONI ‘SWHLSAS dYONM

ONI'LSdEM YEQTIINIATH

YSIT ‘WIM«

*ONI ‘ANYAWOD ¥dAdYd FSIM ¥ HANOYM ‘YAWTIIN

NYX YANYWY ‘YAOL

X1ddns INOLSNHOL

NYAIT ‘NIC«

02 OTADNYA

NILOWOYA T

ONILNAODDY :NIIY dN0¥D ONILTASNOD ILSHMYHLNI
0¥d 10d3d AWOH HHL

TEGLEPTOGZ-2E LdAQ SHDIAWEAS IIQHUD I104HA IWOH

NOISITTIOD ¥ILITYD ¥YEd °"ONI ‘SMYOMACOd dHLITYO

ONI HJ4YS ? D01 S0dd S.TTIIH

ONI ANYdRWOD HOVH

NOILYIDOSSY ALIAYS AUYMHOIH SYONYHAOD

*ONI ‘S1DNQo¥d 1TTEd NIATOD

D11 ‘SALYIDOSSY 3 JANQYYD "0

LOOY dWOD MYOM-HAOCYD NIQYYD 40 ALID

SINIVd dUZYdd ¥dd OO SWUYITTIIM-NIMYIHS HHL
JOANHA

0ddd¥ ¥04 TIDONNOD ALID OL JULLINENS SLNVIIYM

[s o] o
Page 275f 117

[Ty}

Vo]

mn
O

LY7SG9

97 vS99

SvrS99

[AAATE

EVPSSO

A2

IS 22

07 ¥SS9

6EVSS9

BEVSSO

LEVSSO

9€EvGS9

GEPSSO

FEVSSO

EEPSSO

ZEPSS9

TERPSSO

0EPSSO

LNYIIVYM



6T°GLG’'2S = SANIT wxa 904 TYIOL HADUL

N~
) . =
20°82 HOUNE HIX:ILOo®d o
88°62 STYILNTY ¥IHLO AYIS XLINAWWOD-HSYD ALLAd mmmMmm
(@]
T ARA L A AYES A0¥d ¥AHIO *ONI ‘SNOILAO LSHd hwmwmw
€9°09T'T
£€9°2SS ONISCQOT
00°98T IONALSISENS
00°22¥ NOTIYIYOdSNYYL ¥/S/T NMVHS ‘MYY¥d« 9997559
29°121'1 SOOI INQ 01T FY0LS AONYY XINNOD TONWIO G97G59
00°09T ONISILITAQY LHM/ANT ‘NOO P9¥5G9
66°SP8 TYAOWIY LYWZYH *ONI ‘SHDIA¥IS TYINTWNOIIANT HATH NYIAD0 €9pGG9
90°9 ONISILYIAAY OTT ‘SNOILNTOS INAWNDOd 29Y 297559
00°6¢ZS AJES J0¥d Y¥IAHIO *ONI TYNOILYNJYHAINI SOOQMON 19559
8 8L
6L %1 SEITAdNS ANOD ¥IV
G0° %9 SHONUYNALINAIY/SHIId ONIFWNTd WHVOYIN 097559
67758 XA¥OLNIANI HSHM d¥0D 9Id MAN 6G7GG9
05°62% ‘12 NOIILYIIOdSNVIL ¥/S/T *ONI ‘MOTTIHEX 029Y¥D 867559
Z8°6LV'E STYINTY YIHLO STYINTY NOILOOYLSNOD TUYNOILUYN LSFGS9
25°266°'T XAHOLNIANI ISHM 0D FIYMAUYH AYIHODINOW 9G6pGS9
08°€91 TUYMOIYH 0D X1ddNS ¥YYO-YHLSYW OKW GGHSS9
2179719 SIWYOAINA SYOTIYL AOY/MIALSYWIAIMYND/STIYD OTT ’STIVD PS¥SS9
0€°26T GNIHT TIYY¥D dHd AOWVED ‘HATx £GFGG9
00°2¢ TONVAQY TAAVIL NILSOY ‘ALYIAYTIx ZS¥SS9
Z5°¥S HNOHJAATHL STIIAYES ENIT HAOYNONYT TSPGS9
€L°12v 8T A¥AS J0¥d YHHLO NOIILVIOd¥0D YOM 0S¥SS9
ILNNOWY NOIL4dI¥OSHA YOANIA INTIYYM

6T/20/0T 'I¥YA0¥AdY 904 TIDNANOD ALID OL JELLIWENS SLNYIUYYM



0L ST8
00°0SL
S GLS'T
86 '9¢t¢
PT1°T6G‘€E
69°09T°T
Z1°80T’€E
00°00T‘T
€9°%2%'C
00°00T
00°S¢L
¢S 8vL
09°69€’€ET
00°1T
79°6T€°C
20°698°T
LT 6LS
02°6¢1
8L°01
06°€¢

67 €T
9T 6T
r8°ve

97 °99
4728
002y

LNOOWY

SIWIOAINN

HNIEY HY¥O d4d
AdOLNIANI HSHM

ddL¥M dETLLOY
AdOLNIANI ISHM
AIOLNUIANI HSHM
SHITdANS/0d ALAJIUS
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
dIN0F/NdNA FONIR
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
SLOYVELNOD AYUS-INIVRW
STOOL dSOddnd NID
AdIS J40dd ¥HHLO
GWIdY ALITILA INYNHL
dIN0d aHIOLINORW
0d/ST00L ¥ONIN ¥IHIO
ddns L1IN2/03d ¥IFHIO
dX3/SHEITddNS IDIAIO0
SUITddNS WOOYUSSYID
SWILI dO0d Y¥HHLO
TddNS AY¥EAS 4004

aood

dXd WYdD0dd : LO®d

dXd UOIJJ0:LOed

Hd3d IONYYLNA/NWAY

NOILdIYOSHA

GL 78V 'FPE = SEANIT uxu YOI TYIOL IOVL

ANYdWOD HUDAYd NAS

YEOVT ‘YHAOLS »

SL0NJd0Yd TVIMLSAONT HIY.LS

SLLATIIYAS

0T SINYDIYdNT SHILNNOD NYFHINOS

ONI ‘ANYAWOD X1ddNS ® HdId HIIRWS

YIYALIOHS

OTT ‘USNIIId TINIINIS ¥€d YADIZHOVY *T NOLNITO
S120AJ0¥d YHINAWOD IHUS

LddId SAITYIHS ALNNOD ONICQUYNYELE NUS

ONI ‘TTOMINOD ISEd 3IST ALIIVS

*ONI ‘T00L HOHOOMMNHEHESOYH

ONI ‘I3EMOIL YI¥d

HIMYN NNY YIYANYTIIA ‘NOSY¥IE0d

STIVLSNI HINLINYNA Odd ¥YEd ONI HHNLINYQA IOIAI0 Idd

ATIYATHEDEY SINNODOY 0/3 "ONI NOIONIWYYI LT YIMOdAVTd

JOANHEA

6T/20/0T TYAOYddY ¥Od TIDNNOD XLID OL AHLLIWENS SILNTHIYM

@
e39 of 117

59
mw%%mm
287559
187559
087559
6L7559
8LYSS9
LLVSS9
9LPSS9
SLPSS9
PLPSS9
€LPSS9
ZLPSS9
TLPSS9
0L¥SS9

69FSS9

LNTIITM



TE'¥OE
00°ve
0€°261
00°096‘C
00°TT

Ly 998'T
06°9¢8
87 °S0G5'6
€6°€8

GG 127 ‘6
8V vIZ’'Z
08°9€0'T
00°6G¢
LE"¥98'T
0T°0€E6'T
98° %81
V2 SVLT
LO'6TV'E
00°50% '80%
6G 8¢
99°FE0’T
EVTEET
ce 168
G9°686°T

LNNOWY

ONISILYIAAY

HWNIEY ALITILO LNUYNHL
gNIHET #3990 44d
SUDIAYES ONIYUIINIONA
GWIHY ALITILN INYNIL
THNAd TISHIA/SYD AW
SIOVELNOD AYHS-ILNIYA
SEONYNALNNAAY/SddId
AYOLNIANI dSHM
AJOLNIANI HSHM
STYDINIHO A¥0LYYOHYT
GWIZY ALITILA LNYNIL
SUITddNS TYDIYLOHTH
SUITddNS dNOD ¥IV¥
AYOLNIANI HSHM
S10Nd0¥d LIVHdSY
LNOD dLSNOD LAHYLS
SUDIAYYUS AYIAITHA
SHDIAYES AYANNYTI
AYOLNIANT HSHM
HOIAYES AL HTIVYD
SAIHSYHENEN/ SANd

NOILdIYOSHd

€G°ZVP’'8EY = SENIT .xu ¥Od TYIOL IDYJ

09071 0dd

OI¥YW ‘SYI¥Yd-SOTYAY

YIAOVYID ‘YIAIATEA~

ONI ‘SINYITINSNOD VYITHd dN0¥D

"H NYNO ‘91T

JSd SSHYdXH LHOIYM Vdd XNVE XIM

HOLUYNINIELXE NYHLSIEM

O0GET# ONI ‘SISIMAMALNA NOSNOYHA
X1ddns XIYIINYS HIXYM

*ONI ‘SEIDOTONHOHEL ENITHALYM
HYTINGIEYH ‘IJYSYM

OIdLOHATH ATYSHTOHM SUALTVM

JEONITED

NOISIAIQ NIHLSEM ANVdAWOD STVIYHLYW NYOTNA

OMNVYAI Vdd “ONI LTISVA

AOIAYES THOYYd JHLINA

d¥0D LSYTIJINN

J004d3NTd ¥SN-ALT JONYNHLNIVW SHILITIOVA ATddNS JH

HTIdYO JENIYM HWIL

YILNID LNIWAYd LSEM O0/D LSUM -SYILNIAY NOSWOHL
JOANHIA

6T/20/0T TYA0¥ddY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OL CQHALLIWANS SINTIIYM

<
o
uwn
O

™
o

DPadge 30%f 117
[Tg)
0

N
o
[Ig]
(o)

T09SS9

005959

667559

867599

L6VSS9

967569

S67SS9

A2

£67959

c67S59

167569

067559

6873599

887559

LB¥SS9

987599

G8FSS9

LNTIIYM



GE'EES
GP°96S'T
0T°8TIV'T
99°T79°T
pPE"8ST'T-
00°008°2C
0E"VPT
17266 'T
pe TvI
00°¢T
08°0
F1°6¢CT
00°8VT
00°7v
00°0v
00°¥0T
[AZNar
LetecL
00°L6C
00°v
06°66T'T
00°ve
00°QTT
00°q¢
00°0L6'C
00°0S¢E

LNNOWY

SALLISSYD/S4NS /SM00H
AYOLNEANT HSHM
AdOINIANT HSHM

aNQAHY dHLYM
aNQddd LISOoddd

SINYOI¥ENT/IAA/INIYA
AJdOLNIANI HSHM

aNAdTd dH4

d3d JLVLS AYSYSH
aNQIEY LINdHEd 9aTId

aNQIHEd dH4

ANQAET LIWJEd

aNOdHY LIWNGHd DdTd
aNNATY XYL ¥d3d0 snd
aNNIHd dHLYM

SANNAHY LISOdHEd

LSIA NOILYLID

dWNIHEY LSNYL ddW
dWNIHEY ALITILO INUNUL
SANNAHE LISOdHd
GNTHY ALITILN LNUYNHL
YINOD LSNOD ¥MS/dlLM

dXd NOILONAOodd O0ddIA

NOILdIdDSHEA

SUNIT uxu ¥0OJd TYILOL HEDVd

€0G6800T ONI LNIWIDUNVW VIV¥A MSTY SIXEANSIXHT
ANYdWOD ONILVIIdO AILIYHA

ONI SNOIS ANV ALIAVS OIJdVdL HAIMILYLS

ONI SHIYLSNANI 9 % [
*ONI ‘0D % NUYNNIWE '9°3F

SMYOM ¥HLYM NIUILSHM

OTT ‘INIWNJOTIAEA SMS

ANDYEANA HHL
IDATEYAH A¥Y ANITHON

ANYL YNNOQ ‘¥E¥ndad

XAYOH ‘IS'IOH

£ I9¥0ED ‘sOolndd

AMDO0¥  'YEYOTVENd «

IMEE0Y ‘NIMATVE

HOAYATYS ‘YAOT

IHL YH D09N ‘IV¥W

*ONI ‘ONINHEANIONZ STIOS dALYIDOSSY
NHOL ‘NALINIS

JOdNJIA

6T/20/0T TIYA0MAdY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OL JULLIWENS SINYHIYM

N
[3\]
9]
[\e]

—
“Page 31f 117

[Ty}
[Xo]

[Ty}
(o]

o
[a\]

679959

816569

LTGGS9

916599

G16969

PTSSG9

€16G59

¢16989

TTSSS9

0TSSS9

606999

806599

L0SS59

906599

S0G68S9

LNTIIYM



00°FSE‘S
8€°900'FT
ZsTLLe
69°€ST
vy v0€E
06°¢6¢
9€°"1Ve6
00°G9
00°g¢
00°008°T
€V°G09 ‘0¢C
0g"¢eT
ST 9%
00°LL
19°920°T
0E"Z61
00°9S
00°¢e
BE'6VC
ST°LOT
86°0G6'T
€C°0GT

LNNORWY

AYES J0dd ¥HHLO

0d YONIW dTFIOLINORW
SHDIAYES AYANNYT
dNIEY H3d9Y¥0 dud
dX3/84dI14dNS HOTJJIO
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
SWHLI LINIVW YddHLO
SUITddNs TYOIAHEN

d¥X3 dDIJH0:I1O®.d
STYINHY YHHIO
AONYENSNI ALITIEVYSIA
GWIHEY JAIYO dHd
O0d/HOVW/NINI-SHIVddYd
GWNITY ALITILA ILNYNHL
AJOLNIANI HSHM

dWIHEY HdYO dHd
SdTHSYIIWIN/ SANA
GWINY ALITILAO INYNAL
AYHIS J0dd ¥HHLIO
STYLNIY JUHILO
XHO0LNHANT HSHM
HOIAYES AL dTEYO

NOILAIYOSHA

2y 0pS‘Zh = SENIT uxa ¥Od TULOL IOYd

YOLOITIOD XYL-YAUNSYHYL FONYIO JO ALNNOD
D17 "0°0°S°d
*ONI ‘SNEANIT WOLSND AEOVT
ATYAIOTD ‘SSHOTH
MNISOQANTE :¥dd ONI SASITMAMHING IANLNI dr
STYIDIAIO ONIQTIING YINJOAITYOD
*ONI ‘FHd
SI0NA0¥d FANIDS HWINO INIAAIAH
dd0d WAYTY 2Yd0dL
ONI SHOIAMIS Mdd
TO00 T90EP9 00 ANYAWOD AONYINSNI TIVANYLS
aoy¥ ‘YI¥OLOIA«
Xd0g OLOY NHATOD
XM0Hd  ‘NIANON
*ONI ‘HO¥NOSHYT
NYA¥E ‘SYTAN
¥ NALSIUM ‘SI¥N0MOvd
¥SIT YINOS ‘OIDNHISY
HLTH ANA/XONIOV TYYD HITYIEH D0 FONVHO JI0 AINAOD
*ONI ‘'0D0 HNOMHI-VY
ONI ‘ONI¥ALOVIANNYWN TYINZWANOMIANT THAHY
ALDTEIA
JOANTA

TYAOYAdY d04 TIODNAOD ALID OL JHLLIWANS SLNYHIVM

-
s
wn
(o]

™
=

nPage 320f 117
[Tp]
(o]

N
-
n
o

Tv8SS9

0v8SS9

6£95G9

B8E€GSG9

LESSGY

9€£G6GG9

GE€9GS9

PESSSO

£E£€GGS9

2€9569

TESSS9

0€6569

6C5999

8CSGG9

LTSSS9

9268559

GZS569

F2SG8S9

€265999

LNTIIYM



BETEVE
§87ESS
7S 197%
62°98T'C
¥Z°GL9 ‘06T
00°80T’T
GL"620'T
00"ELE'T
GZ EVE-
SLTTTIL
00°676
ScrLee-
00°¢9¢
00 ¢t
00°¢¢€
00°0T
00°80¢
00°00¢
00°0cV
00°LW9'T
00°0S¥'T
€0°0¢C6
€9°LT9
00°069°TT

Zr 969°zS
cvUeve'vy

LNNOWY

LNIWHOVYLLY UDYM

LNHWHOV.LLY dDWYM

LNANHOYLLY HOUM

LNIWHOYLIY HOUM

g0A dNd IV

AdIsdNS LNEY

AQISENS INUY
LNEWHDOVY.LLY HDOVM

AQISENS LNEY
LNANHOYLLY dOTYM

anNnady gHd

aNQddd LINTHd

aNAAdd LIWNdEd LOATH
aNQIYY LIWGdd 9a7Td
SIOTHLINOD AYIS-LNIVH
SLOYILNOD AY¥ES~LNIYH
ONINIVYL/NOILINL
SHHII NOILWILSIDHEA
TYINTY 1003 AAYEH

SLOYILNOD AYHES~LNIVH

SHOTAYIS ONIGEINIONA

AJIS DISNIHOA

NOILdIYEDSHa

88°2L0°L92 = SANIT wxu ¥0JI TYIOL HAOYL

856760086 # ESYD ILNNODOY 1¥0ddNS QTIIHD ANYTIAYYH
LHOITYMNIYM NONNYHS

TTIHOIW ‘SATONXHEM

LINN INAWASYNESIA FIYLIS YINJOIITYD

AVEING NOILNIANOD 3 HOLISIA AINNOD HDNYIO/WITHYNY

INAWIOYNYW Q¥O0T-ANVT 0/0 IEM-NAL ‘0¥

FLSITHED ‘NYWHHIMHOS

ONOYL NIL ‘OA

"ONI HI

*ONI ‘E¥VMIIOS AIAYNSOUDINW

"ONI TYLNINNOYIANT ONIWHTI

YILAYHD AITYO NYHHILINOS YMdWY

ALNNOD IDNTYHO A0 NOILVYIDOSSY SHYOLOHYIA DNINNVTA
ININAINDE QUVHYILE

¥NTMOT ‘ZIANYNYIH

*ONI YINJGOJAITYD NJIHHLAOS J0 SHOUYNOSHY ONIYIINIDNG

JOONHEA

TYAOYddY ¥04 TIONAOD ALID OL JELLINANS SLNYIYYM

ge 33 of 117

N
=

~
Fa
~N
=

9€9zM

GEoCM

reE9ZM

§65GS9

759569

€496859

¢565959

196959

096959

679599

BV¥SGG9

L¥SSS9

978SS9

SPSSS9

INYYIYM



ot

00°80T ‘T~

TO"€9L‘9

68°GT6 ‘209
00°969 'LVL

00°00G'TEG'T

00°000 ‘09

€S°V02 VY

LNNOWY

¥OLOFIIA HONVNIA - DNOS 4HOHm9¢%

%@

TTEVIIVAY FIY SANAE ANY ADOWMNOOVY ¥O0d dILIANY NHEE FAVH ‘6702 ‘Z ¥IHOLO0 TIDNNOD ALID HAOYD NIQYYD
FHL OIL QILLINGAS YHALSIOTI INVTIYYM FHL NI QIINISHEYd SY Gh9ZM - FEOZM SHYIM ANV GSGGG9 - Z6EGG9# SANVHAQ

» LOTTTI9'L6L’S

TYLOL TYNIA

EP"TL6'T6L'E

daIon 3 AEY

YINOD HAVO-NOISIA

IONTINSNI HLIVEH

O0OMW-dIM LYOdWI

AYIS J0d9d YEHLO

4T0D MOTIIM-HSYD

LNINAYd NOISNHd

NOILdI¥OSHEd

61/20/0T

JOHYHHL LNUWAYd d0Jd

= SHENIT uxas 404 TYLOL IOV

INIWIDYNYN QYOT-ANY'T O/D NIHD N¥d XOVHO

H4IM ADNIDY

NYTd HIOIAYAS NOISIA

WILSAS LNIWIYILHE ,SHIAOTAWHI OITdNd

IDTELSIA YHELYM ALNNOD HONWHO

ALTIOHLOY HYIA ALNNOD HONYHO

01T ‘INIWIADYNYW AT0D MOIMOTIIM

WNILSAS INIWNHIILHYE ,SEHAOTAWI OITHNd
JOdNEA

TYA0YddY Y04 TIDNNOCD ALID OL JHLLIWAANS SILNTHIYM

Page 34 of 117

602G59M

SvocCM

ProcM

€EV9cCM

ZvocCM

VoM

0v9cM

6€9¢M

LNTIIIM



£9°609‘9 = SANIT u». ¥0d TYIOL IODVL

N~
Y
62°86 SAITAdNS TYINMOLINYL _m
9% 08 SINYOIYENT/HAA/INIYd ™
9T %S9 ‘T SI¥¥d HAA YOLOW o
LO"ET9 STYDIWIHD A¥OLVYOdYT mm
96°2¥ HAII¥M qE1LLO9
42842 SHAIDILOASNI
€L°291 AYOINIANI HSHM TESLEFTOGZ-2€ LdHEd SHOIAYAS IIAHYD I0dAd AWOH £€96569
SINYYYYM dIOA Z9GG59-T9G6G6G9
€6°LE6'T
£6°99¢€ dXE/SFITddNS FOIAIO
g0"8%2'1 ONINIVYL/NOILINL
00°0GT SHEA NOIIVILSIOHY
00°06G SdIHSYIIWNINW/ SANd
00°6€ dXd 9LW/JANOD YHHILO
G6°€8 FONILSISHNS MNYE NOINA 096669
1876 SAdTHSYHIWAN/ SENA MNVE NOINN 6GGGG9
€F TI8C'T
06682 dX3/STI1TAANS FDIJIO
€6 18€ SINIOJIINA
00°0T9 HNINIYYL/NOILINL MNYE NOINN 866559
€F 002'T
£v°26¢ STYOIWIHD AMOLVYOHY'T
00°82ZL dX3 NOIIYONAHE ¥IHLO
00°08T d¥Xd 9IW/INOD YIHIO MNYd NOINA LGGSG9
SE'B6C'V
LZ°96T1 aood
00°0€S'T HNINIVIL/NOILINL
007021 SATHSYHIIWAN/ S3NA
80°25%‘¢C SNIDAOT MNYE NOINA 95GGS9
€9°LT9- QIOA ¥ ATY YNIYOT ‘ZHANYNIHH 9%5G6G9
b6 LLO- aIon 3 AFY TEGLEPTOGZ-ZE ILdEA SIEDIAMES IIQIUD 104TA HFWOH BEHSS9
SL 222- aIioA 3 AFY TEGLEPTOSZ-2E€ IdHA SADIAMES LIQHND 104dd HFWOH 827559
00°009- aion 3 ATy TYOSIJ:NIIY/ ‘AZd XIINAWWOD XIIMOHINY SNISNOH WIHAHYNY 800SG9
INONOWY NOILAI¥OSHAd JOANIA INTIIYM

6T/60/0T 'TYAOYdAY ¥Od TIDNNOD ALID OL JALLINENS SLNVIYYM



LY ¥9

00°0ve
8V 16V
00"rce

2117
09°L99
0%°609

Zv €09 ’'vI
96°06

pT €0¢

67 8%0'0CT

ZL E6L
6C°661
LE"BC

ZLT6TT L
8S5°6¢
€9°p¢E
86 6¢CL
€T LT
A7)
0L"v08
06 "vED
6L CTL
6C"LZC
67 80¢
L9°589
9L"¢8T
IR ARANN
ST1°66G
T9°L8T

LNOOWY

SHEITddNS A0¥d YIHLO

dIN0F INOHAITHL
SUDIAYES ONIMYOMLUN
SLOVILNOD A¥ES-INIYH

TdNd TISIIA/SYD AW
TINA TISEIA/SYD AW
TINd TISIIA/SYD AW
SYdddad/ ANOHdATHEL
HTgYD

SYD TYINLYN

ALIDIYLOETH

SYHdddd/ INOHddTHL
SYdIddHE/ SUNOHdITHL

SWILI INIVW YUHLO

8HITddNS LSNOD YHHILO
XMNOSYN/ SEIVOHIDOY
TIYMAIYH

STYLEN/TUIM

VIINAT

0d/STO0L YONIW YAHIO
SEIT4ANS/0d ALIIVS
871001 FS0ddnd NID
0F/NdnNd FOIJJIO JONIW
dX"/SEITddNS ADIAI0
SWALI INIYW YAHLO
9IS JAYYI-ddNS INIVW
SHONYNIIMNIAY/SAITd
S¥ITddNS/dInd3 ATHSH
SHITddNS TYOIHLOATH

NOILdIYOSHd

GL"69L'PPT = SENIT uxu ¥OI TYIOL FOVYJ

6T1/60/0T

JINY" NOINN

JINYE NOINN

JINVYE NOINN

JINYd NOINN

YT-SSUTHIIM NOZIYHA

HTEYO dUNYYM dWIL

00 S¥D 4AITYO 0§

0D NOSIOH JAITYO OS

LNTIHIYM dIOA

SNOILYDINNWROD ¥HILNOYA

*ONI ‘¥0ds

AYIS DNIAIYLS ALNNOD HONTIO

JOONHIA

TYAO¥ddY d04 TIDNNOD ALID OL JHLLIWENS SLNTIIYM

ge 36 of 117

un
™~
[Tp]
n
1p]
Pa

PLSSS9

£L5GG9

¢LSSS9

TLSGS9

0LGSS9

695669

8964699

L9GG5S99

996499

§9G64669

796669

LNYIIYM



00°0TT
0L 9%
00°002'¢€
G8°T60'T
6T°L8T'T
00°9%¢
89 "€GL
T6°20¢
00°9¢s
00"TSE'T
00°09T
00°0G8G‘Z
00°0S¥
00°8SE'TT
22°G6S'T
97" Qs
GZ°GGe'T
LE BT
9€°¥¥0’€E
86" V9
G9°9FE
VL TC
G8°¥6C'T
P6°TT

§c vee

LNNOWY

ONINIVYL/NOILINL
ddns I7IND/0dd ¥IHLO
SHDIAYES TYDIAIW
SWHLI LNIYW ddHLO
TIYMLIOS

HONYAQY THAYHL
0d/STO0L ¥ONIW ¥IHLO
AYOLNIANI HSHM

AYHES J40dd d9UHIO
SLOYYINCD AYHS-ILNIVA
UONYAAY THATHL
SUDIAYYIS TYOIAHERW

34 dSNI ALITIHOW
AYIS Q¥¥ND ONISSOHD
SIYYd HIA YOLOW
dXd/8dITddNs HADIAI0
AYIS J40dd ¥HEHIO
SWALI LNIYW dHHILO
0d/STO0L JONIW MIHLO
dIN0d/NdNd YONIW
dX3/8dITddNS HOIAJI0
TIYMIAOS

SUITAdNS SONINHOMLIN

SHdOTIANE/ IV

NOILdIYOSHd

66 0TV ‘62 = SANIT wxu Y04 TYIOL HDVYL

ISY¥D
ATdd0S SONIATEM NOYIWYD

ONI AWOLOGETHd OJISNFTIOd AITYD

*ONI STYINALYW ANITHEIId STIEAM D

ONI INAWNIHTAOD-MAD

O QYYHOIY ‘OTIIdNd«

*ONI ‘STTIANMOY¥E

OTT TYDIAIW FEMI dNNOH™

SAIINYd ATILAEY SAIM ¥Ydd ONI S¥ED0M Mg

ONINVATO MOANIM WYHONIWMIE ANOHLNY

AY ‘XFE«

WAINED TYIIQEN TYNOIOHY WIHHYNY

TYOSIA :NILY/ *AZd ALINAWWOD AII¥OHIAY DNISNOH WIZHVNY
*ONI ‘SADIAYAS INIWIDYNYW ALID TIY

*ONI ¥AINAD NAQIYD ANV NMYT S.NYIY

*ONI SHIDALVYLIS ONIOWWI AFIONYAQY SIY

SHOIANES FONYITAWOD XTdWID YEd ONI SHDIAMIS HONVITAWOD WOV

TESLERPTOGC-2E LdHEA SHDIAYES LIAHID LO4dHAd HWOH

JOdNIA

6T/60/0T 'I¥YA0¥ddY ¥0d TIDNAOD ALID OL (ULLIWGNS SLNYTIITYM

065559
685559
885559
LBSGSY
985559
$855S9
785659
£85559
285559
185669
085559
65559
8L5569
LLSGS9

9L9GS59

LNTIIYM



€V L8
00°29¥
00°v6S
71 968°T
€9 2L
88°G00°T
£9°618
29°L08’S
00°00€E ‘€
00°9%€E
G9°9ET'S
00°989°T
00°9VvE
00°080°T
¥6°L66'T
00°GvL‘Z
ZG°6LT'C
00°0TT
87°0GT’€E
GT"€96'T
EE"LBT'T
0S°GLV '€
00°056

Py 8ET

LNNOWY

dXH3/SHEITddNS dADIAJO0
SIWICAINN

LNIVW JTOIHIA ¥OLOW
SWALI LNIVW ddHLO
SEONUYNZLINGdY/SEAId
LIOINNWNOD MYOMLEN
dSYUT d0 HTOIHUA
dodd TYdd J0 INIVRW
IONYAQY TIATHL
NOILINNWAY/SNND
SLOYILNOD AYHES-LNIVR
HONVAQY TEAVHL

gWIHY LSNYL JEW
NOILINNWWY/SNND

AJES JA0¥d ¥HHIO

AYIS J40dd dUHILO
gWIEY LSNUL J3W
SHITAANS TYOIYLOETH
0F/HOYW/NINI-S4I¥ddd
SWALI ILNIVW dHHLO
SLOYILNOD AYMIES-LINIVIW
JONVAAY THAVHL

NOILdIYOSHd

6T/60/0T

ZL°98S ‘GE

SHUNIT 4xu 904 TIYIOL UOWd

ONI ‘"DI¥ dWYIS ¥I€dNd ¥VLSIAII
ONI OSNILNIYd NIIUDS S.O0NYNJHA

TIVLEId OLOWY JAISNTOXH

*ONI ‘SI0Nd0¥d NOILVOIHYI SNIMA
SONTITTIIE YHIWOLSAD ONI LWOW LIEHTI HSTIdHYILNI
OWA

VINY ‘VIIvd~Tdx

*ONI ‘SESTHJYIING AHTO0d

SUDIAYHS TVLNINNOIIANT ANOWYIQ

¥ SYWOHIL ‘T¥vdx

NYI¥dg ‘NOLTYd«

T126%€ ILdEd SNOS ¥ SILMNO'N"T

¥00d ¥AOA IV D711 ‘JAISHIND WM

*ONI ‘NOILAIYOSNVYL SILYIDOSSY 3 NOID

FITAL ‘NOLLOD =«

*ONI ‘NOS ® YAOQHO0D

ONILLAD dLIAIINOD TY.LNINILNOD
*ONI ‘TAYOSANYT “D°D

OZNTY ‘FEWNHD +

JOaNIA

TYAOYddY ¥O0d TIONNOD XLID OL JILLIWENS SLINTIUYYM

0T95S9

609659

809599

L099S9

909659

G09669

7094699

£09599

¢094999

109659

0094959

666599

869599

L6GSS9

965959

565569

766599

LNVIIYM



£€0°G9
6L°CTIG'T
00°6T
69°006
0T1°L6S
G9°LT16
8L LVT
L8769L
€TV

€6 °LFS
8E T8V
00°€Le
€9°LT9
00°08%
00°0L8
LL"90€E'T
SG°66S
007000V
08°267‘8¢E
€E"€28'6
LY 699’82
9T"L8
60°G¢

L0 29
00°00L‘€E
[AVER %]

LNNOWY

SALLISSYD/SdNS/S300d

SUITddNS TYIYOLINYL
SLOYILNOD AYES-LNIVA
XJOLNEANI dSHM

0d/STO0L YONIW ¥IHLO
SWELI INIVYW dHHLO
SId¥d HIA ¥OLOW
gWIEY LSNYL JEA
STYDIWIRD AYOLYIOLY'T
TIYMILICS

SLOYYIINOD AYES-INIVW
ONINIVEL/NOILINL
INTY WOOY/95d71d/dNVT
JYYMLIOS

INTd WOO¥/O9ATd/dNY'I
JIYEHY XYL

AYHS TTIO0D dSNddEd
TSdSIA 99 #Nd IWY

TIYMAAYH
SINYDIYENT/HXd/INIYd
AYHAS J0dd ¥HHIO
SEITdANS ¥YDY YHHLO

NOILdI¥0SHEd

P8 °8E0 ‘PGS = SENIT wxu ¥O0d TYIOL FOVd

TIDNNOD HA0D TUYNOILUYNYALNI OOI

Odd LOdHEd FWOH HHL

ONI HJA¥S ¥ MDOO0T sodd S.TIIH

ISNOHIYYM WIANALSYH OOTTIH

ANY9 ‘' ZIANYNIEH

ONI ANYdRWOD HOVH

SWALSAS OTYH NIHIED

SNEHHDS ¥ SSYID INNODSIA S.NIHID

YIINHD ONINIVEL FOILSAL TUYNIWIYND dOETIOD LSEM NIJTOD
ONI SHUTIVEL dDIJJ0 NIAATOD

*ONI ODYuvdTIID

LSIA TOOHDOS AEIAINA HACHYD NUQYYD

NYSSIN HAOYD NIQYYD VEd d7T ‘NYSSIN FAO0YD NIQUYD

07T ‘YINYOAITYD NYFHLAOS J0 SHOIAYAS HLSYM DITdNdHYd

SINIVd HIZYYd ¥9d 00 SWYITIIM-NIMYEYHS HHL
arT ‘DNILTIASNOD NOSIYYOW HALSOL
*ONI ‘¥YNIOD Z€ SYHMOTI

JOANTA

6T/60/0T I¥AOYddVY ¥Od TIDONNOD ALID OL AULLIWENS SINTUYYM

696§

Page %9 of 117

8C¢9S5G9

L295699

929659

6294969

7295469

€29699

2295969

129999

02949499

619669

819699

LT9GS9

9T9GS9

§T966G9

PT9699

£€196G9

LNTIITM



Py 8ET
T9°LZ5'82C
9L V¥
0T"20L
FPBET
8C°569
Pz e9v
00°9%¢E
00799
60°889
0006
A
TT°0EV
PO LTT
¥8 GEL
00°GLT
66°666'T
LT'0ST'T
00°00L’T
9¢"G11
00°80S
067298
00°0LC
91°808'%

LNOOWY

HONVAQY TUAVEL
SLOYILNOD A¥IS-LNIVIW
SILYYd HHIA HOLORW
AYIS J40d9d ddHLO
JONYAQY THAVIL
SHOIAYYIS YOLONILSNI
SIWNIOAINO

JONVAQY THATIL
S311ddNS/04d ALAIYS
aood

dXd OIW/JINOD YIHIO
ONIDAOT

GWIHY UDYATIW

SIYYd HIA JOLOW
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
NOILINNWWY/SNOD
SWHLI LNIVW dHHLO
AY¥IS J0dd YHHLO
SHOIAYHES YOLONILSNI
LIOLNIANI HSHM
SWALI LNIVW ddHLO
SAIHSYAIWIN/ SdNd
ONIDAOT

NOILAI¥0S4dd

61/60/0T

88 €ET VP

= SHUNIT wxus ¥OJd TYLOL HDYd

NOSYL ‘O¥OR~

OTT INIYW DQTd SINYHOUIEW

0D A1ddNS WYYO-UALSYW OW

OTT D20 STYINIY dWAL OIDVH

OIM¥TLOY ‘YONHOVN«

YNMYA ‘9IMdnT

SYOTIVIL A0¥/YALSYWIHIYYAND/STIVO DTT ‘STIVD
SATIVHD ‘¥ATAIOT«

‘ONI ‘WODEIIT

H ANYL ‘TET«x

*ONI ‘SI0Ndo¥d NOSMY'T

OTT ‘{SITT) SNOIINTOS ONINVHEI ININIOUOAINIT MVY'I
X1ddns FDITO4 NOILOY "O°1

ATIYAIZOTE SINNODDOY "ONI ‘SHALSXS JHONM
0IGNLS NATYD WEIM

IIVd ‘INAM

¥Edvd XTTEN

ONIQTAM M ® £ Bdp d NHOL ‘9399094
NOIIVYIDOSSY AUM J0 IHOIY TYNOIIYNWHINI
OSYOIHD THIOH TYINANIINODYHINI

HOONEA

TYAO¥ddY ¥0Jd TIONNOD ALID OL JALLIWGNS SINTIYYM

979969

§¥9G59

P¥9599

£79GS99

Z¥949G9

794869

0¥9SS9

6£96G9

8€95G9

LESSSY

9€9659

G€96S9

7€9599

£€9G669

CE€9SS9

T€94999

0€99G9

LNTIIYM



00°00S ‘¥
8V 8%
PST6LC
007091
00°88€°C
00°008
88°0LT
00°G6T'T
v e6E ‘T
8G°90¥-
00°008°C
00°¢6Ss
00°2v6'T12C
00°0vc
90°0GG ‘¥
9€°697'C
0L°080'C
cL 0S¢E
£€9°681
60°G9T
LL"IGE'Y
G8°LE

71°G98°C

08°0¢

LNNOWY

SHOIAYYES TYOIAHEN

SWIOAINO

ONIL¥DITdNd

JONVAQY THATYL

AYHES J40¥d ¥HHLO

SUDIAYES TYOIAUN

SHITddNS ANOD ¥IV

SLY¥d HEA YOLOW

ANOATY JHLYM

aNAIdY LISOddd

SIYYd HIA dOLOW

A¥IS d40dd Y¥YEHLO

ONISILIHIAQY

SWALI LNIVW ¥¥HLO
SLOYYLNOD AYES-LNIVH

ONILYDOITdNd
ONISILYEAAY
SWELI LNIVW ¥HHLO
SWALI LNIVW YHEHLO

dXd/8dITddNS FOIAJA0

STYINIY ¥EHIO

NOILATYDSHd

99°8FE ‘9 = SANIT .xu 90 TYIOL EOVJ

N¥SNS ‘°d’Hd ‘Q904dITO-FXYS

SNOILYOINQWAOD dAd

SOIHAYYDOMdEY dg¥S ONI d€vS

NHOL ‘SATONAHY«

ONI ‘IEMOIL YIWd

ANTA¥I I¥ YIN¥OJIITYD A0 ALISYIAINN FHI J0 SINIDHH
¥OINEI¥LSIA SAITAANS NOILVMEDIUAHY

AJIISTOHdN WOLSND §,1dvd

‘ONI ‘ONI¥IINIONT SNINYd
SWALSAS YILYM TYIVILSNANI DIJIOWd
*ONI ‘IONUYNILNIVW EJYDOSANYT dOOMMYVd

LHM'ANI ‘NOO

*ONI ‘SHEDIAYIES TYLNIWNOYIANI HNTE NYIDO

01T ‘SNOILNTIOS INIWNDO0A OV
ANYdWOD HTHON "L ¥

ONIFWNTd YIVOVIN

ONI ‘10dd3a dDIAd0

INYIYYM dIOA

STYLNIY NOILONYLSNOD TUYNOILEN

JOONEA

6T/60/0T 'TYAOEddY ¥OJd TIDNANOD ALID OL AULLINENS SINYHAYM

§99669

799659

£€99669

299669

199669

099649

699659

869669

LS95499

969669

§G696G9

759699

£696G6469

¢596499

169689

0694659

LNYIIYM



GZ 6LL'T
6T LVL'T
00°00S
6E°LIS'T
00°G6¢€
TO0°LT8
¢S vee
6L°8ZT'T
PT TIL'C
007006
00°08S
00°00§5'22Z
G9°686'T
2z 88L
€T 6LY
00" 2oV
0T 8LL
9€°6LY IS
€8 TLY
G8°989'T
06°€8¢
99°90¢

INNOWY

XJOLNIANI {ISHM
S1ONao¥d LTYHdSY
HILYEHY XYL

SWAILI INIVW d9dHLO
ONINIVIL/NOILINL
SUDIAYHES XYANNVT
SWILI LNIVW ddHIO
SWJOAINA

STYOIWIHD AdOLYIOHY']
AYAS J0¥d ¥IHLO
AYES J0¥d YHUHLO
YILYHEd XYL
SdTHSYIIWIN/ SINA
SHOIAYES ONIFHLYD
SHAIDILOUSNI

AYES J0¥d YHHLO
SHEAL

TINA TISATA/SYD AW
SIOVALNOD AYIS-LNIVH
SI¥Y¥d HIA HOLOR
A¥IS J40¥d ¥UHLIO
S¥ITddNs/0d ALEAVS

NOILAIYOSHd

Ph 90€‘26 = SANIT wxu ¥Od TYLOL ADVA

HHONITED
NOISIAIQ NYULSHM ANVAWOD STVIYHLYWN NYOTOA
HAOYD NHAYYO J0 NIDYMSHTOA
LLOFE IdAA °"ONI ‘SWHISXS ¥MIMOd ATTTIYA
TIVEYddd®d ¥ed D011 ‘SWILSAS TYDILOYL QHIINA
d¥0D LSYIAINN
YINJOAITYD NYHHLNOS J0 IVHTIV HDIAYES dNNOEDIIANN
*dd0D dYOWYY °"S§°N
MOOEENTH ¥SN-ALT HONUYNILNIVW SHUILITIOVA ATddNS dH
*ONI ‘SEIDOTONHOEL ¥ITAL
SSUYdXd ALYYd NIVYL
HIOV¥Td YIOAOL ¥dd HAOYD NIAJYYD 40 WIOAOL
YILNID ILNIWAYd LSIM O/0 LSHM -SYILNAY NOSWOHL
0d€ 1Id SINOL QUVHOIW ¥€d "ONI TIM-XJAL
ONI ‘S1DNao¥dd ALIVIDEdS IADYYL
OTT NOIY¥HdNS
"dd0D AYHSUNN HONYWIOAdHd
ANYAWOD TIO SUILNNOD NYHHLAOCS
OTT NOILISINOOY OFIT SNOIILNTOS INIWAINDE TUYD LUYKWS
99 J0 IITOYAHHD NOSJRWIS
*ONI ‘TIVIINIAIINOD AHYHS
YIYALIOHS
JOONEA

TYAQYddY ¥0d TIDONNOD ALID OL CQIILLIWANS SINTIYYM

L89G6S99

989659

G89G6G9

789699

£89699

289659

1895969

089599

6L96G59

BL9GS9

LL9GS9

9L94S9

GL9SS9

7L9SS9

€L9599

ZL9G99

TL9SS9

0L9SS9

699659

LNV M



00°¢Te
00°Le
00°¥S
00°0v
[AR A
oc ot
00°¢t
0870

ce 81T
G9TELL
2925’6
09°S¥0 ‘T
€8°891°GZ
Ly 998'T
00706L
6L°C9¢€
00°09¢€
GLTE0S L
£6°19¢€
vO° 1V
68°0C¢
v6°G0V ‘S
LL"°6
G8°€08°T
GC VLS
6€°9TC
gEpec

LNNOWY

NOILVLIO Hd¥D TUYWINY
IONIATE ONISNIADIT
ANNIATT ONISNADI'T

aNQdHY Hdd

aNQE¥d LIWGHd

aNAATY JHd

d3d HIYLS AYSYSH
aNNAEY LINYdEd 9dTd
SUITddNS TYDIIYLOATH
SHDIAYIS ONIYEINIONY
SHITddNS d0¥Yd ¥dHLO
SLOVILNOD AYHAS-LNIYAW
TaNd TISTIA/SYD AR
SESNIDIT/SEXYL
AdOLNIANI HSHM
STYOIWIHO AYOLVHOHY'T
AYIS JA0¥d ¥IHLO

SUITddNS TYOIYdLOHETH
SUITddNS TYIYOLINYL

SHITddNS/0d ALIAVS
STOOL dS0d¥Nd NID
SWILI LNIVW ¥¥HLO

SHONYNILINAJY/STIId
SHITddNS TY¥OIdLOETd

NOILAIYOSHA

€€ 6E9'ES = SHNIT .x. ¥Od TYLOL FOY]

AIYEYD ‘SEUHID
HNONHD ‘NY0d
XONYS ‘NYOd

¥OINOYHA ‘¥IAITIOL-XOYIAET

¥NITE ‘NANYS

JOIAYES ANV SHTYS SNIWWND

*ONI ‘ONI¥IINIONT STIOS dILYIDOSSY

OTT ‘ANVII¥YIVS

ONI ALITIHOW SNUWIEIS

0S4 SSHYdXHE LHOIYM ¥dd MNVd XHM

*ONI ‘NOIIVANANOZ HOUYISHY ALISYIAINA AMONINIEM NIILSEM
AT1ddNS XYVYLINUYS HIXUYM

‘ONI ‘SEIDOTONHOFL ANITUEIYM

ANYAWOD SNITTIOO ¥dd SUHLVYIDOSSY ¥ SNITTOD NIYIYM

OIYLOETE HATYSHETIOHM SYHLTYM

JOUNHA

6T/60/0T TYA0YddVY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OL QILLINANS SINTIUYM

€0L9S9

¢0LSS9

TOLSSO

00LSG9

669659

869559

L69GS9

969659

§69GG9

769659

£69599

269699

169669

LNYIIYM



SUNIT wxa 904 TYLOL HIVd

~
m
T6°8S0'T SI¥Yd HYA JOIOW SI¥Yd OILNY ATTIIHY,O PZLSSH
(0]
Z6°559 9IS AIVYL-4dNS INIYH ONI SNSIS ANV ALEJAYS DIJAVIL FATIMALYIS mmpmmmw
00°005°2 HOYNd ¥ALAJWOD TAWH 1099 ‘YAXET AARL)
00°05¢ SANNAFY LIS0dHd asnoao TZLGS9
00°06GT SADIAYIAS DNI¥ALYD YIHIVAH A9 SHEMYD AYM ¥N0X 0ZLSS9
00°GEL SATHSHAGWAN/ SANA SY¥dD ALAIDOS NOIIVIMOEY % Md¥d JAITYO 6TLGS9
T6°96€°C HO¥MNd ¥ALAJWOD TAWH MNVEd ‘¥S0¥ YT Fd« BTLSSY
00°0F8 SdTHSYAAWAN/ SENA Y049 LTLSS9
SV pST'L SLOTIINOD AYIS-INIYW OTT SMYOMIASSY ONI ‘dNo¥d F¥YMIIOS HZHEAVEL 9TLGS9
16°0T ddns I71n5/209d ¥AHIO ONI dAIMJTHOM S3S GTLGS9
0L"TIZ'T
0S"Z8L ONIDAOT
0Z°GT¥ NOIIYIMOdSNYEL ¥/S/1
00" %1 A¥ES J0¥d ¥AHIO dNOYDILID% MNVLEILIO PTLSSY
Zv°GE9 SI¥Yd HIA YOIOW LOT6ET NIE 0D SI¥Yd ¥OIOW Xd0IOVd €TLSS9
LY 16S°2 SHEd YHHIO/SLIIWYEJ FDIAI0 DIOV'SOAS NIWAY J0 AIQ NOIIVAYHSNOD I0 INIWIIAVAEA ZTLGS9
¥0°8¥%S
961522~ aNQAFEY YALYM
00°008°c aNndEd 1IS0dHEd ONI NOILDNYLSNOD “€°9 TTLSS9
687608 SEITAANS ANOD ¥IY INOD NOIINTTIOd ® NOILYYITIIA YIY °'ONI ‘ANYAWOD NMYH "T°d 0TLGGO
00°00S SANAATY LIS0ddd ¥Iany¥Id ‘snsEL 60L5G9
00°000°T SANNAFY 1IS0dHd YANTYE ‘ZEANILIVA 80LSG9
00°00§ SANNAFTY 1ISOddd OIAYIDO ‘Z¥Id LOLSGSY
00°02T NOIIVLID HYYD TYWINY OI¥E ‘FAOT 90LGG9
LNOOWY NOTILAI¥DSHA HOaNIA INTIIYM

6T/60/0T TYA0YAdY 904 TIDNANOD ALID OL JHULLIWENS SINYIIYM



11

91°01Z‘8 A¥ES J0¥d YEHIO
T6°€ETT TONYAQY TAATEL
T1°8T¥% ¥AdAAE/ANOHd TTHAD
007008 SLOYIINOD AYAS-INIVKH
00°00€‘8T A¥IS J0¥d ¥IHIO
007008 A¥AS J0¥d JIHIO
00°z€8 £OQ-d3d NYDISTAIT
0Z°vE0‘T

08°69L- aNQATY YAIYM
00°008°2 aNnaEy LIS0dHd
00°0%S AYAS d0¥d ¥HAHLO
09" LES Od/HOYN/NENI-SUIVdTd
00°02S SdTHSYILAWAN/ SENA
ST LP6 ‘9T INEY WO0Y/95a71€/dNVT
GL T6L'E SHII YHHIO/SLIWIHd
T9 968 STYOIWIHD A¥OIVIOdY'T
0G°L96°T AYES I0¥d JIHIO
00°00€ ONINIVYIL/NOILINL
86 "Z0€E SWELI INIVH ¥HHIO
O TLY AYIS A0¥d YHHIO
0Z°0EV SELLASSYD/SENS/SM00d
SV 96S'T XHOINIANI HESHM
00°18€ XJOLNIANI HASHM

LNNOWY NOILAI¥DSHA

99°0GT‘09 = SHANIT ,x. ¥0d TYIOL IDYd

OTT ‘SINYITINSNOD HIIH
¥ALAd TANMNAM

SYTODIN ‘HIISH«

OTT ‘SNOILATOS ANYHHOD
*ONI ‘ONILTINSNOD ¥HAYHOS
*ONI INEWNIVIMALNA DIOVH

Ld3d ONI¥HIHSYO/ONILINAODDY FDILSNL A0 INIWLIYJEAd

ANITAdId LLITISOHS
SY0SIAQY XIITYLIIASOH TIH ¥€d °"ONI ‘SY0SIAQY TILOH 'TLH
ONI YDIAY¥EAS SHATYS NOSTENDIS
dTHSYIGWIN NHYO
SHTIIYHEd0dd 1T
HITH ANY/ADNIOY FUYD HITIYEH J0 HONWIO A0 ALNNOD
SHDIAYYS ¥YULYM OTd-L-4AVYS
OTT SNOILNTIOS 94
JHINID ONINIWTIL O0AF-dSHdS
*ONI ¥Sn ‘TIJAWYD
SLOYYLNOD-LdHd DNIINNODOY :NILIY "ONI ‘dNo¥d ¥¥LsS0oDd
€0G800T ONI LNIWIOUNYW YI¥d ASITY SIXUNSIXJT
ANYdWOO ODNILVIHdO AILIYHA
ONI ZATddNS YUTANIYdS TVI¥YHdRNI
JOdNHA

6T1/60/0T TYAOYddY 904 TIDNNOD ALID OL JALLIWEAS SLNTIHYM

¢V LSS9

T7LGG9

0vLSS9

6ELSSY

8€L599

LELSSS

9€LSS9

GELGS9

PELSSO

£E€LGG9

CELSSY

TELGGY

0€LGS9

6CLSS9

BZLSSO

LZLSS9

92LSS9

GZLSSYO

LNYIYYM



[4"

00°GEY
00 oL
L6°6C
69°0FT
00°€80°C
06°€E

Py EB6 'Y
00°2Zv6
08°0TC'T
8L ZSL
¢0°89¥%
BE'GTE
v Lz0'e
¥ 6vC’I
00"8LL
0L 6¥9 'V
967699
06 Vet
00°006
00°9¢S
00°0S
08°€09'T
L9°G6Z'67

00°G0S ‘T

EINNOWY

SAdTHSYAIWIN/ SENad
SdTHSIIENIN/ SENA
SWILI do0d ¥HHIO
SHOIAYYUS AMANNYT
AdHES J0dd ¥HEHIO
SEONYNIALINAIY/SHIId
SIYdYd HIA ¥OLOW
ddns IINd/2dd YHHIO
SLY¥Yd HIA YOLOW
O"/HOYW/NINI-SITVdAd
ONILNIYd

dIn0d/Ndnd HONIRW
dXd/SHdITddNs IDIJAJO
SIWJOAINN

LOINAQNNOD MYOMLIN
TIYMIIOS

AYES J40dd dUHLO
aood

aNnAdd HHd

NYHISSYd ¥AY dILVLS
SHOTIAYHES dUTIVL
AMIS J40dd dHHLO

NOILdIYOSHd

G6°¥98'TL =

SUNIT wxw d04 TVIOL HO¥d

¥odD

¥ATAL ‘NHYISIER

SNOSILYILTY

*ONI ‘SNENIT WOLSND XIDVT

OvdLYvYO

0D X1ddns % ddId TTdd ¥dd dNO¥O X1ddNS Sdd
OLNY YHET ¥dd ONI THWWOLS

SWIYH YAUNYL

NIISAL d90d NOIL¥NOLOY

SYHLNIYd dHAYN

ASNOHIYYM YHALNIWOD NITHLNOS
20 ‘SWIOJIINN INOLSAHM ONI ‘SWHOJIINN Zd¥D

D11 ‘SHDIAYES LANYEINI NYDTYIRWY

SNOILATOS NOIIVWMOANI :NILIV¥ OTT ‘SNOILANTOS DIDOTIEOD

NOSYULAd HLILEVZITHE

HNAOH ¥YNIN

SQYOOHY 3 FIONUYNIJ A0 TTIYH YIAYOOHTY MYETO ALNANOD HONTHO

98TT €S :NLILV IDILIHOWY HIVLS HHL A0 NOISIAIA

YETTOMINOD :NLIY "ONI ‘dno¥d 0D FHIL
ONI ‘SIEIVOLVIOLVT TIVASINYL

HOANEA

6T/60/0T TIYA0EddY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OI AALLIWAANS SLNYIUYM

291599

T9LSSS

09L6G9

65LGS9

8SLSGS9

LSLSS9

9G6L6S9

GG6LSG9

PSLSSO

£GLGSS

2G9LSS9

TGLSGO

0GLSS9

67L9G9

B¥LSS9

LYLSS9

9% L9S9

LNTIIYM



€0°0TZ‘0Z = SANIT uxu dOd 'TYIOL IOV

=

67 8% aNNIHY TIIE DONISOTD HHLYM YTIONY ‘SHAXHT 3 MIYANY ‘SHNI hwhmﬁm
28 ve aNNAdTY TTId ONISOTO ¥YdLEYM HNVYHM ‘Ov¥d wwhmmMW
©

00°€ aNN3TY TTI9 ONISOTO ¥ILEYM IHN ‘OA mmhmﬁw
LZ 1€ aNAAEY TTI9 ONISOTO dILYM XTIT 'HNIQ ¥8LG9S9
287891 aNOddd TTI9 ONISOTO dHLYM SNSAL ‘YIVKW €8L999
8° 9T aNNJdHY TTIIE ONISOTO YULVYM ONAL ‘3T 28LGS9
P0°LE ANQATY TTId DONISOTD ¥dLYM IVHY ‘NHIANON T8LGS9
80°¢CT ONOATY TTIE ONISOTO ¥YILEYM MMV ‘ETIIANOD OW 08LGS9
[ANEAAA aNAddY TTI9 ONISOTD ¥HLYM OTT NVWIYX NOA ¥ELXHJ 6LL5G9
78769 aNNAEY TTI9 ONISOTO duLYM MAHINY ‘NYITIRIIN 8LLGSY
P1°L8T ANQdEY TTIId ONISOTO HILVYM a M¥¥W ‘X00 LLLSSO
T2 €€ aNAAHEY TII9 ONISOTD dULUYM LIYW ‘TIIMODR 9LLSSY
00°006 dXd NOILVYONAH ¥HIHILO dNo¥d ONILTNSNOD JOOMIAWYA SLLGSY
88°78T SWHILI LNIVW ¥HHILO ONI NOILYDIYgvYd JULINA PLLGG9
00°0¢€¢ SILOYYLNOD AYIS—-LNIVYW “ONI TYLNINNOYIANHT ONIWITI €LLSGY
oL-ozL'z d34d dI¥.LS d9SYSd NOISSTWWOD SAQYYANY.LS ONIATING YINYOJAITYD ZLLSSY
€L°899°C OIS JdVdlL-ddNS ILNIVRW ONI 0D ATddNs diLr TLLGSO
0z°'soL’'T AJOLNIANT HSHM A1ddNS HONUYNZINIVW ALSYIO °"ONI ‘RESYID ¥ QI¥M 0LLSS9
Z9°TLS STTYOIWEHD A¥O0LYd0dY'T OTT ‘SY0INEIYISIA HDUNOSINO 69L599
06" LET AYES J40dd ¥HEHLO SLOYYINOD -IdHd DNILNODOY :NLLV LINJOOT 89.L9G9
00°00€ AdIS JA0¥d YHHLO ALIYNDES 3 ANNOS S.'1TId L9LGGSY
9L°258'6 SLOYILINOD AYIS-LNIVH SHIDOTONHOHL IOIAIO T¥D0S:¥dd ONI ‘SIONA0¥d AdOD EMRW 99L669
LNNOWY NOILdIYOSHd JOdNEA LNYIHYM

6T/60/0T 'TYAO¥AdY ¥0d TIDNNOD ALID OL JALLIWENS SINVIYYM



9€"€E€T'T = SENIT x4 YOI TYLOL FDYd

00°0L ANAAYY TTIE DNISOTO ¥dLVM Q¥VYHOI¥ ‘HIIWS mommm%
Q09 aNAAHY TTIE DNISOTO YILYM ATINE ‘NIXNON mommmww
868V aNnddy TII9 ONISOTO YALUM NYOL ‘NIXNON hommm@nua
FE V6 . aNNAEY TIIF ONISOTD ddLUYM ONOH ‘NIANON 908559
89°61 NIy 'TTIE DNISOTO YHIVM gNH 'ONONYL §08599
0¢°99 aNAATT TTIE ONISOTO ¥ALYM TIN0OVY ‘YAOSVHD 708559
¥c vs ANNAEY TII9 ONISOTO ¥ALYM IMYMILS ‘MYINdWILS €08G6499
oL" LY aNaQddayd TII9 ONISOTD YILYM SAYY0L GY¥HOIY ‘ONOATINRW 2085699
G9°1Tv ANAAEY TIIF ONISOTD YHLYM N HNY ‘NOL 108599
G0°60T aNQIEY TTIE ONISOTO ddLUYM NYW ‘NEANON 008659
7O TL aNAddy TII9 DONISOTD YILEM NYI¥g ‘9HNONd 66L5G9
9L° 0¥ aNQdEY TIIE ONISOTD YdLYM NIWYCONEE ‘NIXOON 86L999
BZ VE aNNIEY TTIE DNISOTO dHLYM :tctale): R elcict: L6LSS9
S8°G€E ANAJEY TT1Id ONISOTID ddLYM ANNILC 'HNXOH 96L652
SL VL aNnddy TII9 ONISOTO YdLYM HNIT ‘In€g G6.L5G9
BT EE aNNddEy TTIE DONISOTO ¥ALYM ONNH ‘NIXNON 76,959
6C°ETT dNNIBY TTI9 ONISOTID YdIUYM AILYY ‘YIHIRW £€6LG99
287 LS aNaddyd TIIE ONISOTO ¥YILUYM NHOC ‘NMYYLS 26L5S9
§9°vE aNAAETY TTIE DONISOTO ¥ALYM Ag9aadgc ‘OH T6L599
6G6°2S aNOAdIY TTI9 DNISOTO HIALYM X¥93adarc ‘OH 06L5S9
80°8¥ dNNIEY T1I9d ONISOTID YHLUM I SINYL ‘NOLHODNOH 68L599
2878V ONNATY TTIE DONISOTO HALYM a¥ ‘' ITYMNITED 88LGS9

LNNOWY NOILdIdOSHEd JOANIEA LINVIIYM

6T/60/0T 'IYA0YAdY ¥YOd TIDONNOD ALID OL JQULLIWHAS SINTIUTM



ST

Page 49 of 117

dOLOHYId HONYNIA - DNOS YIDIMLY,

C@hﬁ

AOEYIHL LNIWAYd ¥0Jd

FTIYTITIVAY F¥Y SANAJA ANV AOVHNDOY ¥0J dELIANY NHAE IAVH ‘6T0C ‘6 YIAOLOO TIONAOD ALID HAOYD NIAWYD
THI OL AFLLINENS ¥HLSIOHEY INVHNYM FHI NI (HINISHEd SY ZG9ZM - 979ZM STYIM ANV 608GS59 - 9GGGG9# SANVWIC

€8°8LL'GEY
G0°L9Z'9
08°G86 ‘BT
Z9°0¥%0 '6ST
0Z°6%¥%'C
68°€8L‘9
00°000‘2Z

LNAOWY

¥ GE'OLE'GEE’T TYLOL TYNIJ

6E€°GOE'TG9

LNINAYd NOISNAd

WNOTWIYd SNI HATIT

SWIYTD SNI-ATHES

g0A d0d LAWY

NWAY SNI-ATHS

NWA¥ SNI-ATHS

FONYLSISSY HIDYDLUOW
NOILAI¥OSHd

6T/60/0T

= SUNIT wxas 904 TYLOL HDYd

NIALSAS INIWNIYILAE ,SHIAOTIWI OITdENd 2G9¢M

dNOo¥D TYIDNYNIA NTOONIT TG9¢cM

YINGOAITYD Jd0 TYINHA Y.LTHEd 0s9¢ZM

AYEdNg NOILNIANOCD 3 YOLISIA ALNNOD HADNVIO/WIFHUNY 679ZM
YINJOAITYD A0 TVINHA YILTIJ 8y9cM

ATEVAIIOFET SIODOY NILLY ¥SN H¥¥D YITHd Lp9ZM

0D UTLIL O9YOIHO 9v9ZM

JOONHIA LNYIIYM

TYAQYAdY ¥0d TIONNOD ALID Ol JALLIWENS SLNYHYYM



I8°9¢€
19768
88°98
0s°0¢
Z1°61
60°€ECT
I1°89
06°0V

6678671
€V LZ9
96° LV
198 2N 24
S9°6T
£8°68
z1°66
LY LY
L8°¥8¢C
[A 2NN 4
TV 6C

98°088°T
v 9701
9Z°L9
687991
006V
66°¢S
00°69
00°SL
00°STC
GETB0'T

06" 1S
06°€97V
00-LZE
€6°781
6682V '1

LNNOWY

dXd¥/sd17ddNs I2I1440
SHITddNS/dIN0d ATHSH
SWALI dO0d YIHLO
dII¥YM JITLIOH

TddNs AdES GOO04

dXd WYED0dd :Lo®ed
dXd FDIAI0:LOBI
AddS J0¥d Y¥IHLO

ddns I1n0/03d ¥IHLO
0d/ST00L ¥ONIW YHUHILO
dXd/SdITddNS dDIAA0
SAAYILOIATIA/SWIII
SEITddNS WOOHUSSYID
SHAELI Q004 YHHLO
14408 A¥IS Q004

aood

dXd WWdO0dd :Lo®ed
HOUNE HLX:LO®d

dXd/SdI11ddNs dOId4I0
SYITddNs JA0d9d HHHLO
aood

AdIS ONIWWIYL dHEL
SESNIDIT/SIXYL
ONINIVYML/NOILINL
SAdIHSYIIWIN/ SENdA

dXd NOILONQOoYd 0JIdIA
ONISILYIAAY

INAWHOYLIVY dDUYM
INIWHOYLIY HOTYM
INIWHOV LIV dOTM
INAWHOYLLY dOUYM
INZWHOVLLY HOUM

NOILAIY¥OSHId

£6°7€8‘G = SHENIT wxw ¥Od TYIOL 3OV¥d

JINYE NOINN

JINYE NOINO

JINYE NOINO
HOTIAYES ENNEATY TUYNYHILNI
AIG TEUINID dEDIAI0 ONIAAET /AATHHHS ALNOOD IDNWHO
JOIAYES HOANIATY TYNIHINI
INTWHSINYYD FOUYM :NLLY Id¥d ININJOTIATA ILNIAWAOTIWI
Quv¥0d XV¥I ASTHONVYIA-JAITYD J0 HIVLS

HOONHIA

61/91/0T TYAOYddY ¥Od TIONNOD ALID OL QILLIWENS SINVHUYM

Page 50 of 117

LT85S99

9186599

SI8GS9

P18959

€186G9

218659

T186S9

018659

LNYIETM



x

LE"TSS

pS T60°T
¥S°¢Z6
LL"6
L9 vl
SE"TIBE
Ls°2C1
08°¢CT1
89°1¢
£6°6VC
05°68
6G9°6€
0v°9T1
VL™ PSS

ET LPV
88°FET
TARAL
00°0T

00°€0¢
00°€EST
00°0S

Z0°856
¢0°08¢
00°8LS

0E°€86°C
S6°69
L9706
00°09
00°0S¥% ‘T
£€9°18¢
S0°9¥9
00°9¢
00°09¢€

9L°006
€6°CT
18°Ch¥

LNNOWY

SYIdIIg/ IANOHA FTIL

ddns 17100/03d ¥EHILO
SJIITddNS OILITHLIY
SHITddNS/dIN0d ATHSH
SWALI dOOd ¥HHLO
YILYM QUTLLO"E

1ddNS AYES 4004
aood

dXd D¥D:LO®d

dXd WY00¥d : 1oed
dXd dDI4d0:LD®d
A¥IS J0Yd YHHLO
HOUNT HLA:ILO®Bed

SdITddNs IJTID
dXd/S84d11ddNs HOIAJ0
SAIHSYHEWEN ALID

SHEI NOILVYLSIOHH
SdTHSYIHWERN/ SHENd

aood
Sd¥d NOILVYLSIDHYA

SHLIISSYI/SANS/SH00d
aood

Add FONTILNI/NWAY
SdEd NOILYYLSIDHEY
ONIDAOT
NOILYIMOdSNYEL ¥/S/1
A¥IES J0Y¥d ¥IHLO
ONISIIIUAdY

ddns I17100/03d ¥IAHLO
SdITddNS OILATHLY

NOILdI¥D0S§dd

ZI°GET‘L = SINIT w»w dOd TYIOL HIUL

SNOILYDINAWWOD dHILNOYA

JINYE NOINN

MNYE NOIND

MNYd NOINN

JNYd NOINN

JINYE NOIND

JOaNHEA

6T/9T/0T TYAOYddY ¥Od TIDNNOD ALID OL JIALLIWENS SLNTIIYM

Page 51%f 117

228659

128669

02¢85G9

618959

818669

LNTIIYM



8L"zzo’'002

SANIT wxu ¥YOd TVYIOL IDVd

=

¥6 F8T'T9 Mm

00°¢L SLOVALNOD AYAS-LNIVRW Vo)
¥6°2TT'T9 AYAS DNIdEIMS LATALS LHIILSNYITO vvmew

82 181 %

66°LY ddns 11N5/08d ¥IHIO
6€°21T SLYYd HIA dOLOR

06°0C dXT WYID0¥d : LO®'d AT7ddNS ONIQTIM NOEHWYO £78G6S9
z6-LZT'C X90LNIANI HASHM “ONI STIYI¥HEIVA INITAJId STIIM D [AZ:
00°00S SADIAYIAS ONINIOMLIN ONI INIWNYIAOD-MAD T78SG9
6L°GLY 0d/STO0L YONIW YEHIO "ONI ‘STIINMOYE 078659
00°00¢ AdAS J0dd ¥IHILO NYI¥d ‘ONISIHE 6€86599
00°96G'T DONINIYEL/NOILINL ONI ‘S10naoy¥d Jdiod 8€8GS9
¢9°181 STYINIY dIHLO NODYvHd LEBSSY
vE€ 098 dodd TYdEY J0 LINIVR ANYdWOD WIYIV AVH 9€£8659
€EEEE GWINY d¥Y¥0 d3Ed O¥ANYL TV ‘SOTANNYHx SEBGGY
05°L66'T INIVN dTOIHIA HOLOW HSYM JTIHOW YNIJAW SHIANY F€8G699
99°692'1T ¥INOD ISNOD UMS/dIM STTYION YOINO¥IA *NLIV MNVH SSHNISNE NYDTYINY ££8G6G9
6T°SPT SL¥¥d HEA YOLOH “ONI ¥IINID NIQYYD ANV NMUYUT S, NYIVY ZE€BGS9
96°G18‘¢C SI¥dYd HIA YOLOW SI0Ndo¥d dJITOd NOSWYAY TEBSSO
69°v1Z'C A¥AS J0dd ¥IHLIO ALTENDIS TUYNOIIUYNYALNI HLOATOSHY 0£85S9
00° 108 ONISILYHEAAY ZIAANYNYII NYQYOL ANOHLNY 6286G9
ge-gze‘oe SYD THINLUYN 0D S¥YD JAITYD OS 828669
€2°8TG ‘26 ALIDIELOETH 0D NOSIJdE AI'T¥D OS LZBSS9
SINYI¥YM dIOA 9¢8G59-7285S9
LNOOWY NOILdT¥DSHd YOUNIA LNTIIYM

61/9T/0T TYAOYAdY ¥Od TIDNNOD ALID Ol (QILLIWENS SINTHUYM




00°S¢E

Sy viv
[AARZAY
£€2°06¢C
00°G680°S
00°06€
96°v22°¢
00°T6¥%‘T
88°19C’S
EL"TST
GT°0TIT‘S
LT ZET

LT €€
00°66
66°667°'T
00°000'¥
€E°€6Z V1
00°9LE ‘8T
ZL 09
GZ°98Z°C
00°91
oV - €9
26766
SO0°LL
SFP-TT16°0T

LNOOKWY

NOILYLIOdSNYYL ¥/S/'1

SEITddNS Odddd

SIJOTIANT/IAIYd

SHOIAYES ONIYHANIDNY

d¥Xd NOILDONAO¥d OddIA

A¥ES J0¥d YEHIO

dWIgY NOILINL

SLOYYINOD A¥IS-LNITR
AJOLNIANI HSHM

0d/ST00L YONIW YddHLIO
SLOYYLNOD AYES—-INIVA
HOYNd dIINdHWOD TdRWA
AYdIS J0dd YHEHIO

AddS J0dd YIHIO

SHEA NOILYYLSIOHA
AONVAQY THATYL
SLOYYINOD A¥IS-LNIVR
JONYAQY TEAVHL
dXd/5dITddNs dO0Idd0
SHOIAYHES AYHAITHA
NOILINOWWY/SNOD
SLOYYINOD AYIS-LNIVH

NOILdI¥OSHd

LT°8L9799 = SEANIT wxw ¥Od TYIOL ID¥d

TANNYS ‘WIM

dHadyd ATTEN
SLNYLINSNOD DIr
oT1 ‘rII

JSNOH TYAYALNI

ATTIEM I¥Y ‘HNAQH«

0dd 10ddd {WOH H{HL

ONI 3Jd¥S % ¥DOT S0o¥d S.TIIH
a dsor ‘YIdddH~

07T ‘IIYMILIOS WNITHH

*ONI ‘SONIIVOD FAILOHIOEd ILIAIVID

YALNED ONINIYYI FOILSAL TYNIWIND FDITIOO ISEM NIATOD
q1dd ‘YIDYYD«

OTT ‘SEDIAMAS ALITYNO YWIV HSOYLNORW

¥ IV ‘a00Td«

ONI ‘°J1d dWYLS ¥IgdNy ¥YLSHATI

dJ0D SSTYAXH TY¥IdHI

*ONI ‘SASTUJYIING XITO0d

NOISIA NOILVWOLOY TOUINOD

JOANIA

6T/9T/0T TYAO¥AAY ¥OJ TIDNNOD ALID OL UALLIWLAS SLNYHYYM

(@)
NNMmmw
1986569
098669

668659

868659
LS89G9

968669
6686499
798859
£68G59
258569
168659
088559
678599
878659
L¥89G9
9¥8599
Gy88G9

LNYIIYM



00°00T
T8°G1S

T8 EET

¥s 62

8L E6
A4
PT°€S
T1°89
00°8T
66°1¢
00°St

9% L¥0‘V1C
¥Z 0LZ'LE
60°916
gE-LZE'S
00°00T‘S
00°GS6T
£6°80¢

TIT L9V

BT €£9‘9C
z9°291°C
A ANARS
TECTIL
0eg"261
80°269 ‘9¢
G2 698

LNAOWY

GWIET ISNdL dERN

dagnNT
SHEIHJOYL/SAIUMY
0d/ST00L YONIW YdHLO
dXd/5d11ddNS IO1ddO0
SHITddNS TYIYOLINYL
Tand TISEIA/SYD AR
ddI¥YM dATLLOYE

dIndd ALdAYS

AYFIS J0¥d YHHLIO
YINOD LSNOD ¥MS/diM
SILOYILNOD AYUS-LNIWYW
SOOI INN

TYAOWHIY LVWZVH

A¥dS 10d9d YdHILO
A¥ES JOodd YHdHILO
SESNHEAXY HANINWYO
SHITdANS TYIYOLINYL
ad Ia¥do-SHdd MNVE
SIOVYINOD AYIS-LNIVW
SIWIOAINA

A¥IS J0¥d YUHLO
HWIEY JYYD d4d

A¥ES d0dd YEHLO

03 /HOYW/NINI-SYIYdayd

NOILJTHdOSHd

8T1°228'VEEC = SANIT wxuw ¥0Od TYIOL EDYd

T YSENAL ’x+AOYIROJ

¥ID OA¥S NOAW - HSYO ALLAd
NOIIVIOd¥OD HOALOWAXH JOIAIOVd

A¥9IS SNIJI¥LS AINAOD HDNWIO

DTI FIOLS AONYHY ALNNOD FTIONYWIO

*ONI ‘SEDIA¥NES TYINIWNOYIANI FNTH NYEDO

*ONI ‘XHMON

ONI ‘EDIAYAS TO0d NYWMEN

HITYAH TYWINY IMRW

QIIVHOdYOONI ‘Y¥WOW J0 NOISIAICQ SIONAo¥d XLIVIDAS OD¥E4NS
Ld®d SNIINNOOOY SId

OTT INIVW 5078 SINYHOMIEW

SYOTIVI AO¥/¥ILSYWMALEYNO/STIYD OTT ‘STIUD

SNOOTIVL ¥IV NVHI YAIHOIT

FOVHED ‘HHT«

NOTIWJ0Jd¥0D YO

TIGYATIDFTE SINNOOOY "ONI ‘SWALSAS ¥HONM

JOANEA

6T/9T/0T TYAOYddY ¥Od TIDNNOD ALID OL CGHLLIWENS SINYIIVM

08

Page 54%f 117
19
O

6L85S59

8LBGS9

LL8SS9

9L85S9

SL8GS9

vL8GS9

€£L89G9

¢LBSS9

TL8GS59

0L859S9

698659

898659

L98GS9

998699

§98659

¥985S9

INTIIYM



€8 PLL'E
0000002
¢8°19¢
¢Z L0
€6 TGLT
9% °BES
LS 6769
gL ¢¢
007081
LT ¥9€
BE LT
0F°"p8T‘T
0V S1c
Py 68L
€L°668°'T
00°00€ VT
99°0TIF ‘T
0091
81°¥8S
00°€¥0°‘C
GG'E€E0'T
00°S€¢

LNNOWY

03 /S I00L YONIW dFHLO
IOV 1.S0d

XANOSYR/ SILYDTIDOY
SYOIAYIES AR¥IAITHEA
SWOAINN

SHOIAYIS YOLONYLSNI
A¥dS A0¥d ¥IHIO
SIL¥¥d HHEA YOLOW
SHDIAYES ONIYHINIONA
SIL¥¥d HEA ¥OLOW
AOIAYES AL dTIYD
STDIAY¥IS YOLONILSNI
0d/STO0L YONIW dIHLO
SASNIAXE ININVO
A90INFANI HSHM

A¥IS J0Yd ¥HHLO
SL¥¥d HHEA YOLOW
AONVYAQY TIAVHL

AGIS J0¥d YHHLO
TIYMLIOS

TYOdT

IIYLSOd

NOILAIYDSHd

SENIT wxu ¥Od TYLOL dDVd

LL9PE IJdEA "ONI ‘SWILSAS gIMOd XITIVA
(9EISYH) FIIAHES TYISOd °S°0

ONI ‘ISHMHIMON STVINTY dIIINO
FOIAYES TADEYE QIIINN

*d¥0D0 HOWdY “S°n

OTT ‘TIVEAITIOA HAOYD LSIM

ONI ‘SWALSXS ¥I¥d O€dnl

opIegonIL “INI ATddAS OLAY ? MONdlL
*ONI ‘SHEIANLS NOIIYIYOdSNYYL
SEIHOTONHOAL GINTd AUYNIXOL

TTEVO HANYYM FWIL

WALNTD INFHdOTIATA dTIHD 104S ONINIVIT HHL
ONI ‘SIDNGo¥d ALTYIDHAS LEDIVIL

OTT dvdl HAIT MMYHVWOL

S10oNaodd TYIYLSAONI FLYLS

OTT ‘ONILTINSNOD ASIMIVIDOS

99 A0 IATOYAEHD NOSAWIS

UYNATY ‘STTIYSO¥x

SHIYIDOSSY YHHSIA QIYHOIY

d¥90D TYNOILYNYEINI IHS

QTIIHS TYDAT

YALSYHLSOd

JOdNHA

6T/91/0T1 'IYAOYddY ¥Od TIDNAOD ALID OL JILLIWEAS SINVTIIYM

~
208659

o
106559

(0]
oomem
668559
868559
L685S9
968559
568569
768559
£68559
268569
168559
068559
688559
888559
188559
988569
$88559
788559
£88559
288559

1885599

LNTIIYM



LE"TOE
00°1S
00°TS
00°00T
90°09%
SF°98T1
00708V
00°G609'S
0V €8¢
00°sc¢
00°8L9
1I8°v0V
0e" 26T
16°¢t1e
1C°0€9
LT°9T¢E
09°169°2T
TZ°6%2°T
00°¢6L
00°88Z'6
gzrziz't
PE 60V
687208
18°960°‘¢C

LNNOWY

SL¥Y¥d HIA YOLOW

LSId NOILVLID

LSIQ NOILYLID
SANNAEY LISO4ddd
SIITddNS YDV HYHHLO
SI¥d¥d HUA dOLOW
ONINIVAL/NOILINL
SHOTIAYIS ONIYHINIDNI
STYLNTY ddHLO

A¥IS d0¥d ¥HHLO
SLOVILNOD AYIS-INIVN
gWIEY JYYO d4d

GWIHY LSNYL ddR
AYOLNIANI HSHM
SASNIAIXT ININWD

AYIS ONIWWIYLI JHEHL
AHOLNIANI HSHM
STYOIWEHD Ad0LVHOHYI
NWA¥Y SNI-JATdS

9IS JIYIIL-ddNS LNIVW
AYOLNIANI USHM
S1LONaoyd ILIVHASY

NOILdIdDSdd

2€°Z9T'LE = SENIT wxu ¥0d TVYIOL 3FDVWd

LOT6ET NIE 0D SI¥¥d ¥OIOW A¥OLOVd
£ HY¥Oddd ‘IQY¥OINN¥E

N¥D ‘WY'T

YIIT ‘ITIELId¥0

NATIO ¥OYNINOY

AOIAYAS ANV SETYS SNIRWND
SELYIDOSSY SNILTASNOD NIMUYKW

“ONI ‘ONIMIINIONT STIOS AEIIVIDOSSY
STYINTY € % 4

OONVIY ‘VdIddydDd

ONI ALITIHOW SNEWIIS

YIANVYTID ‘YIAIQTUEAx

AOIAYES 3 SHATIVYS d4Z

*ONI ‘W¥0LS 03Fd ¥ANIT VEd0X
ONI SISTH0€dVY LSY0D LSHEM
ATddNS AYYLINUYS HIXTM

*ONI ‘SHIDOTONHOIL ANITYILYM

ANYAWOD 3 NIYIYM TIYD

YIONITED
NOISIAIO NYIISEM ANYIWOD STYIYIALYW NYDTINA

JOANHTA

6T/9T/0T TYAOYAdY Y04 'TIDNNOD ALID OL JALLIWGNS SINTIIYM

N~
278659
o

128559
(0]
(@)]

028559

616559

816559

LT6S59

976569

516559

P16559

£16669

216659

116559
016659
606559
806559
L069G9
906559

S06659

706559
£€06659

INTIIYM



L6°896°¢E ZHOLNIANI ISHM
0E"CT6T GWNITY F¥¥D d3d
£€9°02¢ XJOINIANI ISHM
00°¥9 rog-add NYOSHAIT
00°L86

00°022 NOIIYIMOdSNYEL ¥/S/T
00°L9L INIWHOYLIY IOYM
00°000°‘S AYES d0¥d JdHHILO
z20°€5¢C

0E"T61 GWIFY F¥¥O dHd
ZL"09 FONYAQY THATIL
6€°0€C’T SADIA¥AS YOILONYLSNI
zs-o080'’¢z AY¥IS J0¥d ¥FEHIO
29°€62 SHAFYT
09°69L'8 SLOVIINOD A¥AS—INIVR
00°91 FONVAQY THAAYEL
00°LZ8'G8 1SIa NOIIWLIID
LL 602 XYOINIANI HSHM
8T°0LZ SI¥¥d HEA YOILOW
00" %0S§ SEDIA¥AS YOIONYISNI
66°666°T do¥davEd 1odAro¥d
pS°19¢C SI¥Yd HHA JOIOKW
0G°9L SHALI ILNIYW ¥dHIO
00°00S A¥AS J0¥d ¥IHIO

INNOWY NOILdI¥DSHA

€0°G6ZL‘ZTT = SANIT .xu ¥Od 'TYIOL FOVL

*ONI OLNY 3 JJ¥IL AINNOD LSHEM
aoy ‘YI¥OLOIAx
X1ddnS NOILONYISNOD ‘IVIMISNANI TYNILSYL

Iddd SNIMIHSYD/ONILNNODDOY IADILSNL JO INIWLEYdEd

SNIYYL MNITOYLIAW

ONIJAO0d W ¥ W

NYA¥E ‘SYIIN
AWYAYOY SINNIL NATTY ANNHOL ¥Ed “¥f NITIV dIAVA ANNHOL
SAIM "MYIDAAS ¥Od SHILVYOOAAY A0 WYHL
AYESUNN WL
*ONI SNOIIVOINOWWOD INJIITISHEY
MAYE NOYIVHS
IIND ¥/¥-A¥FAODHEY ANNIATY YTINSYIEL HONWE0 A0 XLNNOD
ONI XATddNS YITMNIYdS TYI¥YIdWT
SI¥¥d OLNY ATIIHEY,0
LI¥¥ECc ‘XdS0¥D
NOIIVIOdY0D NOOXATA :¥E8d NOILYIOd¥0D SNIOWOWd TTHHS
“ONI SILONC0¥d INIWIDUNYW OIJddVHL
TIYMAYYH TYINLISNANTI JTYd NIAAYIADW
WOL “¥v¥OTIdL
JOUNHA

6I/91/0T 'TYAOYAdY ¥Od TIONNOD ALID OL JILLIWANS SLNVIIYM

N~
ZrE559
o

ToEES9
(0]
0vERS9
o

6£6599

8E£6G6S59

LE6SSO

9£66G9
SE6599
7E6G599
£€6GG59
2E6659
T€645S9
0€6G59
626699
826959
LZ6559
9265499
SZ6G59
¥266S9
€26G59

LNYIHEYM



8E°LCT
TE800°L
00°%9T°T
Z8°96¢
T1°800°T
00°005‘¢
s8¢y
4 YA B
69 "€G1
00°0%0‘T
BE"P6Z'T
L7 €8

zeseL‘zel

8V 6LC
80°9G6% ‘9
6776282
L9°80T’E
¢1eccs
0G°LEE'ZT
00°GSL6
G9°8¥%1
TV 621°C

LNOOWY

O0F/HOVYR/NINI-SATIVd 3T
A¥ES J0dd Y¥EHIO

SHEA YIHLO/SLINJIAd
ddns 1100/2dd JYIHIO
9IS ddVHL-ddNS LNIVUW
HOYNd ¥IINdWOD TdRWH
A¥IS J0dd Y¥EHLO
SIDIAYAS ONINIOMLAN
HWITY FI¥D d4dd
0F/HOYW/NINI-SYIVdTd
A¥ES J40dd Y¥YHIHLO
SHITddNS TYOIYIOHUTH

SHEXYL ALdEd0dd

SWILI INIYW ddHLO

dIN03A/NINd YONIW
dXd/83dITddns d0Idd0
SLOYILNOD AYES-LNIVRH
dYYMLIOS

aood
0d/HOVYW/NINI-SIIYdad

AYOINHANI HSHM

NOILAI¥DSHad

TO°0LO‘TOT = SHANIT uwxa YOI TYLOL dOYd

SYALOO0DS 3 SYAMOWNMYT ISEMNIAATOD
*ONI ‘¥AINID FONYAIND QTIIHD

NOIIVYISININAY FFd ANV XYL J0 INININYAHd YINJOAITYD
‘0D aFAd ALID AUYMAIR

ONI 0D A1ddns dir

WYAY ‘YOINZ«

ONIIIO4EY LIAFED TYNOILYN

MOIDIATIOD XYL-YTUNSYAUL FONYEO IO XINNOD
AT¥II0FD ‘SSIOTA

OINVY ¥HAT ¥€Ed ONI THWROLS

¥IV¥d SSHATIYIM 40 ONIIHOIT dZVIEY.LYd

ONILHOIT ALITYA0 WAIWIEd

VOIDIATIOD XYL ~dFINSYAEL NILY IONYHO J0 XLNNOD
INVYEYM QIOA

¥sn ALSYM O¥dZ

ASNOHTIYM YIINAWOD NYHHLNOS

SNOILQTOS NOIILVWYOJANI :NILIV 071 ‘SNOILNTOS DIDOTIEOD
HNANH ¥NIN

SHTOADYOLOW YIAYES ¥YAI ODAVIS

SUYITddNS FYIA-OX

HOANHIA

6T/9T/0T TIYAOYAdY ¥Od TIDNNOD ALID OL AALLIWENS SINTIIUM

117

Y
29859
Te]
198559
©
092559
656559
856559
L56559
966669
556669
¥S6559
£66659
756559
166659
056559
676559

8V6GG9

LV6GG9
9%65S9
G¥66S9
PP65S9
£EV6GG9

LNYTIITYM



ot

YJOLOEYIA IDONUNIJ - D

NOS QHUHMBmm

%nmmw@

TTGYIIVAY IV SANNI ANV ADWdNODY ¥0d dF

1IANY NIFg IAVH ‘6102 ‘9

JAOTYIHL INIWAYd €04
T ¥EG0LD0 TIONNOD ALID HACYD NIAAYD

qHI Ol QEILIIWGNS WALSIODTY INVYYUYM FHI NI QELNISHYd SY LGICM - £G9CM SHUIM aNY G96GG9 ~ 0T8GG9# SANVWIC

x 81°6L0'V66°T TYLOL TYNII

G9°9G60‘G00‘T D00MW-YIM IMOdNWI
G8-€6§ INIWHOVLLIY FOUM
7S 19V INIWHOVLIY FOUM
8E"EVE INFWHOYLIY FOUM
62°981°C INFWHOVILIY FOUM
I8°LEL'T SHITAANS SNINYOMLIAN
00°002 A¥MES JO¥d ¥AHIO
00°0T¥ gWITY LSNYL QR
INQOWY NOIIdI¥OSHd

26 66 °'0T0‘T = SHANIT uxu

¥od TYI0L EO¥d

AINNOD FONYHO 40 LOIYLSIA HALYM TYIIDINOW

8S6760086 #

6T/9T/0T 'TYAOYAdY ¥OJd

IHOTYMNIYM NONNYHS
ATIHOIN ‘SATONATE
ASYD INNODDY I¥0ddNS ATIHD ANYIAYYRW
LIIND INIWISENISIA dIVLS YINYOAITHYD
d1 ‘104dq FUYYMAYYH YIVd
OT1 ‘ONILOOHS dTiOM TYHEY
HNY ‘WYHd
HOUONEA

TIONNOD ALID OL JILIIWENS SINTIEVM

Page 59 of 117

LS9CM

9G9¢cZM

GG9¢M

FS9CM

£692M

§965G9

796659

€96G59

LNTIIYM



9T°0%9T
9%°S0ST
TT 2261
TE€"908T
SZ°SELT
8T°9v5¢
0€" 168

0L°209T
9L°S¢e0¢t
69°%STT
28" LE9C
0¥ "120¢
91°62T¢
€T €ESLT
2eE"650C
LT 2LST
0V 6SvT
cc 8LEL
¥6°S¥¥C
6S°€62C
€L°0LZT
6179922
00°0TST
65°2vZe
TE ELVC
08°LZ6T
€T°LS02
€8° 1961
¥6"19LT
28 °%10¢
SL"2Z89
LB TV9T
08°S6¢

ST TT?

A AR XA

LB 6SY

00°0LST
69 ETTT
681679
Y6 VLTV
89°¢

EE 6L

sc-eve

TL°0T6

6C V61T
61°9¢cce
YL E06C
9€°206T

NUYSNYIUNVYN W TVEN
ZAAYHD 4 JWIVL
ZHITWYY VA"
NOSYHIAd T YHAINNAL
dr NIAYVH 9 @IYMad
OLOWYEM N 4440
NMOY¥H £ NHIVI
ISJANY VIDIT

ZONNW X AJIdH

AYW M 13d490¥
VIONVOTY W NNV ATV
IIIATH O NNV

HSNIOWS O JYOATYL
STIIVH W NIHIA
YIDUYD VIATAS
ONONAL HNIWIH

OL T YANYL

IHd &L V¥YNVAHL

NIXNON ONVNO
OUUVAVN ¥ VIYUKW

HT AWWYL

SSIODI O YWIIA

OH d AA

IVHL H ALSTI¥X

NWIOW T JIYVN

WIM N HTTION

SIAYA d Ad¥ddd0
ZANDOSVA D HLEAVZIT
AD0TIOd W VYANVWY
OOX VYNHHNW

SHIILS O LLODOS
QYAAVH W YTHWYd
TIIIAN,O d NHOL
NIANON VH OHL S¥adIda
SENOL ¥ NIAHLS

ITTI WYDILIIY¥YY S EDJY0IED
OSSY dDITOd FACYD NATYVD
¥TdTO0°0

HIINDYW d SHWYL
NOSITIVY WYITIIM
ddvd N MIIANY
SYDUVA 9 VHINVRWVYS
NVHd I Q¥VNOdd
ZIWOD d NHAAHLS
OYIADVWNHD W YNNVHEd
SHIOTA [ YNHLIV
¥SO¥ L YOISSsHr
HJOOW ¥ HLIANL

T govd 6T/0T/0T

T8255¢d
6L255¢ed
LLTSSEA
SL2ZSSed
€LZSSEd
TLZSSEA
69255¢ed
L925Ss¢ed
§92ZSSed
€£92SS¢ed
T92Zssed
65255¢d
LSTSSEd
§62SS¢ed
£52SSed
TSZSSed
6vcssed
LYZSSEd
S¥Cssed
€yZSSed
T¥2SSEd
6€ZSSEd
LEZTSSEA
SEZSSed
£E8255Ed
TECSSEA
6CCZsSsed
£L2CSSEd
§2ZS8sed
€2essed
TZZSSEd
6TZSSEQd
LTZSSEd
STZSSEQd
€TZSS¢ed
TTZ2SS¢ed
TELEBT

6CLEST

LZLEBT

SCLEST

€ZLEBT

TZLEBT

6TLESBT

LTLEST

STLEST

ETLEBT

TTLESBT

60LEBT

ET°TE9T
€5°¥2C8T
LS ¥89T
S9°LOLT
S9°¥SST
Z6°9vce
0Z°€99T
LY 0981
v0°82%1
99°G2LT
T6 " TLLT
91° 1962
9T1°8t6

S BLEY
0Z°89ST
80°980¢
ve-e0ce
¢0°LSTZ
09°290¢
(47284144
C¢Z S¥8T
ST E9S¢E
6% €802
80°9LYE
¥9°6SS

SL°v89

06°8S6T
€9°CSTE
ST° 0991
68°80L9
L9° 1602
¢S Sy

L9°C1Y
Z¢1-59¢

LL”SLT

LZ 6V

00°S¥

81°L822
€€ €002
CT 0ELT
ZT°15¢

96°CLT

0%"€0S

CL LET

¥6°9TL

€v°s002C
99°9181
T1°L20E

Sy E66SLT =

ZIANYNYHEH J Kd¥D
O¥YHWOd 9 SIXHIVY
WYHd HNVY

ZHANHN W YVIIDNY
SWINT 3 VYISTIHD
NYWAJOH 1 HNNTHOO
VISTIINVE ° VYNVIIY
NILVOIN LIMYKWYTES
HONONOJOW Y VYNMVHS
SOWYY NILV YSIYVYW
Y109V ¥ YVLIIVDIVW
ONOHD [ LUENYL
YZOONHW O ILSIYHO
DONOS NVYNX

OA NHANON-HNVHL
NYIL M ONONO

SOWVY YIJYW
NIANON I ¥UNIL
NIANON I NIIA DNONHd
JIOANIAATN YANIT
dT AAT

HNANH ANNVQ
ONHMAVD [ YNNVHS
oarind d YNV
YZOONHW W ASSINW
NOSNHOL T INVLLI¥H
YTIAY Y¥OINOJIHA
XO¥dWOd T VSHYAL
O¥IVYZId VZLIYVW
HdILS ¥ YIYUW

MYYd S NMVHS
OIY¥YOIOS ¥ HEAIILS
NIANON g WIX
NIFISNIIJOTI 1 HINVHAHLS
Ind I LVHd

SHDIDHEE d TOdVYO
IIIYVHD HLTIVIH ALINOWWOD
TYIIANID "¥"d°D°0
Z2dd0T W VINHZ

YHWOL X THNWVS
JIMOEWHZ Y THINVA
NETIILVSOVHL g00Yr
dL NVWZOO OdTNNIY
HNIQ d NOJVY

JL NVWINHL O NIMTH
YHOOY 4 TAVHDINW
AIVTEE INVId
NYWZND HIHO¥VY

YHEWAN INVAIYM A€ JHLSIDHY INVIIYM TIOHAVd

TYLOL dOYd #*xxx

08¢5s¢ed
8L25S5¢td
9.,2585¢ed
vLZSStd
cLzssea
0L2S85¢td
892¢55td
992Zs5¢ed
¥9cssed
29zssted
092SS¢Ed
8G255¢d
96¢2S5¢ed
¥sZssed
252s5¢d
052Z6Std
8¥ZSStEd
9%ZSStEd
yvZssed
ZvZasted
ovZsstd
8€£2SStd
9¢€28S¢ed
vezssed
ceessed
0€ZSStEd
82ZSSted
9Zessed
vZzssted
22Zssed
ozZzsstda
812S5¢ed
912ssed
v1Zssed
Z1Zssed
0TZSSsed
0ELESBT

BZLESBT

92LEBT

vCLEBT

ZZLEBT

02ZLESBT

B8TLEST

9TLESBT

PILESBT

ZTLEST

OTLEST

B80LESBT

Page 60 of 117



vL"96CT
0%~ ESTC
vy 9L6T
€EE"ELBZ
TL°SE0C
€T €8ET
Z29°TLOE
¥9 eLLE
6€°1892
80°€L6

89°0C1C
2979672
¥S°629T
S6°ESY

T¥°509¢
LT S0vC
€z L8LE
60°00S2
LT 6TET
SL V6T
26681
€6 ESOT
L9 6T¥PT
6E°8E8BT
85°6L8¢
86°T6LZ
62°206C
€L°6SYPE
CT EL6T
6678891
80°8%0C
91-0t0¢C
vS 86LT
0S°9S9T
LT 9T6C
T%"896C
TZ 66LE
26°968T
GE°598

€S 0%%C
6T°L80C
E1 4444
TV ¥LST
Lz 9zo¢
yeE"SLTIZ
VE"9LBT
¥S°065¢
£v"86ttL

ONYIIOM £ JTYNOY
YTANZNITYA N OQ3dANVLITY
NI ¥ HNIW
OLNHTWIVS W NVIJAVY
ZINY NVHLUYNOL
ZIANDIYAOY H NVYHHLSH
NOSYVHd 4 WYITIIM
YOHLYO ¥ dIAYd
HYIOOIN ATITANIOD
ONYILVYN T M8IX

JrL YAOW [ NIAILS
AIHWODLNOW ¥ dSSHD
Y YN TIAVA

IVT HT VAONVYINY

NIL NVYAIT

ANH ¥ @¥YMJE
SEDIANMIVH ¥ I1L3d90d
AdD £ TAVHOIN
NNITD [ AWZ3Ir
JHENATId M dTYNOY
NVd W UNIdYO
ZHONWIHY 4 133904
SOTENNVYE OYANVLHTY
NITIY T JHIHdOLSTIHD
nA o Ivd

ZENOSVA ¥ dsor
SOLNVS 4 THYHOINW
NIVH 9 NIAUN

LOOYL HIYVWESOA
YHEJA0H W VIDITY
¥SO0d V1 dHa T INIONIA
S0d O THVHOIW
INOJHL H AHIOWIL
HYZXIAWYH-NdY HUYNHINY
SYINIIYAOD YOINOW
YIIvd O YVI¥VKW
ONTYVN M HHT

YDISYY [ LITdd
ZHAYIVA ¥ ODYVHW
SITNOS-VITIND [ ¥YNFJIOT
HYNOW VYNVITLIAS
NOSJOH [ NOJYVY
DIMINVH O ddoL
YIWIAHTHYA L NOSX¥d
YIWVID W YILIIY
HOIA'THSY ¥V HIINC
o¥IIyYdINd "INvd
YMYDES H YIANVS

z govd 6T/0T/0T

LLESSEA
SLESSEd
ELESSEd
TLESSEA
69€55Ed
L9ESSET
S9€ESS¢Ed
£9EGSEd
T9e55¢ed
6S€55¢ed
LSESSET
SSESSEd
£5€55¢d
TSES5¢EQd
6¥ESSEQd
LPESSEA
SPESSEd
£€veSsed
T#ESSEA
6€E€SSEd
LEESSEA
SEESSEd
EEESSEd
TEESSEd
62£55¢d
LTESSEd
§2eSStd
€CTESSEA
TZESSEd
6TESSEd
LTESSEd
STESSEd
€TESSEd
TTESSEd
60€SSEQ
L0ESSEd
S0ESSEd
€£0ESSEQ
T0ESSEd
66CSSEd
L6CSSEA
§6255¢ed
€6CSSEd
T62SSed
68CSS5¢Ed
L82SSEd
§8¢S8sed
£8csstd

6% CT0T
2L" 0821
86°159¢
9L°6¢80T
8L°908¢C
¥6"vCZET
29°¢2v9e
veE"8E9T
S6°LLTZ
69°S8LT
TZ 9T1ST
6% €88T
91 vZve
6S°¥¥9¢E
S8°T1991
8L°098T
CE V68T
80°L2ST
ST°61CE
¢8°0TST
T2°SSLC
¥8°€LOC
9¢°L88T
69°€6TE
68°LYEC
L9 CITY
Zs"Zsee
80°LLTC
¢c-998e
TL TCTT
¥STLLOY
98°LS0¢C
TL 8%CE
§9°991¢C
SETISLE
869212
98°¢¥8T
0% " ¥6S2C
TL°0%22C
20" 6EPE
0% " ELLT
S¥°8ECC
16°616¢E
LT ELST
89 ETISC
GZ2°Se9%
S6°T1StC
e 0LST

95°,L58€2C =

YIFOLOIA N NAHITHLYA
A0 VITANZNIIVA OYANVILHTY
A0 SHINVWYIYL LII9TY
SOLNVS SIXHIV
TIIHOSNALINT ¥ Sd1
HWWOHANYd € YIHJOLSIYHD
SYIIISVYd L ONILSHTHD
SYTINJO I MHYANY
NIANON ONNAL ONa
TRINOW D TISVH

STHIOW W NIILSOL
NHVISTHN ¥dTAL

IT NYMI AId YOOddHY
WIN A THARWVYS

ZANAWIC TIVAIA

IIYH S NVAY

NIJATHD AYAVI
ZHTVZNOD OIANVLHTY
JVLF0OSH N STI¥HD
SIAVA H NVYAY

NONNVYD d WIL

JIOYId NYr

SONOTIYY [ ¥NHSOr

naA T ONYHA

TYIN WIVDYIA D YNV
SNHAN d MIYKW

OYIYAUYN O NuUNC

SIMHT T NVHS

HHISH O SYIODIN
OYEId IVANYI
YIIVTIANYD £ THINVd
NOSTIM d NOSITIV
SNI"Hd0d N X0¥

ddT d HOWID
LLIDJOTd OH¥O
ONVIJEW T YIdYW

X1 O DNONH

ONNHD ¥YHHJOLSIYHD
ZNd0d odadEd

NEANON L NHd

SYONT d TIYNOd
ZHAONYNIHH A HdTYY
INEd ¥ dIAYd
TTYANYID [ YTHJOLSTIYHO
NILSOVY O THYHOIW

WIX T ¥SIT1

ONHHD ¥ YNVIV
ZHHONVS [ THINVA

UHEWNN LNVHHUYM Ad JJLSTIDIY LNVIIYM TI0YAVYd

TYLOL HOUd xxxx

9L€SSEd
vLeSSeEd
ZLESSEd
0LESSEd
89€£S5S5¢Ed
99€585¢€d
v9eSSEd
Z9€E55¢d
09€S55¢d
85€55¢td
9G€ES8S¢Ed
ysessted
Z8ES5¢ed
05e55¢ed
8¥€ES5¢Ed
9vESSEd
yyessea
crESSEd
oveESSEd
BEESSEA
9EESSEd
vEESSEd
2eesstd
0E€ESSEd
8CESStEd
9ZESStd
vZessed
zezessed
0ZESStEd
8TESSEd
91€S8S5€Ed
PTESSEd
Z1essed
0TESSEd
80€S55¢d
90€S55¢€d
y0ESSEd
Z20€ESSed
00eSstd
86¢CSS5¢tEd
96¢S5Sstd
¥62SS5td
26255¢td
06255¢d
88255t
98CSSEd
¥825S5¢tEd
Z825sted

Page 61 of 117



9L EECT
6¥-9LCC
66°89¢T
vZ°06ST
9T°00¢t€
ET"€6TC
6S5°TSYT
LT 998

TL TEOC
€Z°8LST
6T €99

cv-1ecee
T6°SETC
9% " t0ST
6L°289T
88°CV0T
0Z°9L92
26°989

90°86LT
9% $291
06°9S7%T
¥6 18TT
6S°6EL

S6°LSTT
96°6¢C6T
88°6LL

€L B9TT
£Ev"8C¢EC
9T1°69L

L9 L96

€L LT6

€T ¥99PT
6g-89¢¢
TL 9veZZ
0L SLLT
€5°LC6T
LS SZ1C
99°8LST
cZ e6¢ee
y0°2¢t¥C
28°829

Z0°TT9T
LY ¥8LT
6€£°1812C
SS°TdL

08°€S6T
90°¥9s¢
20°2¢e9¢

SENNN S NOANY¥d
NIJLSNHMOH d N4
O¥dIYIENd A TIVHOIRW
¥YSOd ¥1 d0 X MNVIA

IIT NOWIOH [ L3ddTIv
TJOAONITIVM AHLOWIL
338 d NIATIEH
INYV'IEION L MHIANY
NHVISTAIN ¥V LLHEIH
NVHZNO dSSHr
OTIIMNYL & HAHSOrL
YIdVYL ¥ SINT

g9y 4 ddoL

SSOW O THINYJ
IMSMOMNIVIMY d NVYAY¥H
HNANOH VOH ANH
TIVAQd T JOId
YIENYO DININWOJ
SWYITIIM T (Q¥VHOTA
NYWINHL dOI¥daod
SHTHOd TaVYdVd
NHAOON ONONHI
SVYIWYI ¥ TENOJT
O¥VH ¥ YI¥OID
ANTEED ¥ TIVHOINW
ZHWOD YNVId
ZHANYNYEA ¥ YITHOHED
WYHONINNND SHWYL
TTIdd T YHSIHNOJ
IHIANY NVYOI

ITYLIA NVYSOS

NIJVL d SIXHTVY
NOLSINId T QIVHOIA
ZIL30 I NEAHLS
VYILdW ¥ ODEIA
YAXHT 10V

YOTTAYY ILNHJd
ZIANYNUHEH OTIWJHH
YIDYUYD S OIDTIANVW
IT S¥NH ¥ JId9TY
YI¥Nd T AHLOAOA
NOLIOD I dITINr
YZOSTIIIVD L 13491V
JITHONE ¥ ANOWAYA
VIDUVD ZI¥dWY d qavmad

HTHWTEL H ATINA

NOSNVYKW A TdN0OvA

0S0DHdd M HOITVY

€ gOvd 6T/0T/01T

ELYSSEd
TLYSSEA
69%55¢ed
L9%SSEd
S9%S5¢ed
£9¥55¢€d
T9%55¢€d
65955¢8d
LS5YS5¢€d
5595580
€9¥5Sed
TSPSSEd
6¥¥SSEd
L¥PSSEA
S¥¥SSed
E¥PaSed
TP¥955¢ed
6E¥SSEQd
LEYSSEQA
SEvSsed
€EYSSEa
TEPSSEd
62¥55¢d
LZT¥SSEA
SZVSSed
€Zrssted
TZySsed
6T¥S5Ed
LTPSSEd
STPSSted
ET¥SSEd
TT¥SSed
60¥S5€d
L0PSSEQA
S0¥SSeEd
€0¥55¢d
TO¥SSEd
66€£55¢€d
L6ESSEd
S6E55td
£6€S5Ed
T6E£SSEA
68E£S55¢Ed
LB8ESSEd
§8€£55¢d
£8ESSEQ
T8ESSEQ

.6LESSET

S6°BESC
S0°€LCE
ET"T68T
gEv-1eee
¢5°8581
98°6¢€CT
9%°Z9%61
EE E66T
LZ SEBT
YT 6L6T
89°L69C
€06V

6179891
91°96ST
09" ELTT
9579561
6E£°£0SC
8T ¥vL8T
86°62ST
¥Z°S86

¥6°18TT
¥y1°919

1672211
9e°286

66°SCTT
ve ¥99

TT 6611
6676961
20°8%ST
98 1%L

S8°0LYE
L0°0%L

£L° €09

TV 9LeC
oL-Zgoz
€5°%€9C
TL 06S

8L°S08T
8T1°C6S

00" %E9T
81°98S

a0°9s¢e2
2579591
€8°C961
£6°TSLZ
8T €ETH
09°¢289

90°¢CL6T .

00 "PEEPOIT =

HHENHZYIA D NITIV
SHAVH M INIJH

ZIWOD dsor

SYId I dO0LDIA
VYHAOLINNOD A VITHWNOS
HLOAANS d NIHdILS
TIHMOd H NILSOVY
JIOOW ¥ SYIDNOd
TITVHY W XYW

HLIHM L WYITIIM
NOSdWOHL M TAVHOIW
OLOS ¥ WYITIIM
ZodIN0 OAdNVIOod
ZANT.LIVIN O0HIATY
aIadII d MEIHLLYVW
NISNVH ¥ NOJVV
YILAYO L dITIIHd
JIIINDVY OWIHSNY
WJIA OLSI¥YVAH
ZANDTIIA0E W VYNNVIIAY
SHASY O OavydTad

dr NOSLVW [ NOIQ
NOSNHOL M OI¥d
NVWSND d dTYNOd
ZATTNZNOD dDd0r
ZAANVNIAA ¥ QANOD
YZONIdSH VITINr
TTHILNVYD O AHYAIHL
AT TASNIGVH ¥V UHLSHATAS
YIDONISYM V¥ HINVHAHALS
0. ONYNYL £ JASLS
NVWOd [ dsor

W¥Hd O dITIIHd
ZAONHW OLIHIOOId
NILIYW ¥ OINOINY
AINOYT M IV

Aggae a "TTENIYa
@IYNo¥ID D AISYO
OONV¥d  LIdd0y
YZONIdSH W OI¥d
OI¥VSOY THA ¥ TIINVA
SYAHALNOD ¥ VIHIYdYD
ONYD ¥V dvDdd
YIHEOdd W OHATO4OoA
HYIINOV L aIYdTY

L AVIINW 3 WYITIIM
VIDYVD ¥ VYIDITY
NISNADIHX F JOLOIA

YIEWNN LNVIIYM A8 JIALSTIDOHY LNVIIYM TIOYAVd

IVIOL dDVd xx#»

ZLYSSEd
0LPSS¢Ed
89%55¢d
99%S55€ed
¥9¥5S¢ed
29%s5¢ed
09%55¢eQ
85955¢ed
98%55¢d
¥SvSSed
2sbssed
0S¥SSEd
8¥¥SStd
9%¥SSted
v¥PSSed
ZyvySsed
0v¥SSEd
8EV¥SSEd
9EVSSEd
veEYSSeEd
ZEVYSSEd
0EYSSEd
8Z2¥55¢d
9Z¥S5¢Ed
yZvssed
Zevssed
0Z¥Ssed
8T¥SSEd
9T¥SseEd
YIP¥SSEd
ZTvSSsed
0T¥SStEd
80%¥SSEd
907SSEQd
vo0¥SSed
20¥55¢ed
00¥5s¢ed
86€ESS5€Ed
96€£55¢ed
¥6ESSEQ
Z6ESSEQ
06ESSEA
88E£SSEd
98€SSed
y8ESSEd
ZBESSEd
08€SStEd
8LESSEA

Page 62 of 117



T8°600¢
9.°89%¢
L0 6LLT
59°886T
£5°L6ST
65°S6¢EC
09°62CLT
08°LLLE
T ee6T
S6°T1S52
¢6°T68T
0E°00LE
96 "8SST
ySs-2Z8tee
Cy " 8LET
6C° ESS
TL T6E
s5°C1¢
S¥°0ETZ
8% 80¢
25°5c0¢
8%°91¢
LT ¥6¥%
8L Z¥VE
6T°0L

€T €02t
cc 8yl

Z1°1S¢E
Sv-c8s8e
76 TOTT
LB EEY
60°L9CY
08°L69T
€v 12t

TL T2V
58°9¢€8T
2z 1ve
96°818¢
0T Ctl

L6759¢
ET"PEL

S8 8TV
9T °TILT
9¢°S91

L8 TTET
vE"80T

LS 20T

68°98t2

JdLLIN0D T AJYD
dNO0H ¥ AHWWNS
YEONHMIHE ¥ OVEd
DIV d NITIOD
HONVEHSY ¥ AHLOWIL
Y.ISOOVY INNVAOID
SHIVYSOY YNAIY
SATONAHY H NHOL
HNANH XTTdd IV
NOSNOSTH YNATIAH
SOdWVD YINASHD

X449 d AVd

STINOAOVH ¥ NALSIIA
HYODHENYI ¥ HI0UYO
dTHON ¥V INVID

SHWIIM W dIAYA
SHLNOWVIIA d d00¥r
SHONEA ¥YNHSOL

HTADIS NVA AEdJJHL
IITI SIAVAL d HLINNAX
OQHUONVS dHIYVW VYNVA
AVATATIYS YNVIA
SHIVSOY d VIYYW
OSONAHY A¥TUDNS
TIIDIOTd JTTHIAY
OAYIHd H LUNVL
ZANOAYA ONILVYd ATIIWH
ZILY0 dINVHAALS
ONVNNIH-ZIAYO .0 YVIAIIEVD
SYIOHOIN N 'THON
ODDJEN d V¥NID
ZEHONV.INOW ¥ NHOL
UNIJIW SNSHCD
OQYNOJTYW 1 UYNVHOL
Z3d0T N YLSKTVY
INYED ¥ d00Vr
YIDYYD 71 VSSHNVA
NYWIHIA O MIVH
dT-00 N INHIOT
ZAAVHO OQUDTHA ATIVKW
2080 1 TTISID

HLYOHD W TIVHOVY
UNTIYWYO HNEH
NYDD0d€ L NVIAQ
YZOONAW O¥IHyyvd dNsor
SOTVYAY 0 NATISOL
OQVIVATY ¥ YANVYIOA
SHINOWVIIA HSSHL

4 govd 61/0T/0T

69555¢Ed
L9GSSEd
595855¢ed
£9555¢ed
T9555¢€d
65555¢Ed
£5555¢ed
§5555¢d
£5555¢d
TSSSSEd
6755580
L¥555¢ed
S¥SSSeEd
€E¥S5S¢ed
T¥555¢€d
6€£955¢€d
LESSSEQ
SESSSEd
£ESSSEQ
TESSSEd
6255580
LZSSSEd
§52555¢ed
€255G¢ed
TZS5S¢Ed
6TS545¢d
LTSSSEd
STSSSEd
£1555¢d
TTSSSEd
60555¢td
L0SS9S€d
50855¢d
£08S5S¢€Ed
T0SSSEd
66¥SSEd
L6VSSEd
S6¥5S¢ed
€6¥55Ed
T6¥SSEQ
68¥%SSEQd
LB8VSSEQd
S8%¥5Sed
€8¥ssed
8vSsed
6LYSSEA
LLYSSEQ

SLYSSEd.

9%°696T
ET"8TLZ
92°00%E
¥S°S8CY
SC°Z6Td
S0°0L6Y
LT 2ZPST
82 0T8T
S6°"v¥8EY
T5°916¢
VZTITPT
€L ETBT
61" EV6E
€2 PEES
S¥°LTIBE
69°92T
89°8LCT
oT-e2et
TT L6eLC
6L°656
TT €S
0% 55%
LT 6S8T
vZ 0LE
[N %44
£S°67%
T9°€9S
T0°89T
6T°¥%26C
06°€8Y%
L9°809
62°6202
08 TLOT
LT S80€E
59°¢€6
9t°TeC
Z28°919
SE"9LY
E¥°009
TZ S6L
LL"TEZ9T
€5°98LT
TV 6T6T
91" €8T
Zv 8TY
0T " T1%%
0% 860C
89°SLTE

88°6889ST =

JHEWNHD OZNHI
HLIATI™EE S NYAY
YZVIVd dINHY

SOTVAY ¥ OdHIATY
ONV'TTHIVY ¥ O¥adad
IWOOSIA [ TIVHOIW
SVYIrod O AHTHSVY

DNOT ITHM

VATIID 3 ADIVLYd
IV -THd ¥ dINWY
NIMOd W V¥NHD

davd S NOJAVHS
O¥VOIVA [ HILNHONIA
HIVd ¥ SYWOHL

TIIdS 9 SIWIOW

NA d ANVAAIL
YI¥YOLOIA d 10vYd
SHONIA O ASIYAd
YIAIQIVA YIAOYIO
JEIDIAIIAWNTHOS £ NOJINWH
JYYAITIVS OIYOIY™
SYS0d VANVL

O¥HWOU X VUNIYVH
Oavid VXHIVY

Zaydd snsdr

YZVaddd YIdTddvD
NVYONVd NVILSIUHO
OdWYD0 ¥ ADNUN

dAN ¥VAaod JYHAINNAL
ATHEN [ OOVl
THSIVAUN 3 NALSYIA
VNIOHW NYOC
HIXLNIOW VYOHOO YNHAOT
Y YW W INIVTA
AQUYAVH NVYLId
ZEIVZNOD d VUNIIVY
YIONYO d audur
ODILSVIHAd A TIISTYED
ZYIQ YIdId9YO
SONTWWOD 3 HLANNEI
SSO¥D T VANVWY
SVITIISYD W VIJOLOIA
YNSTIVWYD W TIHOVA
ONVAOW-VISILOVE ¥ SIXHTY
JOTIVH L YoodgHY
ZTY9WY HINVHAILS
YIVAYZ NHOL

SYY¥0d NAHJHLS .

YHEWON LNVIIVM A9 JEILSIDHY LNVIYYM TIOJAVYd

TYIOL HOVd xxxx

8955S5¢Ed
99555¢d
¥9555¢ed
29555¢ed
09sS5sted
8G855S5¢ed
96655¢€d
yS555¢€d
25555¢€d
05555¢d
8¥555¢d
9%S555¢Ed
Y¥SS5¢ed
Zy5s5¢ed
0¥S55¢8d
8€555¢td
9€855¢d
vESS5S5Ed
2e555ed
0ESSSEA
82555¢d
92555¢€d
¥2ssseda
2esessta
0ZSSsStd
81555¢d
91555¢€d
PTISSSEd
Z1sssed
0TSSSeEd
805S5¢td
908S85¢€d
¥0SS5¢ed
¢0555¢d
005SStd
867%55td
96¥55¢td
v6¥SSEd
Z6v55¢td
06%SS¢Ed
88YSSEd
98¥55¢ed
¥8¥SSEd
Z28%55¢d
08%55¢ed
8L%SStEd
9LYSSEA
vLPSSEA

Page 63 of 117



TZ°89%¢
66°200L
§S°S62%
80°6¥52
§68°¢ZL90C
vS-0Ccvdy
60°TLTY
9676692
0E°"SYLY
96 1%12
00°vT6C
S9°€S0¢
SZ ET6t
veE"TTCC
66°0¢Z8¢
LE 8T8
T16°698¢2
TL°80TZ
0E"8SSC
8T ELLT
ZL " TTISC
98°998¢
BE°6S85C
¢1°0%992
69°8¢S¢E
ST°ECStE
TE"986¢C
TS C6TE
TZ ¥88¢
(A ARAR%4
LY 998C
TC ¥S8¢
S6°€ESC
2z 1te6t
297 €98T
SE " T00¥
86°9T0¢
2Z°229¢
SZ°9v67¥
TT TEZZ
VL TP8Y
90°€89¢
6v-ceve
6Z°9%0¢C
£€v"9S6T
€8°0L0C
09°1S0¢
SLCTLTT

OONOZITHE W NIWVLNAH
UYNVINYS O ONIT
SHAIY ¥ NOY
ATIYHIW L ANNYQ
TWYHTH A TIVHOIW
SOTIILSNd A NVYAY
ITOYHA L NHOC
YVZYIVS W NVIS
ZaNDIIA0T TAINVA
ZIT¥O OTIILNY¥L NIEAUILS
NIANON O ASdJJHL
AHJINW M ADIYLVd
IDVINYIW d YONINVID
YONHOVW OL3ddOd
JL YIHOT TEVATA
HdT W TIVHAYI
IHOINM [ NOIdY
NOSNHOI W AdOD
NOSVHATD W NVES
O0IJINDTIL ¥ HDYOHAD
oqddOoOSHd N ¥NHSOr
HNIJ NIASM

ZALIOO O oIfinr

OHO I NVYH

ONHINEID O NvAL
NMO¥HE Y AddJAHL
IOISHIHId S NYAH
NOSMNVH 4 NHOL
NMOYE-ZHIVATVY ¥ TIVHOIY
ZANDINX ¥ HTOD
YHWWIM O dDX0d
XdIdTHS I NOIVY
IQETIY 8 JTTIINYA
AUNYY d NHOL
AIJ0I0d I AHI0D
SNIXJ¥dd S NOSYI[
YISSON S THHOLINW
SYTHW [ NYAIH

TIOT Y MIUKW

WIX M Q¥YMad
NISNIL A SYIOAODIN
TIYMOH ¥ NOSYL
NIdavH L SIAVYL
TIID ¥ VI¥OLOIA
SNINASHIA d IL3d90d
L TIIFIIHA JOLOHH
MOTLSH O NEHdHLS
YIIAYA OVVYST

S govd 6T/0T/01

59955¢d
£9955¢d
T99SS€d
65955¢€d
LS955¢ed
§9955¢€d
£5955¢d
TS98SEd
6%955¢€d
L¥95S5¢d
S¥955¢ed
£¥955¢€d
T%9S5SEd
6£955¢ed
L€955¢ed
§£9s5¢ed
£€£955td
TE9S5¢Ed
62955¢t0
LT9S5Ed
§298S5¢d
€£29559td
TZ9SSed
615595€0d
LT9SSed
ST9S8S¢Ed
£€T9S5¢d
TT9SS€ed
60955¢ed
L09Ssed
5095Std
£0955¢d
T09SS5¢d
66555¢€d
L6SSSEQ
§56555¢d
£6555td
T6SSSEd
68555¢€d
L8SSS5¢Ed
§8655¢€d
£8555¢€d
T8555¢d
6L555¢€d
LLSSSEd
§L555¢t0
£ELS55Ed
TLSSS5¢Ed

¥8°£5C¢
LB L69E
L6°9S%¢E
9€°998¢
82°0%9¢
TLOLZY
TL CLZY
0v-€e6l
89°9¢81
89°0LSE
(48 24113
€2°0€6C
Zv-6v92
(VST 47114
£6°G995¢
TI°969¢
6L V9T
{4443
Z6°978¢
§Z°S112¢
0¥ 29¢v%
2Z°895¢
82 TESE
v¥°-S89¢
TV "TSLS
0T-sLLe
LA AR A TAA
ET°86¢LS
S8°68T¢
Z6-C1¢c
96" TBTE
L6°6T9C
0E"08%V
v9°¥LSC
sT1-8LZC
08°260¢
TS ¥10€
60°6%%2
S6°¥¥9S
¥S°9vve
9L°9261
68°818¢
€8°8€09
95°t6tEl
69°S¥EC
90°8¢t0¢
TS°9t0¢
S0°96ST

$S°LO9PSTE =

HTIVH W YEHdOLSIYHO
YEYOTVHNY 4 XAD00"
OdNW W NOSY[
ALYHAVT O NILSOV
5dd¥D ¥ SYWOHL
AdHSVY M 1Nv¥d

ITITI NOSNHHdILS W LJydd0d
IMOEIZNY L DI¥H
ZHydd 4 9YKWO

OAITO I ¥NHSOr
OLLHHOSNW [ JOTIdLVd
NOLIOW d NVHIUN
ADVYIW Y JOTAVL
O¥ddI¥DNT ¥ dASSHL
YARHT JdOTHH

TEINOY W ddLdd
HTAIN L LY990d

Jr ZENAWIL ¥V NIVIAd
TINIDIID DO NVI¥d
VYSNOW-VYAYILSHE N HTTHHOINW
HINYIYOSE [ OLLO

ar oavoTEd T NYNL
dL X4dSYID W NYIYd
WVYHIVEHD T dJWOYHL
ITI VIDOVYSYD NHOCL
NYWMOH 4 XOYdL
aV¥ZHId X V¥NHSor
NOSYHANY 9 Add0d
OTIINYIY ¥ SODYYKW
LHOTYM Y HVYYVS
VIONHTYA d¥Dad
SYEDOY d NILSIYHO
Idyd S SVYWOHL
0DZ0¥0 ZHIIWVH AONIS
WYHd H dITIIHd
NOSTIN S NOJUYY
HSUOW N AWIJHL
NOZVKW 'T &@ddor
SOVAOA d XHLOWIL
AJTTI d ddA0LSIIEA
AdTINH 4 MIIA
HETIVH XOUL

dr sso¥d 4 H4Isor
NOIINA S NOSYC
aoold ¥ IdwA
O@¥YYrvd SAsdr
AdTANad a oo¥d

IIT ASTHINVA dTITIVHO

YITWAN INVIIYM A9 JALSIDHY ILNVIIYM TIOJAVd

TYLOL dOYd sxxx

¥9955¢d
29955¢ed
09555¢€d
85955¢d
9595S5¢€d
¥5955¢ed
25995580
05955€Q
8¥95S€d
9%955¢€d
y$955eEd
Zy95S¢ed
0%955¢€Q
8€955¢€Q
9€9S5¢ed
y£955¢ed
2€995¢ed
0€955¢ed
82955¢ed
92955¢ed
¥2955¢€Ed
229ssted
0Z95S¢€d
81955t
9196S¢ed
¥19S5S¢ed
Z2195S¢d
0T95S¢Ed
8095Std
9095S¢ed
¥0955¢€d
Z2095S¢ed
009S8Ssed
86555¢€d
96555¢€d
¥6555¢€d
2655580
06SSSEQ
88GSSEQ
98S856¢ed
¥8SSSEA
Z28555¢€Q
08555¢€d
8LSSSEd
9L555td
vLSS5S5¢Ed
ZLSSSEd
0LSSsed

Page 64 of 117



20" ¥STY
T9°S2ST
8C¢°GL9T
TZ 600¢
90°901

6E°S0EC
¢6°SS8C
vc-LL8C
9¢°6SLT
SL°81¢C
90°68ST
8E°€ESLT
€2°¥50¢2
9¥%°590¢
02 ¥8¢ET
¥T°098T
TZ°0C%1
ve-90LC
6T LLET
89° €961
CE"SSLT
T¥ 0S8BT
T8 €9%¢t
0S°620T
LL 62CT
9% SPLT
¥Z°"8CLT
£E°L9SE
9270691
T6°SP8T
€6°T1€9T
8% ¥8S¢t
€8 0LTT
CZ°LO6T
Y9 0LLT
6%° S8V

TV "STE

6C°28%

09°0¢28¢t
£€Z " 8eEvVd
B9 LYY

(A A %S 4

90°529¢
¥9°8€S¢E
0c°"v18¢
8E°66T¢E
Z29°181¢
91°vc8e

O1 VAIHWIV d3d ¥ SYIOHOIN
YIVWYO Y THINVYd
KINLITHM T TXIdHD
NYIL &L ¥HONdHdS
JIgdS0S [ ANNV(J
dNOWAHS I ¥ NUSAS
ZANDTIAOY W YHAINNAL
MIVd L AANYVHH

XNT d LIdg0d

NVWZND HIHDUVY
ODSIONVIA W INIJHHIVI
DISNATHA W NONNVHS
HIIMONVY'ITHA S VIEWIN
STTOHDIN [ YIgHd
YAOINOW W NMYA

X1 NHL HNITVYAONI'T

H7T L NOSXTIVY

ODOONIH O XINId
SOLNYd YOINOYIA
AOCUDIIVH-NANVHD T AWWY.L
HININVIE N HINVLLIYY
ZYINOIVY ¥ VI¥VNW
IHOTIMNIYM 9 NVHIUNOL
YIVW d TIN0OvA
OONOZITH SIT dd ¥OT1d
NA NEANON NYA-DNOL
40 OOYOTIVS OQHEddATIY
aauNId ¥ SYIdDNOoa
JYISOW ¥ TAVHOINW

WIM € avHO

YILSO0d W VIJOLOIA
NIYgdad O X304
NOSTHINVA d 1Nvd
WSIHD T HLINNDI

dr SOTYAY ODOSIONWHA
NHDOVA I HH7TYO
YIdVYI NVIIAr

YIOYYD ¥ HAASOr
AINLIHM [ TIWO

YAIAT O O@IyvnNad
NYIHON0D € WYY
SNTHITHEYE ¥ ¥SIT

dL OTITINW INVA
NOSNHOL T NOSYCr
NIQEdEdD 3 TIYHOIW
TYYLS d AHIYO
ZHITWYE 4 SINI
JdTJ40T H SHTIVHD

9 govd 6T/0T/0T

T9LSSEd
6SLSSEQd
LSLSSEQ
SSLSSed
£SLSSET
TSLSSEA
6¥LSSEQd
LYLSSEd
S¥LSSEQd
£vLS55¢Ed
TvLSSEd
6E£LSSEA
LELSSEQ
SELSSEQ
EELSSEd
TELSSEA
62L55¢d
LZLSSEd
SCLSSEQ
€2L5S5¢ed
TCLSSEA
6TLSSEQ
LTLSSEd
STLSSEd
€TLSSEd
TTLSSEd
60LSSEd
LOLSSEd
S0LSSEd
€0LSStEd
TOLSSEd
66955¢€d
L69SS¢EQ
5695S¢€d
£6955¢€d
T6955¢EQ
68955€Q
L89SSEQ
S8955¢€d
£8955¢d
T8985€d
6495580
LL9SSEA
SL955¢ed
€4955¢€d
TL9SSed
6995S¢€d
L9955¢Ed

Lo-zeee
LE 688C
197 €SCT
6L°€06¢E
L8°GS8SC
V. "861¢
TT"29LT
TL ¥9¢€EC
€ET"8ECC
09°8LTC
S0°€9SC
S6°LOST
Zv-esee
6Z2°09LT
LE"C66T
vy -0cCTC
€E0°6L8T
TL°0Z%2
0L 06LT
VE EBET
T1°2CL9T
G2°089¢
L2 E¥9C
L6°¥8%C
¥Z°018%
€0°beCe
vz 8cLT
€L ETST
89°¢¢S

vZ 8CLT
6C°9ST1
¥Z2°8CLT
CT°0€ELT
T8°6¢26

S9°98%

€0°68¢

¥1°99%

ET " VEE

96°02¢

(428444

eV LYe

20°LTISE
Ve LBEE
8Z2°T10T¢
TE t60€
66°9LTC
8T t0%C
£6°6C6C

v6 E0E66T =

NOLTVQ a NVIYd
NODIVY'IV YIANVTIO
dTOIVM YINYS
NVWITHdS 0 VHSUVKW
MOWMOHS d dIODIN
JJOWNYS T VANVL
NVAYd A ¥NILSTIO
SOdWYD -YZOANHEW YSSITIW
davl W NHINT'I
JINIYD 9 YANYRWY
XIad ¥ ¥HJINNEL
dAXIM T TELSXYHO
HONOHWOY A YIAINNAL
NIANON I V¥NIHL
ANVTIVADON O YIdVNW
VHSHOIT YTHONY
NVITINHA XHTIHS
gO¥0dD T dIAYA
TIODSI¥A 9 TTIASSNA
ADINNYL I ¥SSIY¥YO
JOOMIY S VYIAVKW
ONNOA D dIAYd
SYHAN S VYOOdgHd
NNITd O VIDIULVd
OTIIdNd O TIVHOIH
SHNAVYLS M SHTIVHO
ZodInd ¥ sIinid
ZH9dd TENNYWNNI
TITYYEW 3 HLANNIA
AEIVH N HTAX
YIHOSTIA d SHWYL
HLIVNd W JOTAVL

BRI ACAR: (070 <RIV I\ (€
HNYY d NIIA

NA d ¥dTAL

NWAL NOINSM
ZAYVAYL ZIANIWIL L OIDYES
YNavd dd O ¥YINNV.L
VYHOHMASIHLO O NHOL
SYHAOQ O ¥HHAOLSIJYHO
ONNHD D AANVH
NOSITIVY d AENLINOO
X0T W NYXY
SNIHOLNH £ JTYNOd
NVWdO0D [ NOYVY
NOWHOTY ¥ NVAY¥
NHIMOT ¥ AJTAVdd
AGNHZV] ¥ SYIOHODIN

UHIWNN INYIIVM A€ JHLSTOHY INVIIYM TTOUANd

TYIOL dDVd »xx=»

09LSS5¢ed
8GLSSEd
9G6LSS5¢Ed
$SLSS5¢€Ed
ZSLSSEd
0SLSSEd
8¥LSSEd
9¥LSSEQ
YrLSS5ed
ZyLSSeEd
0¥LSS5td
8€L5S¢Ed
9ELSSEd
YELSSEA
Z2eELSSeEd
0ELSSET
82LSS¢Ed
92LSSEd
veLssed
ceLSStEd
0ZLSSEd
8TLSSEd
91LSSeEd
PTLSSEA
Z1LSSed
0TLSStEd
80L5S¢Ed
90LSS¢Ed
v0LSSEd
coLSSEd
00LSStEd
86955¢td
9695Std
¥695S5¢ed
269S5¢d
06955¢d
8895S5¢td
9895S¢€d
¥8955¢Ed
28955¢d
08955¢d
8L955¢d
9L955¢d
¥L95S5¢tEd
2L9585¢ed
0L95S¢ed
89955¢d
9999std

Page 65 of 117



¥OLOTAIA HONVYNIA - ONOS VIDIALVd )

95°S06 ‘%06 ‘T
6L°G29'8SV
€8°00%‘80% ‘T
¥6°8L8'LE

vL 96CP8
Z2e°v9S¢
¥6°1ECY
88°TZLST
8€°0CTC
9€°6€0S
Z29°0¢&S¢E
2Z°66LT

ST T98T
€S EETL
99°62%T
06°80S

¥9°€E91S
96°SE8T

90°9¢&ESE
L6 9ET

T1°666T

€9°T6TC
LE 695V
SETECLE
60°TO%C
00°TLOE
S52°880%
€5°%0ST
£€C°29LE
€L°TOCZ
25°089¢
€S5°200¢
€6°6ECE
9L° 0662
18" 6%22

2 =28 )

0 ILNJNdOTHAHA ILNIWAOTIWH
0P EH#VIEO HAIT LSHAM IVHID
Nno ANVYTHLOOS

NSSY HDITOd
VYIFOLOIA L aod

Ovd A (ONVNY
NYYIDOVIOW JLOHOVA
ODONTIH d HINJH
YZONIdSH T ¥NYJHA
SMHMANY J NIAHLS
YITHNZNATYA ANOHINY
HZTINHDOS I UYNJILYA
YHAOLS L YINV'I
SAIVHOIY d HINVHJALS
HdT H ANYL

NIZLSTIOH ¥ NSNS
YAIIO O AYVHW
O¥IININD ¥ DOI¥d
YLIWZ d WYaY
YIISSHL W TNVYd
NEIDTHHS W ddHJOLSI¥HO
NVAVd ¥ SINTI

dr ZANTILIYAW OTAVR
SWINT M NIHAHLS

ANIT W MEddA

ONY'IOM 1 HddSOor
NY@IOor 4 dIvyddd
HNANH ¥ IHL

VIHdH @ gsor
@OAIATD L LIHFOA
SMNVIA d SHWYLD

L dOYd

6T1/0T/0T

LEITM

SE9ZM

61855€d
LT8SSEA
S18SS¢Ed
£T8S55¢ed
TT8SSEd
60855¢d
L08SSEd
S08SSEd
£085S5¢ed
T08SSEd
66LSS¢Ed
L6LSSEA
S6LSSEd
€6LSSEQ
T6LSSEA
68LSSEQ
LBLSSEd
S8LSSEd
£8LSSEA
T8LSSEd
6LLSSET
LLLSSET
SLLSSEA
€LLSSET
TLLSSEQ
69LSSed
L9LSSEd
§9LSSEd
£9L55¢d

-jooxayl juswied I0J oTqeTTeAR a1 Spunj pue AoeInooe IOJ
poaTpne UsSq 3A®'Y ‘6T0Z ID0 2z TTouno) A3TD 2A0IDH USpIeDH 3yl O3 palilTuqns Ia3sThay 110aked sy3 ut pojussaxd

09°¥SLTIBT
€T°0T006
00°6S297%
Tv L9%E
Z8°LEEC
ANES 28
9% 011t
6L°255¢
Z8-81¢¢
957 ¢S61T
LE COLT
Z€1°569T
8Z°€20¢C
85°98T¢
G8°€80¢€
90°619
8L°809¢C
¥E€°90TT
89°vLVC
2L°800¢t
89°68T¢
80°LZLY
g€0"2CLLT
LY T9SC
LO"LYP6C
20°68LE
0E"8VPE
L0 2Z9¢EE
66°890¢C
1528 : 18 X4
6V C86T

LE9ZM# TLIUI PE9ZMH# SITm pUR ‘6T18SSEQ# NIYI 0TZSSEQ# s3Tsodad 309ITA PUeR ‘TELESTH NIYI BOLEBTH SMO3UD

8¢9 SINHWAYd TYLOL ONYID
14 SINIWAYd HIIM IV.LOL
019 SLISOddd LOFEIAd IYLOL
vz SINHWAYA MOHHD TVLOL
6T1°650699 = TYLOL HDVd  #xx%

HOIAYES HNNAAHY TYNJIHLNT
ovE# LSV HAIT LSAM LVAED
no I¥o 0Ss

NOLSNIM HLIEX THIYHL
ZIYVYMHOS W H4ESOr
LLIJ408d [ TION
SSHOTI ¥ AHYIA0dD
OTTYD ¥VSHD

DNVHO § HONHIHL
YIATIM D AANVD
NOSNVMS I MEHLLVW
aI0od T ¥NNV
NOSNHHJELS W NATLIVO
VAW ¥ TITYIIHS

NYMY X HNVIT

LIVH W IANVId
AJIAVIE M YNNVLC
YTHOSOd ¥ TTUYNOY
HTaYYM SINNACd

anodlLs I NVI¥d
ZHATWYY W YIIdL
OITOAIN O WYAV
ONYHOIVW d MIHLLVRW
Z2dd0T dIAvd

SOVAOT d VA1
HNNETITIAL ¥ ADTAELVYd
NISNHL L TEYHOIW
AYMOTIOH I WYITIIM
INIJH H NIAILS
YIDYYD dLdd
SNEIgSHd & QYVHOIY

JTEWON INVRIUM A9 JILSIOTY LNVIIYM TIOJYAVd

9¢92ZM

TE9TM

81855¢ed
91855td
¥18S5¢Ed
2T8s8s¢td
0T8SS¢Ed
80855¢td
90855td
¥0855sted
208ss¢ed
008Ss5€Ed
86LSSEQd
96LS5¢ed
v6LS5¢Ed
Z6L55¢d
06L55¢td
88LSS¢Ed
98LSSEd
¥8LSStEd
Z28LSSEd
08LSStEd
8LLSSEA
9LLSSEA
YLLSSET
ZLLSSEd
0LLSSEA
89LS5S¢td
99.L8S¢ed
¥9LS5¢tEd

29.Lssed .

Page 66 of 117



To:
Dept.:

Subject:

Agenda Item - 3.a.

City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

Scott C. Stiles From: Teresa Pomeroy
City Manager Dept.: City Clerk
Appointment to fill a vacancy Date: 10/22/2019

on the Administrative Board
of Appeals. (Continued from
September 10, September
24, and October 8, 2019.)
(Action Item)

Attached is a list of applicants interested in completing the term left by Dr. Pauline

Merry on the

ATTACHMENTS:

Description

Administrative
Board of Appeals
Applicant List

Administrative Board of Appeals.

Upload Date Type File Name
Backup 9-10-
10/15/2019 Material 19_Administrative_Board_of_ Appeals_applicants_to_fill_vacancy.pdf

Page 67 of 117



NAME
Bram, Allen
Do, Anh

Lee, Jeffrey
Lindsay, Josh
Porter, Dale

Thomas, Sean

ADMINISTRATIVE BOARD OF APPEALS APPLICANTS

APPLICATION DATE

December 17, 2018
December 16, 2018
June 26, 2019

July 1, 2019
December 14, 2018

June 27,2019

Page 68 of 117



Agenda Item - 4.a.
City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: John Montanchez
Dept.: City Manager Dept.: Community Services
Subject: Consideration and approval Date: 10/22/2019

of the Parks, Recreation and
Facilities Master Plan.
(Action Item)

OBJECTIVE

To provide the City Council with a presentation and final draft of the Parks,
Recreation and Facilities Master Plan.

BACKGROUND

In 2018, the Community Services Department contracted Richard Fisher Associates
(RFA) to develop a 15-year Parks, Recreation and Facilities Master Plan that would
help guide the City in the planning, maintenance, and development and/or
rehabilitation of Garden Grove parks and recreation facilities.

DISCUSSION

The Community Services Department and consultant, RFA, have completed the final
draft of a 15-year Parks, Recreation and Facilities Master Plan, which is available for
review in the Community Services Department. The consultant, RFA, has prepared a
presentation to review key findings and recommendations of the Master Plan.

The Parks, Recreation and Arts Commission reviewed the draft Master Plan at their
meeting on October 2, 2019, and recommended transmittal to the City Council by a
5-2 vote with Commissioners No and Ramirez absent.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

The Master Plan provides estimated costs for recommended improvements at city
parks and facilities. These recommendations have no impact on the city's current
General Fund budget.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council:

Page 69 of 117



e Consider the final draft of the Parks, Recreation and Facilities Master Plan for
approval.

By: Janet Pelayo, Community Services Manager

Page 70 of 117



Agenda Item - 4.b.
City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: Omar Sandoval
Dept.: City Manager Dept.: City Attorney
Subject: First reading and introduction of Date: 10/22/2019

an Ordinance adopting the 2019
California Building Standards
Code with modifications

OBJECTIVE

To introduce an Ordinance adopting the 2019 Edition of the California Building Standards
Code with certain amendments and certain Uniform Codes, including findings supporting the
modifications.

BACKGROUND

The State’s Health and Safety Code establishes that the Building and Fire Standards Code
(Title 24, California Code of Regulations) as published by the California Building Standards
Commission every 3 years, is the applicable code for occupancies throughout the State. The
Building Standards Commission published the 2019 California Building and Fire Standards
Code on July 1, 2019, and it becomes effective January 1, 2020. During this waiting period,
local governments may adopt modifications that impose more restrictive building and fire
safety standards to the California Building Standards Code when deemed necessary because
of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions, or when the revisions are purely
administrative.

DISCUSSION

The attached Ordinance adopts and amends the 2019 Editions of the California Building,
Residential, Electrical, Mechanical, Plumbing, Energy, Historical Building, Fire, Existing
Building, Green Building and Referenced Standards Codes, adopted by the State of
California; and adopts the 2018 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code, and
the 2018 Edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code. The Community and
Economic Development Department and Orange County Fire Authority are recommending
changes and modifications to the 2019 California Building Standards Code.

The proposed modifications are intended to increase safety to life and property from fire and
other hazards. Many of the proposed modifications are carried over from previous code
adoption and revisions. After introduction, State law requires that the City Clerk publish a
notice of public hearing for two weeks. The City Council is required to hold a public hearing

prior to adoption. A public hearing will be scheduled for the Council's regular meeting on
November 12, 2019 for second reading and adoption of the ordinance.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

Page 71 of 117



There is no financial impact to the City.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council:

e Conduct first reading and introduce the attached ordinance.

ATTACHMENTS:

... Upload .
Description Date Type File Name
CcC . 10-22-
Ordinance 10/18/2019 Ordinance

19_Ordinance_Adopting_2019_California_Building_Standards_Code_with_amendments.pdf

Page 72 of 117



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDEN
GROVE AMENDING TITLE 18 OF THE GARDEN GROVE MUNICIPAL
CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE FOLLOWING PRIMARY
CODES WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, DELETIONS, AND ADDITIONS
THERETO: CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE,
2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, 2019 EDITION;
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA ENERGY
CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE,
2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2019 EDITION; CALIFORNIA
REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE, 2019 EDITION; AND CERTAIN
SECONDARY CODES INCLUDING THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE, 2018 EDITION, AS PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; AND THE INTERNATIONAL
SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE, 2018 EDITION, AS PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

City Attorney Summary

This Ordinance adopts and amends the 2019 Editions of the California Building,
Residential, Plumbing, Electrical, Mechanical, Energy, Historical Building, Fire, Existing
Building, Green Building, and Referenced Standards Codes, adopted by the State of
California. This Ordinance further adopts the 2018 Editions of the International Property
Maintenance and International Swimming Pool and Spa Codes.

A. RECITALS.

(i) Article 2 of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 1 of Title 5 of the California
Government Code (§§ 50022.1 et seq.) authorizes the adoption, by reference, of the
California Building Code, 2019 Edition; the California Residential Code, 2019 Edition; the
California Electrical Code, 2019 Edition; the California Mechanical Code, 2019 Edition;
the California Plumbing Code, 2019 Edition; the California Energy Code, 2019 Edition;
the California Historical Building Code, 2019 Edition; the California Fire Code, 2019
Edition; the California Existing Building Code, 2019 Edition; the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2019 Edition; and the California Referenced Standards Code, 2019
Edition as adopted into the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Parts 2 through 6
and Parts 8 through 12 respectively (collectively, the "California Building Standards
Code"); the International Property Maintenance Code, 2018 Edition; and the International
Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2018 Edition.

(i) Pursuant to the provisions of the California Health and Safety Code Section
17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7, it is determined that the amendments of building standards

1447666.1 Page 73 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 2

within the California Building Standards Code in this Ordinance are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions as more particularly
identified in Section 7 of this Ordinance.

(iif)  Adoption by reference of those additional Uniform Codes is not subject to
Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code.

(iv) A duly noticed public hearing, as required by California Government Code
Section 50022.3, has been conducted and concluded prior to the adoption of this
Ordinance.

(v)  Alllegal prerequisites to the adoption of this Ordinance have occurred.
B. ORDINANCE

NOW, THEREFORE, the City Council of the City of Garden Grove does hereby find,
determine and ordain as follows:

SECTION 1: Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code, entitled Building Codes and
Regulations, of the City of Garden Grove is hereby amended as set forth herein, provided
that said amendments shall not apply to, or excuse any violation thereof occurring prior
to the effective date of this Ordinance and provided further that the California Building
Standards Code and Uniform Codes as adopted by reference and amended by Ordinance
No. 2876 of this City shall continue to be applicable to construction for which permits have
been issued prior to the effective date of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2: Chapter 18.04 of Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby
repealed and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 18.04

CODES ADOPTED BY REFERENCE
Section:
18.04.010 Codes Designated — Filing.

18.04.010 Codes Designated — Filing.

The California Building Code, 2019 Edition, based on the 2018 International Building
Code as published by the International Code Council, including Division Il of Chapter
1, and appendices H, | and J; California Residential Code, 2019 Edition, based on the
2018 International Residential Code as published by the International Code Council,
including Division II of Chapter 1, and appendices H, J and V; California Electrical
Code, 2019 Edition, based on the 2017 National Electrical Code as published by the
National Fire Protection Association; California Mechanical Code, 2019 Edition, based
on the 2018 Uniform Mechanical Code as published by the International Association

1447666.1 Page 74 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 3

of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, including appendices B and C; California
Plumbing Code, 2019 Edition, based on the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code as
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials,
including appendices A, B, C, D, G, H, and I; California Energy Code, 2019 Edition,
as published by the International Code Council; California Historical Building Code,
2019 Edition, as published by the International Code Council; California Fire Code,
2019 Edition, based on the 2018 International Fire Code as published by the
International Code Council, including appendices B, BB, C, and CC; California
Existing Building Code, 2019 Edition, based on the 2018 International Existing
Building Code as published by the International Code Council; California Green
Building Standards Code, 2019 Edition, as published by the International Code
Council; and California Referenced Standards Code, 2019 Edition, as published by
the International Code Council as adopted into the California Code of Regulations,
Title 24, Parts 2 through 6, and 8 through 12 respectively; International Property
Maintenance Code, 2018 Edition as published by the International Code Council; and
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2018 Edition as published by the
International Code Council; are hereby adopted by reference as the Building Codes
and Regulations of the City of Garden Grove, together with amendments set forth in
Chapters 18.12, 18.14, 18.24 and 18.32 of this Title.

SECTION 3: Chapter 18.12 of Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby
repealed and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 18.12

BUILDING CODE

Sections:
18.12.010 Section 101.1 Amended — Title.
18.12.020 Section 113 Amended — Board of Appeals.
18.12.030 Section 105.2 Amended — Work exempt from permit.
18.12.040 Section [F]903.2 Amended — Where required.
18.12.050 Table 1505.1 Amended — Roofing Classification.
18.12.060 Section 1505.1.3 Amended — Roof coverings within all other

areas.

18.12.010 Section 101.1 Amended — Title. Section 101.1 is hereby amended
to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the
City of Garden Grove, hereinafter referred to as "this Code."

18.12.020 Section 113 Amended — Board of Appeals. Section 113 (including
subsections) is hereby amended and restated to read as follows:

1447666.1 Page 75 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 4

1447666.1

113 Board of Appeals. The Administrative Board of Appeals for the City
shall hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made
by the Building Official relative to the application and interpretations of the
Building Codes and Regulations of the City of Garden Grove including,
without limitation, this Code. Refer to Title 2, Chapter 2.54, of this Code.

18.12.030 Section 105.2 Amended — Work exempt from permit. Item # 2
under Building is hereby amended to read as follows:

2. Masonry and/or concrete fences not over three (3) feet high and
other fences not over seven (7) feet high.

18.12.040 Section [F]903.2 Amended — Where required. Section [F]903.2 is
hereby amended by adding the following after the first paragraph:

Notwithstanding any other provisions in this Code, approved automatic
sprinkler systems shall be installed and maintained in accordance with the
latest edition of NFPA Standard 13 throughout all new buildings or
structures, regardless of fire walls, with a gross floor area of 6,000 square
feet or more, or with a total height of 55 feet or more above grade, or
containing three or more stories.

Buildings or structures which presently exceed 6,000 square feet of floor
area constructed prior to the adoption of this Code, upon or to which any
alteration or additions are to be made which would add more than 2,000
square feet to the existing square footage of this building, shall have
automatic sprinklers installed, as required herein and above.

Buildings or structures which presently do not exceed 6,000 square feet of
floor area, to which any alterations or additions are made, and after such
alterations or additions the floor area will exceed 8,000 square feet, shall
have automatic sprinkler systems installed, as required herein and above.
(Balance of Section to remain unchanged.)

18.12.050 Table 1505.1 Amended — Roofing Classification. Table 1505.1 is

hereby amended by the deletion of Table 1505.1 and the addition of a new Table
1505.1 thereto to read as follows:

Page 76 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 5

TABLE 1505.12
MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION
FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

1A IB A 1B A B \Y VA VB
B B B B B B B B B
For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8mm, 1 square foot = 0.0929m?

a. Unless otherwise required in accordance with Chapter 7A.

18.12.060 Section 1505.1.3 Amended — Roof coverings within all other areas.
Section 1505.1.3 is hereby amended by the deletion of the entire section and the
addition of a new section thereto, to read as follows:

1505.1.3 Roof coverings within all other areas. The entire roof covering
of every existing structure where more than 50 percent of the total area is
replaced within any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every new
structure, and any roof covering applied in the alteration, repair or
replacement of the roof of every existing structure, shall be a fire-retardant
roof covering that is at least Class B.

SECTION 4: Chapter 18.14 of Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby
repealed and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 18.14

RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sections:

18.14.010 Section R101.1 Amended — Title.

18.14.020 Section R112 Amended — Board of Appeals.

18.14.030 Section R902.1 Amended — Roofing covering materials.

18.14.040 Section R902.1.3 Amended — Roof coverings in all other
areas.

18.14.050 Section R902.2 Amended — Fire-retardant-treated shingles
and shakes.

18.14.010 Section R101.1 Amended — Title. Section 101.1 is hereby amended to
read as follows:

R101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code of the City

of Garden Grove, and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as "this
Code."

1447666.1 Page 77 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 6

18.14.020 Section R112 Amended — Board of Appeals. Section R112 is hereby
amended and restated to read as follows:

R112 Board of Appeals. The Administrative Board of Appeals for the City shall
hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
Building Official relative to the application and interpretations of the Building Codes
and Regulations of the City of Garden Grove including, without limitation, this
Code. Refer to Title 2, Chapter 2.54, of this Code.

18.14.030 Section R902.1 Amended - Roof covering materials.
Section R902.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as
set forth in Sections R904 and R905. A minimum Class A or B roofing shall be
installed in areas designated by this section or where the edge of the roof is less
than 3 feet from a lot line. Class A and B roofing required by this section to be
listed shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 108.

Exceptions:

1. Class A roof assemblies include those with coverings of brick, masonry
and exposed concrete roof deck.

2. Class A roof assemblies include ferrous or copper shingles or sheets,
metal sheets and shingles, clay or concrete roof tile, or slate installed on
noncombustible decks.

3. Class A roof assemblies include minimum 16 ounces per square foot
copper sheets installed over combustible decks.

4. Class A roof assemblies include slate installed over underlayment over
combustible decks.

18.14.040 Section R902.1.3 Amended - Roof coverings in all other areas. Section
R902.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R902.1.3 Roof coverings in all other areas. The entire roof covering of every
existing structure where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is replaced
within any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every new structure and any
roof covering applied in alteration, repair or replacement of the roof of every
existing structure, shall be a fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class B.

18.14.050 Section R902.2 Amended — Fire-retardant-treated shingles and
shakes. The first paragraph of Section R902.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R902.2 Fire-retardant-treated shingles and shakes. Fire-retardant-treated
wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes and shingles complying with UBC
Standard 15-3 or 15-4 which are impregnated by the full-cell vacuum-pressure
process with fire-retardant chemicals, and which have been qualified by UBC

1447666.1 Page 78 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 7

Standard 15-2 for use on Class A or B roofs. Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes
and shingles shall comply with ICC-ES EG107 and with the weathering
requirements contained in Health and Safety Code Section 13132.7 (j). Each
bundle shall bear labels from an ICBO accredited quality control agency identifying
their roof-covering classification and indicating their compliance with ICC-ES EG
107 and with the weathering requirements contained in Health and Safety Code
Section 13132.7(j).

SECTION 5: Chapter 18.24 of Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby
repealed and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 18.24

PLUMBING CODE

Sections:
18.24.010 Section 610.8 Amended — Size of Meter and Building
Supply Pipe Using Table 610.4.
18.24.020 Table 610.4 Amended — Fixture Unit Table for

Determining Water Pipe and Meter Sizes.

18.24.010 Section 610.8 Amended — Size of Meter and Building Supply Pipe
Using Table 610.4. The last paragraph of Section 610.8 is hereby amended to read
as follows:

No building supply pipe shall be less than one (1) inch in diameter for single-family
dwellings and 3/4 inch in diameter for all other buildings.

18.24.020 Table 610.4 Amended — Fixture Unit Table for Determining Water
Pipe and Meter Sizes. Footnote Number 2 of Table 610.4 is hereby amended to read
as follows:

2. Building supply - not less than 1" diameter for each single-family dwelling unit,
and not less than 34” diameter for all other buildings.

SECTION 6: Chapter 18.32 of Title 18 of the Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby
repealed and replaced in its entirety to read as follows:

Chapter 18.32
FIRE CODE
Sections:
18.32.010 Enforcement and Inspections.
18.32.020 Amendments to 2019 California Fire Code.

1447666.1 Page 79 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 8

18.32.010 Enforcement and Inspections. The 2019 California Fire Code shall be
enforced by the Orange County Fire Authority, which shall be operated under the
Director of Fire Services of the Orange County Fire Authority. The Director of Fire
Services of the Fire Authority may detail such members of the Fire Authority as
inspectors as shall be necessary from time to time.

18.32.020 Amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code.

Chapter 1
Scope and Administration

Chapter 1, Scope and Administration, is adopted in its entirety, with the exception of
Section 109, and with the following amendments:

Section 110.4, Violation penalties, is amended to read as follows:

110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or shall fail to comply with
any issued orders or notices or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
subject to penalties assessed as prescribed in the OCFA Prevention Field Services
adopted fee schedule. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 110.4.2, Infraction and misdemeanor, is hereby added as follows:
110.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor. Persons operating or maintaining any
occupancy, premises or vehicle subject to this code that shall permit any fire or life
safety hazard to exist on premises under their control shall be guilty of an infraction.
Persons who fail to take immediate action to abate a fire or life safety hazard when

ordered or notified to do so by the chief or a duly authorized representative are
guilty of a misdemeanor.

Chapter 2
Definitions

Chapter 2, Definitions, is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

Section 202, General Definitions, is amended by adding “OCFA,” and “Spark Arrester”
as follows:

OCFA. Orange County Fire Authority, fire authority having jurisdiction.

1447666.1 Page 80 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 9

SPARK ARRESTER. A listed device constructed of noncombustible material
specifically for the purpose of meeting one of the following conditions:

1. Removing and retaining carbon and other flammable particles/debris from the
exhaust flow of an internal combustion engine in accordance with California
Vehicle Code Section 38366.

2. Fireplaces that burn solid fuel in accordance with California Building Code
Chapter 28.

Chapter 3
General Requirements

Chapter 3, General Requirements, is adopted in its entirety, with the exception of
Sections 308.1.4, 311.5 through 311.5.5, 318, and 319, and with the following
amendments:

Section 304.1.2, Vegetation, is amended to read as follows:

304.1.2 Vegetation. Weeds, grass, vines or other growth that is capable of being
ignited and endangering property, shall be cut down and removed by the owner or
occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance requirement in urban-wildland
interface areas shall be in accordance with Chapter 49. Type, amount,
arrangement, and maintenance of vegetation in a fuel modification area, interior
slope, or similarly hazardous area shall be in accordance with OCFA Guideline C-
05 “Vegetation Management Guideline—Technical Design for New Construction,
Fuel Modification Plans, and Maintenance Program.”

Section 305.6, Hazardous conditions, is added to read as follows:

305.6 Hazardous conditions. Outdoor fires burning wood or other solid fuel are
not allowed when any of the following conditions applies:

1. when predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH and relative humidity is
less than 25%, or a red flag condition has been declared

2. when an official sign was caused to be posted by the fire code official,
or a public announcement is made

No outdoor fires using any fuel type are permitted when predicted sustained winds

exceed 20 MPH or when such fires present a hazard as determined by the fire
code official.

1447666.1 Page 81 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 10

Section 305.7, Disposal of rubbish, is added to read as follows:

305.7 Disposal of rubbish. Rubbish, trash or combustible waste material shall
be burned only within an approved incinerator and in accordance with Section
307.2.1.

Section 307.6, Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies, is added to read as follows:

307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or similar devices used at
Group R Occupancies. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits, fire rings, or similar exterior
devices used at Group R occupancies shall comply with this section.

Exception: Barbeques, grills, and other portable devices intended solely for
cooking.

Section 307.6.1, Gas-fuel devices, is hereby added as follows:

307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits and similar devices
fueled by natural gas or liquefied-petroleum gas are allowed when approved by
the Building Department and the device is designed to only burn a gas flame and
not wood or other solid fuel. At R-3 occupancies, combustible construction and
vegetation shall not be located within three feet of an atmospheric column that
extends vertically from the perimeter of the device. At other R occupancies, the
minimum distance shall be ten feet. Where a permanent Building Department
approved hood and vent is installed, combustible construction may encroach upon
this column between the bottom of the hood and the vent opening. Where
chimneys or vents are installed, they shall have a spark arrester as defined in
Section 202.

Section 307.6.2, Devices using wood or fuels other than natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas, is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas. Permanent outdoor fireplaces burning wood or other solid fuel
shall be constructed in accordance with the California Building Code with
clearance from combustible construction and building openings as required
therein. Fires in a fireplace shall be contained within a firebox with an attached
chimney. The opening in the face of the firebox shall have an installed and
maintained method of arresting sparks.

The burning of wood or other solid fuel in a device is not allowed within 25 feet of

combustible structures unless within an approved permanent fireplace, Conditions
which could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet of a structure or to vegetation

1447666.1 Page 82 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 11

shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Fires in devices burning wood or solid fuel shall
be in accordance with Sections 305, 307, and 308.

Exceptions:

1. Portable fireplaces and fire rings/pits equipped with a device to arrest
sparks shall be located at least 3’ from combustible construction at R-3
occupancies,

2. Portable fireplaces, and fire pits/rings equipped with a device to arrest
sparks, shall be located at least 15 feet from combustible structures at other
R occupancies.

Section 307.6.2.1, Where prohibited, is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2.1 Where prohibited. The burning of wood and other solid fuels shall not
be conducted within a fuel modification zone, Wildfire Risk Area (WRA), Wildland-
Urban Interface Area (WUI), or in locations where conditions could cause the
spread of fire to the WRA or WUI.

Exceptions:

1. Permanent fireplaces that are not located in a fuel modification zone.

2. Where determined by the Fire Code Official that the location or design of
the device should reasonably prevent the start of a wildfire.

Section 308.1.6.3, Sky lanterns, is amended to read as follows:

308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns. A person shall not ignite, release, or cause to be released
a sky lantern.

Section 321, Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction, is added to read
as follows:

321 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction. All new structures
and facilities adjoining land containing hazardous combustible vegetation shall be
approved and in accordance with the requirements of OCFA Guideline C-05
“Vegetation Management Guideline — Technical Design for New Construction Fuel
Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.”

Section 322, Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways, is added to read
as follows:

322 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways. The fire code
official is authorized to cause areas within 10 feet (3048 mm) on each side of
portions of highways and private streets which are improved, designed or ordinarily
used for vehicular traffic, to be cleared of flammable vegetation and other

1447666.1 Page 83 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 12

combustible growth. Measurement shall be from the flow-line or the end of the
improved edge of the roadway surfaces.

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery or cultivated ground
cover such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as ground covers,
provided that they do not form a means of readily transmitting fire.

Section 323, Unusual Circumstances, is added to read as follows:

323 Unusual circumstances. The fire code official may suspend enforcement of
the vegetation management requirements and require reasonable alternative
measures designed to advance the purpose of this code if determined that in any
specific case that any of the following conditions exist:

1. Difficult terrain.
2. Danger of erosion.
3. Presence of plants included in any state and federal resources agencies,

California Native Plant Society and county-approved list of wildlife, plants,
rare, endangered and/or threatened species.

4. Stands or groves of trees or heritage trees.

5. Other unusual circumstances that make strict compliance with the
clearance of vegetation provisions undesirable or impractical.

Section 324, Use of Equipment, is added to read as follows:

324 Use of equipment. Except as otherwise provided in this section, no person
shall use, operate, or cause to be operated in, upon or adjoining any hazardous
fire area any internal combustion engine which uses hydrocarbon fuels, unless the
engine is equipped with a spark arrester as defined in Section 202 maintained in
effective working order, or the engine is constructed, equipped and maintained for
the prevention of fire.

Exceptions:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck tractors, buses, and
passenger vehicles, except motorcycles, are not subject to this section if
the exhaust system is equipped with a muffler as defined in the Vehicle
Code of the State of California.

2. Turbocharged engines are not subject to this section if all exhausted gases
pass through the rotating turbine wheel, there is no exhaust bypass to the
atmosphere, and the turbocharger is in good mechanical condition

1447666.1 Page 84 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 13

Section 324.1, Equipment and devices generating heat, sparks or open flames, is
added to read as follows:

324.1 Equipment and devices generating heat, sparks or open flames.
During any time of the year within Wildfire Risk Areas, within or immediately
adjacent to any forest- or brush-covered land or non-irrigated grass-covered land,
no person shall use or operate any welding equipment, cutting torches, tar pots,
grinding devices, or other tools or equipment that may produce a spark, fire, or
flame that could result in a wildfire without doing the following:

1. First clearing away all flammable material, including snags, from the area
around such operation for a distance of 30 feet or other approved method
to reduce fire spread into the wildlands. If 30 foot clearing cannot be
achieved, then an alternate method shall be approved by the AHJ prior to
work starting.

2. Maintain one serviceable round point shovel with an overall length of not
less than forty-six (46) inches and one backpack pump water-type fire
extinguisher fully equipped and ready for use at the immediate area during
the operation.

3. Stop work when winds are 8 MPH or greater during periods when relative
humidity is less than 25%, or a red flag condition has been declared or
public announcement is made, when an official sign was caused to be
posted by the fire code official, or when such fires present a hazard as
determined by the fire code official.

4. Keep a cell phone nearby and call 911 immediate in case of fire.

Section 324.2, Sparks arresters, is added to read as follows:

324.2 Spark arresters. Spark arresters shall comply with Section 202, and when
affixed to the exhaust system of engines or vehicles subject to Section 324 shall
not be placed or mounted in such a manner as to allow flames or heat from the
exhaust system to ignite any flammable material.

Chapter 4
Emergency Planning and Preparedness

Chapter 4, Emergency Planning and Preparedness. Only the following sections,
subsections, and amendment are adopted as listed below:

401 -401.9
402
403.2

1447666.1

Page 85 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.

Page 14
403.5-403.54
403.10.2.11
403.13 —403.13.3
404.5 - 404.6.6
407

Section 407.5 is amended to read as follows:

407.5 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement. Where required by the fire
code official, each application for a permit shall OCFA’s Chemical Classification
Packet in accordance with Section 5001.5.2.

Chapter 5
Fire Service Features

Chapter 5, Fire Service Features, is adopted in its entirety with the following
amendments:

Section 501.1, Scope, is amended to read as follows:

501.1 Scope. Fire service features for buildings, structures and premises shall
comply with this chapter and, where required by the fire code official, with OCFA
Guideline B-09, “Fire Master Plan for Commercial & Residential Development.”
Fire service features for buildings, structures and premises located in State
Responsibility Areas, and Local Responsibility Areas designated as Very High
Hazard Fire Severity Zone shall also comply with OCFA Guideline B-09a, “Fire
Safe Development in State Responsibility Areas, and Local Responsibility Areas
designated as Very High Hazard Fire Severity Zone”.

Section 510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings is amended to
read as follows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings. All new
buildings shall have approved radio coverage for emergency responders within the
building based upon the existing coverage levels of the public safety
communication systems utilized by the jurisdiction, measured at the exterior of the
building. This section shall not require improvement of the existing public safety
communication systems. The Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System
shall comply with the Orange County Sheriff's Department, Communications and
Technology Division guidelines and specifications and, where the functionality or
performance requirements in the California Fire Code are more stringent, this
code.

1447666.1 Page 86 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.

Page 15

Exceptions:

1. In buildings or structures where it is determined by the fire code official that
the radio coverage system is not needed, including but not limited to the
following:

a. Existing buildings or structures, unless required by the Building

Official and OCFA for buildings and structures undergoing extensive
remodel and/or expansion.
b. Elevators.
C. Structures that meet all of the following:
I. Three stories or less, and
ii. Do not have subterranean storage or parking, and
iii. Do not exceed 50,000 square feet on any single story.
d. Structures that meet all of the following:
i. Residential structures four stories or less, and
ii. Constructed of wood, and
iii. Do not have subterranean storage or parking, and
iv. Are not built integral to an above ground multi-story parking
structure.
Should a structure that is three stories or less and 50,000 square feet or
smaller on any single story include subterranean storage or parking, then
this chapter shall apply only to the subterranean areas.

2. In facilities where emergency responder radio coverage is required and
such systems, components or equipment required could have a negative
impact on the normal operations of the facility, the fire code official shall
have the authority to accept an automatically activated emergency radio
coverage system.

Section 510.2, Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings, is deleted
without replacement.

Section 510.3, Permit required, is deleted without replacement.

Chapter 6
Building Services and Systems

Chapter 6, Building Services and Systems, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 7
Fire and Smoke Protection Features

Chapter 7, Fire and Smoke Protection Features, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

1447666.1 Page 87 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 16

Chapter 8
Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings

Chapter 8, Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings, is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 9
Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems

Chapter 9, Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems, is adopted in its entirety with the
following amendments:

Section 903.2, Where required, is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in buildings and
structures shall be provided when one of the following conditions exists:

1. New Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of
Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.19 an automatic fire-extinguishing
system shall also be installed in all occupancies when the total
building area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2) as defined in
Section 202, regardless of fire areas or allowable area.

Exception: Subject to approval by the Fire Code Official, open
parking garages in accordance with Section 406.5 of the California
Building Code.

2. Existing Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions of this
code, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in an existing
building when an addition occurs and when one of the following
conditions exists:

a. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing building area,
and the resulting building area exceeds 5,000 square feet
(465 m2) as defined in Section 202; or

b. When an addition exceeds 2,000 square feet and the resulting
building area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

C. An additional story is added above the second floor
regardless of fire areas or allowable area.

Exception: Additions to Group R-3 occupancies shall comply with
Section 903.2.8 (2).

1447666.1 Page 88 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 17

Section 903.2.8, Group R, is amended to read as follows:

1447666.1

Section 903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance
with Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire
area as follows:

New Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all new
buildings.

Existing R-3 Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout
when one of the following conditions exists:

a. When an addition is 50% or more of the existing building area as
defined in Section 202, and greater than 1000 square feet within a
two year period; or,

b. An addition when the existing building is already provided with
automatic sprinklers; or,

C. When an existing Group R Occupancy is being substantially
renovated, and where the scope of the renovation is such that the
Building Code Official determines that the complexity of installing a
sprinkler system would be similar as in a new building.

Exceptions:

1. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to Group R-3.1
occupancies and not housing bedridden clients, not housing non-
ambulatory clients above the first floor, and not housing clients above
the second floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to Group R-3.1
occupancies housing only one bedridden client and complying with
Section 435.8.3.3 of the California Building Code.

3. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13113, occupancies
housing ambulatory children only, none of whom are mentally ill
children or children with intellectual disabilities, and the buildings or
portions thereof in which such children are housed are not more than
two stories in height, and building or portions thereof housing such
children have an automatic fire alarm system activated by approved
smoke detectors.

4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13143.6, occupancies
licensed for protective social care which house ambulatory clients
only, none of whom is a child (under the age of 18 years), or who is
elderly (65 years of age or over).

Page 89 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 18

When not used in accordance with Section 504.2 or 506.3 of the California
Building Code, an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.2 shall be allowed in Group R-2.1 occupancies.

An automatic sprinkler system designed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.3 shall not be utilized in Group R-2.1 or R-4 occupancies.

Section 903.3.5.3, Hydraulically calculated systems, is added to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of hydraulically
calculated fire sprinkler systems shall not exceed 90% of the water supply
capacity.

Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi, and when required by
the fire code official, the fire sprinkler system shall not exceed the water
supply capacity specified by Table 903.3.5.3.

TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems

Design %
75—

80—

85—

%0 I R N
100 110 120 130 140 150 PSI

Chapter 10
Means of Egress

Chapter 10, Means of Egress, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 11
Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings

Chapter 11 Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings. Only those sections
and subsections are adopted as listed below:

1103.7
1103.7.3

1447666.1 Page 90 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 19

1103.7.3.1

1103.7.8 - 1103.7.8.2
1103.7.9 - 1103.7.9.10
1103.8 - 1103.8.5.3
1103.9.1

1107

1113

1114

1115

1116

Chapter 12
Energy Systems

Chapter 12, Energy Systems, is adopted in its entirety with the following amendment:
Section 1201.1.1, Other systems, is added to read as follows:
1201.1.1 Other systems. Where required by the fire code official, other systems
and operations including but not limited to battery systems assembly, battery
reconditioning and storage, research and development of battery storage systems,
electric vehicle manufacturing and testing, and battery charging systems for cars
and carts inside of buildings or structures, shall comply with this chapter.

Exception: When approved by the fire code official, charging stations for electric
vehicles located in open parking garages of Type | or |l construction.

Chapter 20
Aviation Facilities

Chapter 20, Aviation Facilities, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 21
Dry Cleaning

Chapter 21, Dry Cleaning, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 22
Combustible Dust-Producing Operations

Chapter 22, Combustible Dust-Producing Operations, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

1447666.1 Page 91 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 20

Chapter 23
Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages

Chapter 23, Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages, is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 24
Flammable Finishes

Chapter 24, Flammable Finishes, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 25
Fruit and Crop Ripening

Chapter 25, Fruit and Crop Ripening, is deleted in its entirety.

Chapter 26
Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging

Chapter 26, Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging, is deleted in its entirety.

Chapter 27
Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities

Chapter 27, Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 28
Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial, Solid Biomass and Woodworking Facilities

Chapter 28, Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial, Solid Biomass and Woodworking
Facilities, is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

Section 2801.2, Permit, is amended to read as follows:

2801.2 Permit. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.6 and
105.6.29.

Section 2808.2, Storage site, is amended to read as follows:
2808.2 Storage site. Storage sites shall be level and on solid ground, elevated
soil lifts or other all-weather surface. Sites shall be thoroughly cleaned and

approval obtained from the fire code official before transferring wood products to
the site.

1447666.1 Page 92 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 21

Section 2808.3, Size of piles, is amended to read as follows:

2808.3 Size of piles. Piles shall not exceed 15 feet in height, 50 feet in width and
100 feet in length.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow the pile size to be increased
where a fire protection plan is provided for approval that includes, but is not limited
to, the following:

1. Storage yard areas and materials-handling equipment selection, design and
arrangement shall be based upon sound fire prevention and protection
principles.

2. Factor that lead to spontaneous heating shall be identified in the plan, and

control of the various factors shall be identified and implemented, including
provisions for monitoring the internal condition of the pile.

3. The plan shall include means for early fire detection and reporting to the
public fire department; and facilities needed by the fire department for fire
extinguishment including a water supply and fire hydrants.

4. Fire apparatus access roads around the piles and access roads to the top
of the piles shall be established, identified and maintained.
5. Regular yard inspections by trained personnel shall be included as part of

an effective fire prevention maintenance program.

Additional fire protection called for in the plan shall be provided and shall be
installed in accordance with this code. The increase of the pile size shall be based
upon the capabilities of the installed fire protection system and features.

Section 2808.4, Pile separation, is amended to read as follows:

2808.4. Pile separation. Piles shall be separated from adjacent piles by minimum
distance of 20 feet. Additionally, piles shall have a minimum separation of 100 feet
from combustible vegetation.

Section 2808.7, Pile fire protection, is amended to read as follows:

2808.7 Pile fire protection. Automatic sprinkler protection shall be provided in
conveyor tunnels and combustible enclosures that pass under a pile. Combustible
conveyor systems and enclosed conveyor systems shall be equipped with an
approved automatic sprinkler system. Oscillating sprinklers with a sufficient
projectile reach are required to maintain a 40% to 60% moisture content and wet
down burning/smoldering areas.

Section 2808.9, Material-handling equipment, is amended to read as follows:

2808.9 Material-handling equipment. All material-handling equipment operated
by an internal combustion engine shall be provided and maintained with an

1447666.1 Page 93 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 22

approved spark arrester. Approved material-handling equipment shall be available
for moving wood chips, hogged material, wood fines and raw product during fire-
fighting operations.

Section 2808.11, Temperature control, is added to read as follows:

2808.11 Temperature control. The temperature shall be monitored and
maintained as specified in Sections 2808.11.1 and 2808.11.2.

Section 2808.11.1, Pile temperature control, is added to read as follows:

2808.11.1 Pile temperature control. Piles shall be rotated when internal
temperature readings are in excess of 165 degrees Fahrenheit.

Section 2808.11.2, New material temperature control, is added to read as follows:

2808.11.2 New material temperature control. New loads delivered to the facility
shall be inspected and tested at the facility entry prior to taking delivery. Material
with temperature exceeding 165 degrees Fahrenheit shall not be accepted on the
site. New loads shall comply with the requirements of this chapter and be
monitored to verify that the temperature remains stable.

Section 2808.12, Water availability, is added to read as follows:

2808.12 Water availability. Facilities with over 2500 cubic feet shall provide a
water supply. The minimum fire flow shall be no less than 500 GPM @ 20 psi for
a minimum of 1 hour duration for pile heights up to 6 feet and 2 hour duration for
pile heights over 6 feet. If there is no water purveyor, an alternate water supply
with storage tank(s) shall be provided for fire suppression. The water supply
tank(s) shall provide a minimum capacity of 2500 gallons per pile (maximum
30,000 gallons) for piles not exceeding 6 feet in height and 5000 gallons per pile
(maximum 60,000) for piles exceeding 6 feet in height. Water tank(s) shall not be
used for any other purpose unless the required fire flow is left in reserve within the
tank at all times. An approved method shall be provided to maintain the required
amount of water within the tank(s).

Section 2808.13, Tipping area, is added to read as follows:
2808.13 Tipping area. Tipping areas shall comply with the following:
1. Tipping areas shall not exceed a maximum area of 50 feet by 50 feet.

2. Material within a tipping area shall not exceed 5 feet in height at any time.

1447666.1 Page 94 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.

Page 23
3. Tipping areas shall be separated from all piles by a 20 foot wide fire access
lane.
4. A fire hydrant or approved fire water supply outlet shall be located within
150 feet of all points along the perimeter of the tipping area.
5. All material within a tipping area shall be processed within 5 days of receipt.

Section 2808.14, Emergency Contact, is added to read as follows:

2808.14 Emergency Contact. The contact information of a responsible person or
persons shall be provided to the Fire Department and shall be posted at the
entrance to the facility for responding units. The responsible party should be
available to respond to the business in emergency situation.

Chapter 29
Manufacture of Organic Coatings

Chapter 29, Manufacture of Organic Coatings, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 30
Industrial Ovens

Chapter 30, Industrial Ovens, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 31
Tents, Temporary Special Event Structures and Other Membrane Structures

Chapter 31, Tents, Temporary Special Event Structures and Other Membrane
Structures, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 32
High-Piled Combustible Storage

Chapter 32, High-Piled Combustible Storage, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 33
Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition

Chapter 33, Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition, is adopted in its entirety
without amendments.

1447666.1 Page 95 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 24

Chapter 34
Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage

Chapter 34, Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 35
Welding and Other Hot Work

Chapter 35, Welding and Other Hot Work, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 36
Marinas

Chapter 36, Marinas, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 37
Combustible Fibers

Chapter 37, Combustible Fibers, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 39
Processing and Extraction Facilities

Chapter 39, Processing and Extraction Facilities, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 48
Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages, Approved
Production Facilities and Production Locations

Chapter 48, Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages, Approved
Production Facilities and Production Locations, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 49
Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas

Chapter 49, Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas, is adopted in its
entirety with the following amendments:

1447666.1 Page 96 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 25

Section 4906.3, Requirements, is amended to read as follows:

4906.3 Requirements. Hazardous vegetation and fuels around all applicable

buildings and structure shall be maintained in accordance with the following laws

and regulations:

1. Public Resources Code, Section 4291.

2. California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Division 1.5, Chapter 7,
Subchapter 3, Section 1299 (see guidance for implementation “General
Guideline to Create Defensible Space”).

3. California Government Code, Section 51182.

4. California Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1, Chapter 7, Subchapter
1, Section 3.07.

5. OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation Management Guideline — Technical
Design for New Construction Fuel Modification Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

Section 4908, Fuel modification requirements for new Construction, is added to read
as follows:

4908 Fuel modification requirements for new construction. All new buildings
to be built or installed in a Wildfire Risk Area shall comply with the following:

1. Preliminary fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and approved by
the fire code official prior to or concurrently with the approval of any tentative
map.

2. Final fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and approved by the fire

code official prior to the issuance of a grading permit.

3. The fuel modification plans shall meet the criteria set forth in the Fuel
Modification Section of OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation Management
Guideline — Technical Design for New Construction Fuel Modification Plans
and Maintenance Program.”

a. The fuel modification plan shall include provisions for the
maintenance of the fuel modification in perpetuity.

4. The fuel modification plan may be altered if conditions change. Any

alterations to the fuel modification areas shall have prior approval from the
fire code official.

1447666.1 Page 97 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 26

5. All elements of the fuel modification plan shall be maintained in accordance
with the approved plan and are subject to the enforcement process outlined
in the Fire Code.

Chapter 50
Hazardous Materials — General Provisions

Chapter 50, Hazardous Materials — General Provisions, is adopted in its entirety with
the following amendments.

Section 5001.5.2, Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS), is amended to
read as follows:

5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS). Where required by
the fire code official, an application for a permit shall include. Orange County Fire
Authority’s Chemical Classification Packet, which shall be completed and
approved prior to approval of plans, and/or the storage, use or handling of
chemicals on the premises. The Chemical Classification Packet shall include the
following information:

Product Name.

Component.

Chemical Abstract Service (CAS) number.
Location where stored or used.

Container size.

Hazard classification.

Amount in storage.

Amount in use-closed systems.

Amount in use-open systems.

©CoNoOORrWN =

Section 5003.1.1.1, Extremely Hazardous Substances, is added to read as follows:
5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances. No person shall use or store any
amount of extremely hazardous substances (EHS) in excess of the disclosable
amounts (see Health and Safety Code Section 25500 et al) in a residential zoned
or any residentially developed property.

Chapter 51
Aerosols

Chapter 51, Aerosols, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

1447666.1 Page 98 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 27

Chapter 53
Compressed Gases

Chapter 53, Compressed Gases, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 54
Corrosive Materials

Chapter 54, Corrosive Materials, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 55
Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 55, Cryogenic Fluids, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 56
Explosives and Fireworks

Chapter 56, Explosives and Fireworks, is adopted in its entirety with the following
amendments:

Section 5608.2 Firing is hereby added to read as follows:

5608.2 Firing. All fireworks displays, regardless of mortar, device, or shell size,
shall be electrically fired.

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit is added to read as follows:

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit. A diagram of the grounds on which the
display is to be held showing the point at which the fireworks are to be discharged,
the fallout area based on 100 feet per inch of shell size, the location of all buildings,
roads, and other means of transportation, the lines behind which the audience will
be restrained, the location of all nearby trees, telegraph or telephone line, or other
overhead obstructions shall be provided to OCFA.

Chapter 57
Flammable and Combustible Liquids

Chapter 57, Flammable and Combustible Liquids, is adopted in its entirety with the
exception of Section 5707, with the following amendment:

Section 5707 On-Demand Mobile Fueling Operations is deleted without replacement.

1447666.1 Page 99 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 28

Section 5701.1.1 Mobile fueling is added as follows:

Section 5701.1.1 Mobile fueling. On-demand mobile fueling of Class I, Il, and IlI
liquids into the fuel tanks of vehicles is prohibited.

Chapter 58
Flammable Gases and Flammable Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 58, Flammable Gases and Flammable Cryogenic Fluids, is adopted in its
entirety with the exception of Section 5809 and with the following amendment:

Section 5801.1, Scope, is amended to read as follows:

Section 5801.1 Scope. The storage and use of flammable gases and flammable
cryogenic fluids shall be in accordance with this chapter, NFPA 2 and NFPA 55.
Compressed gases shall also comply with Chapter 53 and cryogenic fluids shall
also comply with Chapter 55. Flammable cryogenic fluids shall comply with
Section 5806. Hydrogen motor fuel-dispensing stations and repair garages and
their associated above-ground hydrogen storage systems shall also be designed,
constructed and maintained in accordance with Chapter 23. Mobile fueling of
gaseous and liquid hydrogen, compressed natural gas (CNG), and liquefied
natural gas (LNG) into the fuel tanks of vehicles is prohibited.

Exceptions:

1. Gases used as refrigerants in refrigeration systems (see Section 605).

2. Liquefied petroleum gases and natural gases regulated by Chapter 61.

3. Fuel-gas systems and appliances regulated under the California

Mechanical Code and the California Plumbing Code other than gaseous
hydrogen systems and appliances.

Pyrophoric gases in accordance with Chapter 64.

Section 5809 Mobile Gaseous Fueling of Hyrdrogen-Fueled Vehicles is
deleted without replacement.

o~

Chapter 59
Flammable Solids

Chapter 59, Flammable Solids, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 60
Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials

Chapter 60, Highly Toxic and Toxic Materials, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

1447666.1 Page 100 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 29

Chapter 61
Liquefied Petroleum Gases

Chapter 61, Liquefied Petroleum Gases, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 62
Organic Peroxides

Chapter 62, Organic Peroxides, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 63
Oxidizer, Oxidizing Gases, and Oxidizing Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 63, Oxidizer, Oxidizing Gases, and Oxidizing Cryogenic Fluids, is adopted in
its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 64
Pyrophoric Materials

Chapter 64, Pyrophoric Materials, is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 65
Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics

Chapter 65, Pyroxylin (Cellulose Nitrate) Plastics, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 66
Unstable (Reactive) Materials

Chapter 66, Unstable (Reactive) Materials, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 67
Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids

Chapter 67, Water-Reactive Solids and Liquids, is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 80
Referenced Standards

Chapter 80, Referenced Standards, is adopted in its entirety with the following
amendments:

1447666.1 Page 101 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 30

NFPA 13, 2016 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, is
amended as follows:

Section 6.7.3 is amended to read as follows:

6.7.3 Fire department connections (FDC) shall be of an approved type. The
location shall be approved and be no more than 150 feet from a public hydrant.
The FDC may be located within 150 feet of a private fire hydrant when approved
by the fire code official. The size of piping and the number of 272" inlets shall be
approved by the fire code official. If acceptable to the water authority, it may be
installed on the backflow assembly. Fire department inlet connections shall be
painted OSHA safety red or as approved. When the fire sprinkler density design
requires more than 500 gpm (including inside hose stream demand), or a
standpipe system is included, four 27%” inlets shall be provided.

Section 8.3.3.1 is amended to read as follows:
8.3.3.1 When fire sprinkler systems are installed in shell buildings of undetermined
use (Spec Buildings) other than warehouses (S occupancies), fire sprinklers of the
quick-response type shall be used. Use is considered undetermined if a specific
tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the fire sprinkler plan is submitted.
Sprinklers in light hazard occupancies shall be one of the following:
(1)  Quick-response type as defined in 3.6.4.8
(2) Residential sprinklers in accordance with the requirements of 8.4.5
(3)  Quick response CMSA sprinklers
(4) ESFR sprinklers

(5)  Standard-response sprinklers used for modifications or additions to existing
light hazard systems equipped with standard-response sprinklers

(6) Standard-response sprinklers used where individual standard-response
sprinklers are replaced in existing light hazard systems

Section 8.15.1.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

8.15.1.2.7 Concealed spaces filled with noncombustible insulation shall not require
sprinkler protection when approved by the fire code official.

1447666.1 Page 102 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 31

Section 11.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

11.1.1.1 When fire sprinkler systems are required in buildings of undetermined use
other than warehouses, they shall be designed and installed to have a fire sprinkler
density of not less than that required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2 use, with no
reduction(s) in density or design area. Warehouse fire sprinkler systems shall be
designed to Figure 16.2.1.3.2 (d) curve “G”. Use is considered undetermined if a
specific tenant/occupant is not identified at the time the sprinkler plan is submitted.
Where a subsequent use or occupancy requires a system with greater capability,
it shall be the responsibility of the occupant to upgrade the system to the required
density for the new use or occupancy.

Section 11.2.3.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:

11.2.3.1.1.1 The available water supply for fire sprinkler system design shall be
determined by one of the following methods, as approved by the fire code official:

1) Subtract the project site elevation from the low water level for the
appropriate pressure zone and multiply the result by 0.433;

2) Use a maximum of 40 psi, if available;
3) Utilize the OCFA water-flow test form/directions to document a flow test
conducted by the local water agency or an approved third party licensed in

the State of California.

NFPA 13D 2016 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-
and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes is amended as follows:

Section 7.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

7.1.2 The sprinkler system piping shall not have separate control valves installed
unless supervised by a central station, proprietary, or remote station alarm service.

NFPA 14, 2013 Edition, Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems is amended as
follows:

Section 7.3.1.1 is amended to read as follows:
7.3.1.1 Class | and Ill Standpipe hose connections shall be unobstructed and shall
be located not less than 18 inches or more than 24 inches above the finished floor.

Class Il Standpipe hose connections shall be unobstructed and shall be located
not less than 3 feet or more than 5 feet above the finished floor.

1447666.1 Page 103 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 32

NFPA 24, 2016 Edition, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains
and Their Appurtenances is amended as follows:

Section 6.2.8.1 is added to read as follows:

6.2.8.1 All indicating valves controlling fire suppression water supplies shall be
painted OSHA red.

Exceptions:

1. Brass or bronze valves on sprinkler risers mounted to the exterior of the
building may be left unpainted.

2. Where OS&Y valves on the detector check assembly are the only control

valves, at least one OS&Y valve shall be painted red.
Section 6.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

6.2.9 All connections to private fire service mains for fire protection systems shall
be arranged in accordance with one of the following so that they can be isolated:

(1) A postindicator valve installed not less than 40 ft (12 m) from the building
(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a post indicator valve shall
be permitted to be installed closer than 40 ft (12 m) but at least as far from
the building as the height of the wall facing the post indicator valve.

(2) A wall post indicator valve

(3) Anindicating valve in a pit, installed in accordance with Section 6.4

(4) A backflow preventer with at least one indicating valve not less than 40 ft
(12 m) from the building

(a) For buildings less than 40 ft (12 m) in height, a backflow preventer with
at least one indicating valve shall be permitted to be installed closer than 40
ft (12 m) but at least as far from the building as the height of the wall facing
the backflow preventer.
(5)  Control valves installed in a fire-rated room accessible from the exterior
(6)  Control valves in a fire-rated stair enclosure accessible from the exterior

Section 10.1.5 is added to read as follows:

10.1.5 All ferrous pipe and joints shall be polyethylene encased per AWWA C150,
Method A, B, or C. All fittings shall be protected with a loose 8-mil polyethylene

1447666.1 Page 104 of 117



Garden Grove City Council

Ordinance No.

Page 33
tube or sheet. The ends of the tube or sheet shall extend past the joint by a
minimum of 12 inches and be sealed with 2 inch wide tape approved for
underground use. Galvanizing does not meet the requirements of this section.
Exception: 304 or 316 Stainless Steel pipe and fittings

Section 10.4.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

10.4.1.1 All bolted joint accessories shall be cleaned and thoroughly coated with
asphalt or other corrosion-retarding material after installation.

Exception: Bolted joint accessories made from 304 or 316 stainless steel.
Section 10.4.1.1.1 is added to read as follows:
10.4.1.1.1 All bolts used in pipe-joint assembly shall be 316 stainless steel.
Section 10.4.3.2 is hereby deleted and replaced as follows:
10.4.3.2 Where fire service mains enter the building adjacent to the foundation, the
pipe may run under a building to a maximum of 204 inches, as measured from the
interior face of the exterior wall to the center of the vertical pipe. The pipe under
the building or building foundation shall be 304 or 316 stainless steel and shall not
contain mechanical joints or it shall comply with 10.4.3.2.1 through 10.4.3.2.4.
Appendices
Appendix B is adopted in its entirety with amendments outlined in Guideline B-09.
Appendices BB, C, and CC are adopted in their entirety without amendments.
SECTION 7: Findings. Pursuant to the provisions of the California Health & Safety Code
Section 17958.7, it is determined that the amendments of building standards within the
California Building Standards Code in this Ordinance are reasonably necessary because
of local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions, and as more specifically
described below.
A. FINDINGS.
I. Climatic Conditions
A. Garden Grove is located in a semi-arid Mediterranean type climate. It
annually experiences extended periods of high temperatures with little or no

precipitation. Hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds, which may reach speeds of 70
M.P.H. or greater, are also common to the area. These climatic conditions

1447666.1 Page 105 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 34

cause extreme drying of vegetation and common building materials.
Frequent periods of drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This
predisposes the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition
to directly damaging or destroying buildings, these fires are also prone to
disrupt utility services. Obstacles generated by a strong wind, such as fallen
trees, street lights and utility poles will greatly impact the response time to
reach an incident scene.

B. The climate alternates between extended periods of drought and brief
flooding conditions. Flood conditions may affect the Orange County Fire
Authority’s ability to respond to a fire or emergency condition. Floods may
also disrupt utility services to buildings and facilities within the City.

C. Garden Grove is in a suburban area which is fully developed. Water
demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity supplied by
natural precipitation; and although the population continues to grow, the
already-taxed water supply does not. California is projected to increase in
population by nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century with 50
percent of that growth centered in Southern California. Due to storage
capacities and consumption, and a limited amount of rainfall future water
allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for additional
and on-site fire protection features.

D. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread of
even small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. These
fires spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire
protection. The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire
protection features will supplement normal fire department response by
providing immediate protection for the building occupants and by containing
and controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems
will also reduce the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 to 75
percent.

E. The local water supply is “hard” and contains high amounts of minerals
which can negatively affect the plumbing used fro supply and drain lines in
buildings.

F. Untreated wood roofs cause or contribute to serious fire hazard and to the
rapid spread of fires when such fires are accompanied by high winds.
Pieces of burning wooden roofs become flying brands and are carried by
the wind to other locations and thereby spread fire quickly.

1447666.1 Page 106 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.
Page 35

Il. Topographical conditions

A. Traffic and circulation congestion is an artificially created, obstructive
topographical condition, which is common throughout the City.

B. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation that places
fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk and makes it
necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and other
protection measures to protect occupants and property.

lll. Geological Conditions

Garden Grove is located in a highly active seismic area in Orange County. The
Orange County region is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over
and near a vast and complex network of faults that are believed to be capable of
producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size than the 1994 Northridge and
the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes. Earthquake faults run along the northeast and
southwest boundaries of Orange County. The Newport-Inglewood Fault, located
within Orange County was the source of the destructive 1933 Long Beach earthquake
(6.3 magnitude) which took 120 lives and damaged buildings in an area from Laguna
Beach to Marina Del Rey to Whittier. In December 1989, another earthquake occurred
in the jurisdiction of Irvine at an unknown fault line. Regional planning for reoccurrence
of earthquakes is recommended by the state of California, Department of
Conservation.

A. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic flow
and fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively impact any
rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to create obstacles
similar to those indicated under the high wind section above. The October
17, 1989, Santa Cruz earthquake resulted in one maijor fire in the Marina
District (San Francisco). When combined with the 34 other fires locally and
over 500 responses, the department was taxed to its fullest capabilities.
The Marina fire was difficult to contain because mains supplying water to
the district burst during the earthquake. This situation creates the need for
both additional fire protection and automatic on-site fire protection for
building occupants. State Department of Conservation noted in their 1988
report (Planning Scenario on a Major Earthquake on the Newport-
Inglewood Fault Zone, page 59), “unfortunately, barely meeting the
minimum earthquake standards of building codes places a building on the
verge of being legally unsafe.”

B. Road circulation features located throughout the County also make
amendments reasonably necessary. Located through the City are major
roadways, highways and flood control channels that create barriers and
slow response times. Street and storm drain design, accompanied by

1447666.1 Page 107 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No.

Page 36

occasional heavy rainfall, causes roadway flooding and at times may make
an emergency access route impassable.

. Portions of the County near Garden Grove contain active or former oil

production fields. These areas contain a variety of naturally occurring
gasses, liquids and vapors. These compounds present toxicity or
flammability hazards to building occupants. Evaluation of these hazards
and the risks they pose to development is necessary for implementation of
appropriate mitigation.

. The viability of the public water system would be questionable after a major

seismic event. This would leave tall buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled
fires due to a lack of available water and an inability to pump sufficient
quantities of any available water to floors above the 75-foot level.

Due to the topographical conditions of sprawling development separated by
waterways and narrow and congested streets and the expected infrastructure
damage inherent in seismic zones described above, it is prudent to rely on
automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate extended fire department response
time and keep fires manageable with reduced fire flow (water) resources available
for a given structure. Additional fire protection is also justified to match the current
resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the Orange County Fire
Authority.

B. APPLICATION OF FINDINGS TO AMENDMENTS TO CALIFORNIA BUILDING

STANDARDS CODE.

CODE

SECTION TITLE (Clarification) FINDINGS
CBC 105.2 | & [l
CBC 903.2 | & [l
CBC Table I
1505.1
CBC 1505.1.3 I
CRC R902.1 I
CRC 902.1.3 I
CRC 902.2 I
CRC 610.8 | &I
CPC Table | & Il
610.4
CFC 1104 Violation penalties Administrative
CFC 110.4.2 Infraction & Misdemeanor Administrative
CFC 202 General definitions Administrative
CFC 304.1.2 OCFA Vegetation Management I
CFC 305.6 Hazardous conditions | &1l

1447666.1

Page 108 of 117




Garden Grove City Council

Ordinance No.

Page 37
CFC 305.7 Disposal of rubbish | &I
CFC 307.6 Outdoor Fire Places, etc. Administrative
CFC 307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices | &
CFC 307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural | &1
gas or LPG
CFC 307.6.2.1 Where prohibited | &l
CFC 308.1.6.3 Sky lanterns I
CFC 309.2.1 Indoor charging of electric cars Administrative
CFC 321 Fuel modification requirements for new I
construction
CFC 322 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from I
roadways
CFC 323 Unusual circumstances Administrative
CFC 324 Use of equipment I
CFC 324.1 Use of equipment and devices generating heat, I
sparks or open flames
CFC 324.2 Spark arrestors | &I
CFC 407.5 Hazardous material inventory statement | &
CFC 501.1 Scope Administrative
L&
1]
CFC 510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage Administrative
CFC 903.2 Where required (Sprinklers) [, 11& Il
CFC 903.2.8 Group R (Sprinklers) [, 1 &Il
CFC 903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems | &
CFC 1201.1.1.1 | Other systems [, I, I
CFC 2801.2 Permit Administrative
CFC 2808.2 Storage site Administrative
CFC 2808.3 Size of piles
CFC 2808.4 Pile separation
CFC 2808.7 Pile fire protection
CFC 2808.9 Material-handling equipment
CFC 2808.11 Temperature control

CFC 2808.11.1

Pile temperature control

CFC 2808.11.2

New material temperature control

I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
A
I

CFC 2808.12 Water availability for piles
CFC 2808.13 Tipping area
CFC 2808.14 Emergency contact dministrative
CFC 4906.3 Requirements-OCFA Vegetation Management
Guideline
CFC 4908 Fuel modification requirements for new I
construction
CFC 5001.5.2 Hazardous materials inventory statement Administrative

CFC 5003.1.1.1

Extremely hazardous substances

[ &l

1447666.1

Page 109 of 117



Garden Grove City Council

Ordinance No.

Page 38
CFC 5608.2 Firing Administrative
CFC 5608.3 Application for permit Administrative
CFC 5701.1.1 Mobile Fueling | &Il
CFC 5801.1 Scope | &
CFC Chapter 80 | Reference Standards N/A

CFC

2016 NFPA 13 (Sprinkler Systems)

Administrative

n&n

CFC 2016 NFPA 13-D (Single Family Sprinkler | &1
Systems)

CFC 2013 NFPA 14 (Standpipe Systems) Administrative

CFC 2016 NFPA 24 (Underground Water Supply Administrative

Systems) ,
1]

SECTION 8: Filing with the California Building Standards Commission. A copy of this
Ordinance shall be filed with the California Building Standards Commission by the City
Clerk of the City of Garden Grove as required by Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7.

SECTION 9: Severability. If any section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause,
phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid or
unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall
not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City Council hereby
declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each section, subsection,
subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any
one or more section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof
be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 10: The Mayor shall sign and the City Clerk shall certify to the passage and
adoption of this Ordinance and shall cause the same, or the summary thereof, to be
published and posted pursuant to the provisions of law. This Ordinance shall take effect
thirty (30) days after adoption, or January 1, 2020, whichever is later.

1447666.1

Page 110 of 117



Agenda Item - 5.a.

City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: Teresa Pomeroy

Dept.: City Manager Dept.: City Clerk

Subject: Second reading of Ordinance Date: 10/22/2019
No. 2909

Attached is Ordinance No. 2909 for second reading recommended for adoption.

ATTACHMENTS:

Description Upload Date Type File Name
2909_A-025-

Ordinance No. 2909 10/15/2019 Ordinance 2019__MC_9.04_(2nd_reading_10-
22-19).pdf

Page 111 of 117



ORDINANCE NO. 2909

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDEN GROVE
APPROVING AMENDMENT NO. A-025-2019, A ZONING TEXT AMENDMENT TO
SECTION 9.04.060 OF THE GARDEN GROVE MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADD DEFINITIONS
FOR TERMS USED IN EXISTING PORTIONS OF TITLE 9 PERTAINING TO THE FLOOD
HAZARD OVERLAY ZONE TO MEET THE MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS OF THE NATIONAL
FLOOD INSURANCE PROGRAM

CITY ATTORNEY SUMMARY
This Ordinance approves a text amendment to Section 9.04.060 of the
Garden Grove Municipal Code to add five (5) definitions for terms used in the
City’s existing Floodplain Management Regulations in order to satisfy the
requirements of the National Flood Insurance Program. The added
definitions are consistent with the definitions set forth Title 44 of the Code of
Federal Regulations, Section 59.1.

THE CITY OF COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDEN GROVE FINDS AND
DETERMINES AS FOLLOWS:

WHEREAS, the City of Garden Grove is a participant in the National Flood
Insurance Program (NFIP), which allows the owners of properties located within
special flood hazard areas to purchase flood insurance through the NFIP;

WHEREAS, cities who participate in the National Flood Insurance Program
(NFIP) are required to adopt floodplain management regulations in conformance with
the requirements contained in the Code of Federal Regulations for the NFIP, 44 CFR
Parts 59, 60, 65 and 70;

WHEREAS, the City’s Floodplain Management Regulations are currently set forth
in Sections 9.04.06 (Definitions), 9.08.030.040 (Single-Family Residential),
9.12.030.050 (Multiple-Family Residential), 9.16.030.060 (Commercial, Office
Professional, Industrial, and Open Space), and 9.18.180.010 (mixed-use), of the
Garden Grove Municipal Code;

WHEREAS, the California Department of Water Resources has reviewed the
City’s existing Floodplain Management Regulations and has recommended that the
City add definitions for five (5) key terms used in the City’s existing Floodplain
Management Regulations, which are consistent with the definitions of those terms set
forth in Title 44 of the Code of Federal Regulations (44 CFR) section 59.1 in order to
meet the minimum requirements of the National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP);

WHEREAS, in order to ensure that its Floodplain Management Regulations
continue to be consistent with the National Flood Insurance Program regulations, the
City of Garden Grove has initiated Amendment No. A-025-2019, which is a zoning text
amendment to Section 9.04.060 (Definitions) of Chapter 9.04 (General Provisions) of
Title 9 (Land Use Code) of the Garden Grove Municipal Code in order to add definitions

Page 112 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No. 2909
Page 2

for five (5) key terms used in the City’s existing Floodplain Management Regulations,
which definitions correspond to the definitions of these terms set forth in Title 44 of
the Code of Federal Regulations Section 59.1;

WHEREAS, following a public hearing held on September 5, 2019, the Planning
Commission adopted Resolution No. 5964-19 recommending approval of Amendment
No. A-025-2019;

WHEREAS, pursuant to a legal notice, a public hearing regarding the proposed
adoption of this Ordinance was held by the City Council on October 8, 2019, and all
interested persons were given an opportunity to be heard;

WHEREAS, the City Council gave due and careful consideration to the matter;

WHEREAS, the City Council hereby makes the following findings regarding
Amendment No. A-025-2019:

The Amendment is internally consistent with the goals, objectives and elements
of the City’s General Plan;

The Amendment will promote the public interest, health, safety and welfare;
and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the proposed Ordinance is not subject to
California Environmental Quality Act (“CEQA”; Cal. Pub. Resources Code Section
21000 et seq.) pursuant to Section 15061(b)(3) of the State CEQA Guidelines (Cal.
Code of Regs., Title 14, Section 15000 et seq.) because it can be seen with certainty
that there is no possibility that the activity in question may have a significant effect on
the environment.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDEN GROVE DOES
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1: The above recitals are true and correct.

SECTION 2: Amendment No. A-025-2019 is hereby approved pursuant to the
findings set forth herein and the facts and reasons stated in Planning Commission
Resolution No. 5964-19, a copy of which is on file in the Office of the City Clerk, and
which is incorporated herein by reference with the same force and effect as if set forth
in full.

SECTION 3: Subsection C of Section 9.04.060 of Chapter 9.04 of Title 9 of the
Garden Grove Municipal Code is hereby amended to include the following definitions
for “Existing manufactured home park or subdivision”, “Expansion to an existing
manufactured home park or subdivision”, “Historic structure”, “New

Page 113 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No. 2909
Page 3

manufactured home park or subdivision”, and “Substantial damage”:

“Existing manufactured home park or subdivision” means, for floodplain management
purposes, a manufactured home park or subdivision for which the construction of
facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed
(including, at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets, and
either final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads) is completed before the
effective date of a floodplain management regulation adopted by the City of Garden
Grove.

“Expansion to an existing manufactured home park or subdivision” means, for
floodplain management purposes, the preparation of additional sites by the
construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to
be affixed (including the installation of utilities, the construction of streets, and either
final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads).

“Historic structure” means, for floodplain management purposes, any structure that is:
1) Listed individually in the National Register of Historic Places (a listing maintained by
the Department of interior) or preliminarily determined by the Secretary of the
Interior as meeting the requirements for individual listing on the National Register; 2)
Certified or preliminarily determined by the Secretary of the Interior as contributing to
the historical significance of a registered historic district or a district preliminarily
determined by the Secretary to qualify as a registered historic district; 3) Individually
listed on a state inventory of historic places in states with historic preservation
programs which have been approved by the Secretary of Interior; or 4) Individually
listed on a local inventory of historic places in communities with historic preservation
programs that have been certified either by an approved state program as determined
by the Secretary of the Interior or directly by the Secretary of the Interior in states
without approved programs.

“New manufactured home park or subdivision” means, for floodplain management
purposes, a manufactured home park or subdivision for which the construction of
facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed
(including at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets, and
either final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads) is completed on or after the
effective date of a floodplain management regulation adopted by the City of Garden
Grove.

“Substantial damage” means, for floodplain management purposes, damage of any
origin sustained by a structure whereby the cost of restoring the structure to its before
damaged condition would equal or exceed 50 percent of the market value of the
structure before the damage occurred.

SECTION 4: If any section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase,
word, or portion of this Ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid or

Page 114 of 117



Garden Grove City Council
Ordinance No. 2909
Page 4

unconstitutional by the decision of any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision
shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City
Council hereby declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each section,
subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase, word, or portion thereof,
irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, subdivisions,
sentences, clauses, phrases, words or portions thereof be declared invalid or
unconstitutional.

SECTION 5: The Mayor shall sign and the City Clerk shall certify to the passage
and adoption of this Ordinance and shall cause the same, or the summary thereof, to
be published and posted pursuant to the provisions of law and this
Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after adoption.

The foregoing Ordinance was passed by the City Council of the City of Garden
Grove on the day of

ATTEST:

MAYOR

CITY CLERK

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) SS:
CITY OF GARDEN GROVE)

I, TERESA POMEROY, City Clerk of the City of Garden Grove, do hereby certify
that the foregoing Ordinance was introduced for first reading and passed to second
reading on October 8, 2019, with a vote as follows:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS: (7) BRIETIGAM, O’NEILL, NGUYEN T., BUI,
KLOPFENSTEIN, NGUYEN K., JONES
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS: (0) NONE

ABSENT: COUNCIL MEMBERS: (0) NONE

Page 115 of 117



Agenda Item - 6.a.
City of Garden Grove

INTER-DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

To: Scott C. Stiles From: Lisa L. Kim

Dept.: City Manager Dept.: Community and Economic
Development

Subject: Update on Code Enforcement Date: 10/22/2019

activity pertaining to Short-
Term Rentals in the city as
requested by Mayor Pro Tem
Klopfenstein.

OBJECTIVE

To provide an update on Code Enforcement activities related to Short-Term Rentals
(STRs).

BACKGROUND

At the October 8, 2019, City Council meeting, Mayor Pro Tem Klopfenstein requested
an update on Code Enforcement activities on STRs, and potential outsourcing for
enforcement.

DISCUSSION

The City contracts with Host Compliance software to address the ongoing impact
STRs have on the city's residential neighborhoods with positive outcomes and
significant enforcement success. The software assists Code Enforcement staff with
compliance monitoring, enforcement, and complaint processes.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

None.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council:

e Receive and file this report for information.

Page 116 of 117



By: David Dent, Chief Building Official
Building & Safety Division

Page 117 of 117



	Meeting Agenda
	Proclamation Weatherization
	P.O. to John Deere and Co. for one new Public Works Department riding mower
	Authorize the Issuance of a Purchase Order to Logicalis, Inc. to Provide Two (2) F5 Load Balancers Including Support
	Minutes
	Warrants
	Appointments to Administrative Board of Appeals
	Parks, Recreation and Facilities Master Plan Presentation of Final Draft
	Ordinance adopting 2019 California Building Standards Codes with modifications
	Second Reading of Ordinance No. 2909
	Update on Short Term Rentals

